AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1141H CONGRESS
2D SESSION S. 3 1 8 1

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to provide for S corporation
reform, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JuLy 13, 2016
Mr. TooNE (for himself, Mr. CARDIN, and Mr. ROBERTS) introduced the
following bill; which was read twice and referred to the Committee on Finance

A BILL

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to provide

for S corporation reform, and for other purposes.

[E—

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; REFERENCE; TABLE OF CON-

TENTS.

(a) SHORT TITLE.—This Act may be cited as the S

Corporation Modernization Act of 2016,

(b) AMENDMENT OF 1986 CODE.

ixcept as other-

wise expressly provided, whenever in this Act an amend-

NolNe R e N, .~ L OV R \O)

ment or repeal is expressed in terms of an amendment

[Em—
)

to, or repeal of, a section or other provision, the reference



A~ WP

O o0 9 O W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21

2

shall be considered to be made to a section or other provi-
sion of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986.
(¢) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents for
this Act is as follows:
1. Short title; reference; table of contents.
2. Expansion of qualifying beneficiaries of an electing small business trust.
See. 3. Modifications to S corporation passive investment income rules.
4
5

. Expansion of S corporation eligible shareholders to include TRAs.
. Charitable contribution deduction for electing small business trusts.

See. 6. Amortization of S corporation built-in gain amount upon death of share-
holder.

SEC. 2. EXPANSION OF QUALIFYING BENEFICIARIES OF AN
ELECTING SMALL BUSINESS TRUST.
(a) NOo LOOK-THROUGH FOR KELIGIBILITY PUR-

POSES.

Section 1361(¢)(2)(B)(v) is amended by adding
at the end the following new sentence: “This clause shall
not apply for purposes of subsection (b)(1)(C).”

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this section shall take effect on January 1, 2016.

SEC. 3. MODIFICATIONS TO S CORPORATION PASSIVE IN-
VESTMENT INCOME RULES.

(a) INCREASED PERCENTAGE  LimiT.—Section
1375(a)(2) is amended by striking “25 percent” and in-
serting ‘60 percent”.

(b) REPEAL OF EXCESSIVE PASSIVE INCOME AS A
TERMINATION EVENT.—Section 1362(d) is amended by

striking paragraph (3).

(¢) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.

oS 3181 IS



O o0 N N B W =

| \O I \© R \O B NS N O R N e e e e e T e e e e
A W = O O 0NN N N R, WD = O

3

(1) Section 1375(b) is amended by striking

paragraphs (3) and (4) and inserting the following

new paragraph:

FINE

oS 3181 IS

“(3) PASSIVE INVESTMENT INCOME DE-
D.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Except as otherwise
provided in this paragraph, the term ‘passive
investment income’ means gross receipts de-
rived from royalties, rents, dividends, interest,
and annuities.

“(B) EXCEPTION FOR INTEREST ON
NOTES FROM SALES OF INVENTORY.—The term
‘passive investment income’ shall not include in-
terest on any obligation acquired in the ordi-
nary course of the corporation’s trade or busi-
ness from its sale of property described in sec-
tion 1221(a)(1).

“(C) TREATMENT OF CERTAIN LENDING
OR FINANCE COMPANIES.—If the S corporation
meets the requirements of section 542(¢)(6) for
the taxable year, the term ‘passive investment
income’ shall not include gross receipts for the
taxable year which are derived directly from the

active and regular conduct of a lending or fi-



O o0 N N W B W

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NG B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO S e

4

nance business (as defined 1n  section
542(d)(1)).

“(D) TREATMENT OF CERTAIN DIVI-
DENDS.—If an S corporation holds stock in a
C corporation meeting the requirements of sec-
tion 1504(a)(2), the term ‘passive investment
income’ shall not include dividends from such C
corporation to the extent such dividends are at-
tributable to the earnings and profits of such C
corporation derived from the active conduct of
a trade or business.

“(E) EXCEPTION FOR BANKS, ETC.—In
the case of a bank (as defined in section 581)
or a depository institution holding company (as
defined 1n section 3(w)(1) of the Federal De-
posit Insurance Act (12 U.S.C. 1813(w)(1)),
the term ‘passive investment income’ shall not
nclude—

“(1) interest income earned by such
bank or company, or

“(11) dividends on assets required to
be held by such bank or company, includ-
ing stock in the Federal Reserve Bank, the

Federal Home Lioan Bank, or the Federal

Agricultural Mortgage Bank or participa-

oS 3181 IS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

O TN NG I N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO I e

OF CERTAIN ASSETS.

5
tion certificates issued by a Federal Inter-
mediate Credit Bank.

“(F) GROSS RECEIPTS FROM THE SALES

For purposes of this

paragraph—

“(1) CAPITAL ASSETS OTHER THAN
STOCK AND SECURITIES.—In the case of
dispositions of capital assets (other than
stock and securities), gross receipts from
such dispositions shall be taken into ac-
count only to the extent of capital gain net
income therefrom.

“(11) STOCK AND SECURITIES.—In the
case of sales or exchanges of stock or secu-
rities, gross receipts shall be taken into ac-
count only to the extent of the gain there-
from.

“(G) COORDINATION  WITH  SECTION

1374.—The amount of passive investment in-

come shall be determined by not taking into ac-

count any recognized built-in gain or loss of the

S corporation for any taxable year in the rec-

ognition period. Terms used in the preceding

sentence shall have the same respective mean-

ings as when used in section 1374.”.

oS 3181 IS



O o0 N N D Bk W=

|\ I N© TR NG I NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 0 N O B BN~ WD = ©

6

(2)(A) Section 26(b)(2)(J) is amended by strik-
ing <25 percent” and inserting “60 percent’.

(B) Section 1375(b)(1)(A)(i) is amended by
striking ‘25 percent” and inserting “60 percent’.

(C) The heading for section 1375 is amended
by striking 25 PERCENT’ and inserting ‘60 PER-
CENT" .

(D) The item relating to section 1375 in the
table of sections for part III of subchapter S of
chapter 1 is amended by striking “25 percent” and
inserting “60 percent’.

(3) Section 1042(c)(4)(A)(i) is amended by
striking “section 1362(d)(3)(C)” and inserting “‘sec-
tion 1375(b)(3)”".

(4) Section 1362(f)(1)(B) is amended by strik-
ing “paragraph (2) or (3) of subsection (d)” and in-
serting ‘“‘subsection (d)(2)”.

(d) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2015.

SEC. 4. EXPANSION OF S CORPORATION ELIGIBLE SHARE-
HOLDERS TO INCLUDE IRAS.
(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 1361(c¢)(2)(A)(v1) 1s

amended to read as follows:

oS 3181 IS



7

1 “(vi) A trust which constitutes an in-
2 dividual retirement account under section
3 408(a), including one designated as a Roth
4 IRA under section 408A.”.

5 (b) SALE OF STOCK IN IRA RELATING TO S COR-
6 PORATION ELECTION EXEMPT FROM PROHIBITED
7 TRANSACTION RULES.—Section 4975(d)(16) 1s amend-
8 ed—

9 (1) by striking subparagraphs (A) and (B) and
10 by redesignating subparagraphs (C), (D), (E), and
11 (I') as subparagraphs (A), (B), (C) and (D), respec-
12 tively, and

13 (2) by striking “such bank or company’ in sub-
14 paragraph (A) (as so redesignated) and inserting
15 “the issuer of such stock”.

16 (¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
17 this section shall take effect on January 1, 2016.

18 SEC. 5. CHARITABLE CONTRIBUTION DEDUCTION FOR
19 ELECTING SMALL BUSINESS TRUSTS.
20 (a) IN GENERAL.—Section 641(c)(2) is amended by

21 inserting after subparagraph (D) the following new sub-

22 paragraph:

23 “(E)(1) Section 642(c) shall not apply.
24 “(i1) For purposes of section 170(b)(1)(G),
25 adjusted gross income shall be computed in the

oS 3181 IS



O o0 N N W BB W =

O TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS R S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N U N N = = N Re - BN B e ) W ) LR ~S O I NO R e

8

same manner as in the case of an individual,
except that the deductions for costs which are
paid or incurred in connection with the admin-
istration of the trust and which would not have
been incurred if the property were not held in
such trust shall be treated as allowable in arriv-
ing at adjusted gross income.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2015.

SEC. 6. AMORTIZATION OF S CORPORATION BUILT-IN GAIN

AMOUNT UPON DEATH OF SHAREHOLDER.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Part IT of subchapter S of chapter

1 is amended by adding at the end the following:

“SEC. 1369. AMORTIZATION OF BUILT-IN GAIN AMOUNT
UPON DEATH OF SHAREHOLDER.

“(a) IN GENERAL.—A person holding stock in an
electing S corporation the basis of which is determined
under section 1014(a) (hereafter in this section referred
to as the ‘shareholder’) shall be allowed a deduction with
respect to the S corporation built-in gain amount. The
amount of such deduction for any taxable year shall be
determined by amortizing the S corporation built-in gain

amount over the 15-year period beginning with the month

which includes the applicable valuation date.

oS 3181 IS



9

“(b) S CORPORATION BUILT-IN GAIN AMOUNT.—
For purposes of this section, the term ‘S corporation built-

in gain amount’ means the lesser of—

“(1) the excess (if any) of—

“(A) the basis of the stock referred to in
subsection (a) as determined wunder section
1014(a), over

“(B) the adjusted basis of such stock im-
mediately before the death of the decedent, or

“(2) the pro rata share (determined as of the

applicable valuation date) of—

“(A) the aggregate fair market value of all
property held by the S corporation which is of
a character subject to depreciation or amortiza-
tion, over

“(B) the ageregcate adjusted basis of all
such property held by the S corporation as of

such date.

“(¢) ELECTING S CORPORATION.—For purposes of
this section, the term ‘electing S corporation’ means, with
respect to any shareholder, any S corporation which elects
the application of this section with respect to such share-
holder at such time and in such form and manner as the

Secretary may prescribe.

oS 3181 IS



10

1 “(d) APPLICABLE VALUATION DATE.—For purposes
2 of this section, the term ‘applicable valuation date’

3 means—

4 “(1) in the case of a decedent with respect to
5 which the executor of the decedent’s estate elects the
6 application of section 2032, the date 6 months after
7 the decedent’s death, and

8 “(2) in the case of any other decedent, the date
9 of the decedent’s death.

10 “(e) ACCELERATED DEDUCTION IN CASE OF Dis-

11 POSITION OF S CORPORATION PROPERTY.—

12 “(1) IN GENERAL.—If the electing S corpora-
13 tion disposes of any property which was taken into
14 account under subsection (b)(2), then the deduction
15 allowed under subsection (a) with respect to any
16 stock, for the taxable year of the shareholder in
17 which or with which the taxable year of the S cor-
18 poration which includes the date of such disposition
19 ends, shall (except as otherwise provided in this sec-
20 tion) not be less than the lesser of—

21 “(A) the pro rata share of the gain recog-
22 nized on such disposition, or

23 “(B) the amount determined under sub-
24 section (b)(2) by only taking into account such
25 property.

oS 3181 IS



1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

11
“(2) OVERALL ALLOWANCE NOT INCREASED.—
No deduction shall be allowed under subsection (a)
with respect to any stock for any taxable year to the
extent that such deduction (when added to the de-
ductions so allowed for all prior taxable years) ex-
ceeds the S corporation built-in gain amount with
respect to such stock.
“(f) RECHARACTERIZATION OF GGAINS AS ORDINARY
INCOME TO EXTENT OF DEDUCTION.—If—
“(1) stock of an S corporation with respect to
which a deduction was allowed under this section, or
“(2) property which was taken into account
under subsection (b)(2) with respect to such stock,
is disposed of at a gain (determined without regard to
whether or not such gain is recognized and reduced by
any amount of gain which is treated as ordinary income
under any other provision of this subtitle), the amount of
such gain (or the shareholder’s pro rata share of such gain
in the case of property described in paragraph (2)) shall
be treated as gain which is ordinary income (and shall be
recognized notwithstanding any other provision of this
subtitle) to the extent of the excess of the aggregate de-
ductions allowable under this section with respect to such

stock for the taxable year of such disposition and all prior

oS 3181 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG N N T NG I NG R NG B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO S e

12

taxable years over the amounts taken into account under

this subsection for all prior taxable years.

“(2) TERMINATION OF AMORTIZATION.—No deduc-

tion shall be allowed under subsection (a) with respect to
any stock in an electing S corporation with respect to any

period beginning after the earlier of—

“(1) the date on which the corporation’s elec-
tion under section 1362 terminates, or
“(2) the date on which the shareholder trans-

fers such stock to any other person.

“(h) TREATMENT OF CERTAIN TRANSFERS.

“(1) DISTRIBUTIONS FROM ESTATES OR
TRUSTS.—Notwithstanding any other provision of
this section, in the case of a distribution of stock
from an estate or trust to a beneficiary, the bene-
ficiary (and not the estate or trust) shall be treated
as the shareholder to which this section applies with
respect to periods after such distribution. In the
case of a distribution of stock from an estate or
trust to an electing small business trust (as defined
in section 1361(e)), such electing small business
trust shall be treated as a beneficiary for purposes
of the preceding sentence.

“(2) CERTAIN TRANSFERS INVOLVING

SPOUSES.—Notwithstanding any other provision of

oS 3181 IS



13

1 this section, in the case of a transfer described in
2 section 1041, the transferee (and not the transferor)
3 shall be treated as the shareholder to which this sec-
4 tion applies with respect to periods after such trans-
5 fer.

6 “(1) TREATMENT OF INCOME IN RESPECT OF THE
7 DECEDENT.—

8 “(1) ADJUSTMENT TO BUILT-IN GAIN OF PROP-
9 ERTY HELD BY S CORPORATION.—For purposes of
10 subsection (b)(2), the fair market value of any prop-
11 erty taken into account under subparagraph (A)
12 thereof shall be decreased by any amount of income
13 in respect of the decedent with respect to such prop-
14 erty to which section 691 applies. For purposes of
15 subsection (e)(1)(A), the gain recognized on the dis-
16 position of such property shall be reduced by such
17 amount.

18 “(2) ADJUSTMENT TO BASIS OF S CORPORA-
19 TION STOCK.—For adjustment to basis of S corpora-
20 tion stock, see section 1367(b)(4)(B).
21 “(J) REPORTING.—Except as otherwise provided by

22 the Secretary, for purposes of section 6037, the amounts
23 determined under subsections (b)(2), (e)(1), and (f)(2)

24 shall be treated as items of the corporation and the pro

oS 3181 IS



14

1 rata share determined under such subsection shall be fur-

2 mnished to the shareholder under section 6037(b).”.

3 (b) ADJUSTMENT TO BASIS OF STOCK.—
4 (1) IN GENERAL.—Section 1367(a)(2)
5 amended by striking “and” at the end of subpara-
6 eraph (D), by striking the period at the end of sub-
7 paragraph (KE) and inserting ““, and”, and by insert-
8 ing after subparagraph (E) the following new sub-
9 paragraph:
10 “(F) the amount of the sharcholder’s de-
11 duction under section 1369.”.
12 (2) ADJUSTMENT NOT TAKEN INTO ACCOUNT
13 IN DETERMINING TREATMENT OF DISTRIBUTIONS.—
14 Section 1368 is amended—
15 (A) in subsection (d)(1), by inserting
16 “(other than subsection (a)(2)(F¥) thereof)”
17 after “‘section 13677, and
18 (B) 1n subsection (e)(1)(A)—
19 (i) by striking “‘this title and the
20 phrase” and inserting ‘‘this ftitle,
21 phrase”, and
22 (i1) by inserting ““, and no adjustment
23 shall be made under
24 1367(a)(2)(F)” after “section 1367(a)(2)”.

oS 3181 IS



(O8]

94 O W A

15
(¢) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The table of sections
for part II of subchapter S of chapter 1 is amended by

adding at the end the following new item:

“See. 1369. Amortization of built-in gain amount upon death of sharcholder.”.

(d) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to with respect to decedents dying
after the date of the enactment of this Act, in taxable
years ending after such date.

O

oS 3181 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2016-07-21T22:06:39-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




