AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1181TH CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 1 6 1

Mr.

[E—

o N T N \)

To extend Federal Pell Grant eligibility of certain short-term programs.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JANUARY 31, 2023

KAINE (for himself, Mr. BRAUN, Ms. BALDWIN, Mr. BARRASSO, Mr. BEN-
NET, Mr. BLUMENTHAL, Mr. BOOKER, Mrs. CaprTO, Mr. CARDIN, Ms.
CorLniNs, Ms. CorrTEz Masto, Mr. CRAMER, Mr. DAINES, Ms.
DuckworTH, Ms. ERNST, Mrs. FEINSTEIN, Mrs. GILLIBRAND, Ms. HAS-
SAN, Mr. HICKENLOOPER, Mr. HOEVEN, Mrs. HYDE-SMITH, Mr. KELLY,
Mr. KiNG, Ms. KLOBUCHAR, Mr. LUJAN, Mr. MARSHALL, Mr. OSSOFF,
Mr. RuBlo, Mrs. SHAHEEN, Ms. SINEMA, Ms. Smird, Mr. Tiniis, Mr.
TUBERVILLE, Mr. VAN HOLLEN, Mr. WARNER, Mr. WICKER, and Mr.
WYDEN) introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred
to the Committee on Health, Education, Labor, and Pensions

A BILL

To extend Federal Pell Grant eligibility of certain short-

term programs.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Jumpstart Our Busi-
nesses by Supporting Students Act of 2023”7 or the
“JOBS Act of 2023”.



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ TR NO T NS R NG T NG I NS R NS R S e e T e e e T e T
A N B~ WD = O 0O 0NN B WD~ O

2

SEC. 2. EXTENDING FEDERAL PELL GRANT ELIGIBILITY OF

CERTAIN SHORT-TERM PROGRAMS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—

(1) PRIOR TO FAFSA SIMPLIFICATION.—Section

401 of the IHigher Education Act of 1965 (20

U.S.C. 1070a) is amended by inserting after sub-

section (j) the following:

“(k) JoB TRAINING FEDERAL PELL GRANT PRO-

GRAM.—

*S 161 IS

“(1) DEFINITIONS.

In this subsection:

“(A) ELIGIBLE CAREER PATHWAY PRO-

GRAM.—The term ‘eligible career pathway pro-

oram’ means a program that—

“(1) meets the requirements of section
484(d)(2);

“@1) 1s listed on the provider list
under section 122(d) of the Workforce In-
novation and Opportunity Act;

“(i11) 1s part of a career pathway, as
defined in section 3 of that Act; and

“(iv) 1s aligned to a program of study
as defined in section 3 of the Carl D. Per-
kins Career and Technical Education Act
of 2006.

“(B) ELIGIBLE JOB TRAINING PRO-

GRAM.—



O o0 N N Bk W =

[\© TN NG T NG TR NG N NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e T e T
[ B N O N N e = N R - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO I e

*S 161 IS

3

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘eligible

job training program’ means a career and
technical education program at an institu-

tion of higher education that—

“(I) provides not less than 150,
and not more than 600, clock hours of
instructional time over a period of not
less than 8 weeks and not more than
15 weeks;

“(IT) provides training aligned
with the requirements of high-skill,
high-wage, or in-demand industry sec-
tors or occupations in the State or
local area, as determined by an indus-
try or sector partnership;

“(II) is a program of training
services, and provided through an eli-
eible training provider, as described
under section 122(d) of the Workforce
Innovation and Opportunity Act;

“(IV) provides a student, upon
completion of the program, with a rec-
ognized postsecondary credential that
1s recognized by employers in the rel-

evant industry, including credentials



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

*S 161 IS

4
recognized by industry or sector part-
nerships in the relevant industry in
the State or local area where the in-
dustry is located and the job training
program is provided;

“(V) has been determined by the
istitution of higher education (after
validation of that determination by an
industry or sector partnership) to pro-
vide academic content, an amount of
instructional time, and a recognized
postsecondary credential that are suf-
ficient to—

“(aa) meet the hiring re-
quirements of potential employ-
ers; and

“(bb) satisfy any applicable
educational prerequisite require-
ment for professional licensure or
certification, so that the student
who completes the program and
seecks employment qualifies to
take any licensure or certification
examination needed to practice or

find employment in an occupa-



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG N N T NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ N N O N N e = N R - BN B e ) W ) TR ~S O I NO S e

*S 161 IS

5}

tion that the program prepares

students to enter;

“(VI) may include integrated
education and training;

“(VII) may be offered as part of
an eligible career pathway program;

“(VIII) does not exceed by more
than 50 percent the minimum number
of clock hours required for training if
the State has established such a re-
quirement; and

“(IX) shall include institutional
credit articulation for a student en-
rolled in a noneredit job training pro-
oram.

“(11)  APPROVAL BY THE SEC-
RETARY.—In the case of a program that is
seeking to establish eligibility as an eligible
job training program under this subpara-
oraph, the Secretary shall make a deter-
mination about whether the program meets
the requirements of this subparagraph not
more than 60 days after the date on which
such program is submitted for consider-

ation as an eligible job training program.



O o0 N N B W =

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R e e T e T e T - T N
A W N = O VWV 00 NN O B BN~ WD = O

*S 161 IS

6
“(111) ADDITIONAL ASSURANCE.—The
Secretary shall not determine that a pro-
oram 1s an eligible job training program in
accordance with clause (1) unless the Sec-
retary receives a certification from the ap-
propriate State board containing an assur-
ance that the program meets the require-

ments of clause (1).

“(C) INSTITUTION OF HIGHER EDU-
CATION.—The term ‘institution of higher edu-
cation’” means—

“(1) an institution of higher education,
as defined in section 101; or

“(i1) a postsecondary vocational insti-
tution, as defined in section 102(c¢).

“(D) INSTITUTIONAL CREDIT ARTICULA-
TION.—The term ‘institutional credit articula-
tion” means an institution of higher education
provides a student who has completed a non-
credit program with the equivalent academic
credit that may be applied to a subsequent
credit-bearing certificate or degree program
upon enrollment in such program at such insti-

tution.



O o0 N N W kA W =

|\ IR N© TR NG T NS R NS R S e e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV o0 N O B BN~ WD = O

7

“(E) WIOA DEFINITIONS.—The terms ‘in-
dustry or sector partnership’, ‘in-demand indus-
try sector or occupation’, ‘recognized postsec-
ondary credential’, and ‘State board’ have the
meanings given such terms in section 3 of the
Workforece Innovation and Opportunity Act.

“(2) IN GENERAL.—For the award year begin-

ning on July 1, 2023, and each subsequent award

year

, the Secretary shall carry out a program

through which the Secretary shall award Federal

Pell

Grants to students in eligible job training pro-

orams (referred to as a ‘job training Kederal Pell

srant’). Each eligible job training Federal Pell

Grant awarded under this subsection shall have the

same terms and conditions, and be awarded in the

same manner, as other Federal Pell Grants awarded

under subsection (a), except as follows:

*S 161 IS

“(A) A student who is eligible to receive a
job training Federal Pell Grant under this sub-
section is a student who—

“(1)  has mnot yet attained a
postbaccalaureate degree;
“(11) attends an institution of higher

education;



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG N N T NG I NG I NG B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) B~ O TR NO S e

8

“(ii1) 1s enrolled, or accepted for en-
rollment, in an eligible job training pro-
oram at such institution of higher edu-
cation; and

“(iv) meets all other -eligibility re-
quirements for a Federal Pell Grant (ex-
cept with respect to the type of program of
study, as provided in clause (ii1)).
“(B) The amount of a job training Federal

Pell Grant for an eligible student shall be deter-

mined under subsection (b), except that sub-

section (b)(4) shall not apply.

“(3) INCLUSION IN TOTAL ELIGIBILITY PE-
RIOD.—Any period during which a student receives
a job training Federal Pell Grant under this sub-
section shall be included in calculating the student’s
period of eligibility for Federal Pell Grants under
subsection (c¢), and the eligibility requirements re-
carding students who are enrolled in an under-
oraduate program on less than a full-time basis shall
similarly apply to students who are enrolled in an el-
igible job training program at an eligible institution
on less than a full-time basis.”.

(2) AFTER FAFSA SIMPLIFICATION ACT.—Sec-

tion 401 of the Higher Education Act of 1965 (20

*S 161 IS



O o0 N N B W

[\© TN NG I N T NG I NS I NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO I e

9

U.S.C. 1070a), as amended by section 703 of the

FAFSA Simplification Act (title VII of division FF

of Public Law 116-260) and the FAFSA Simplifica-

tion

Act Technical Corrections Act (Public Law

117-103), is further amended by adding at the end

the following:

(((k)

GRAM.—

*S 161 IS

JOoB TRAINING FEDERAL PELL GRANT PRO-

“(1) DEFINITIONS.—In this subsection:

“(A) ELIGIBLE CAREER PATHWAY PRO-
GRAM.—The term ‘eligible career pathway pro-
oram’ means a program that—

“(1) meets the requirements of section
484(d)(2);

“@1) 1s listed on the provider list
under section 122(d) of the Workforce In-
novation and Opportunity Act;

“(i11) is part of a career pathway, as
defined in section 3 of that Act; and

“(iv) 1s aligned to a program of study
as defined in section 3 of the Carl D. Per-
kins Career and Technical Education Act
of 2006.

“(B) ELIGIBLE JOB TRAINING PRO-

GRAM.—



O o0 N N Bk W =

[\© TN NG T NG TR NG N NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e T e T
[ B N O N N e = N R - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO I e

*S 161 IS

10

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘eligible

job training program’ means a career and
technical education program at an institu-

tion of higher education that—

“(I) provides not less than 150,
and not more than 600, clock hours of
instructional time over a period of not
less than 8 weeks and not more than
15 weeks;

“(IT) provides training aligned
with the requirements of high-skill,
high-wage, or in-demand industry sec-
tors or occupations in the State or
local area, as determined by an indus-
try or sector partnership;

“(II) is a program of training
services, and provided through an eli-
eible training provider, as described
under section 122(d) of the Workforce
Innovation and Opportunity Act;

“(IV) provides a student, upon
completion of the program, with a rec-
ognized postsecondary credential that
1s recognized by employers in the rel-

evant industry, including credentials



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

*S 161 IS

11
recognized by industry or sector part-
nerships in the relevant industry in
the State or local area where the in-
dustry is located and the job training
program is provided;

“(V) has been determined by the
istitution of higher education (after
validation of that determination by an
industry or sector partnership) to pro-
vide academic content, an amount of
instructional time, and a recognized
postsecondary credential that are suf-
ficient to—

“(aa) meet the hiring re-
quirements of potential employ-
ers; and

“(bb) satisfy any applicable
educational prerequisite require-
ment for professional licensure or
certification, so that the student
who completes the program and
seecks employment qualifies to
take any licensure or certification
examination needed to practice or

find employment in an occupa-



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG N N T NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ N N O N N e = N R - BN B e ) W ) TR ~S O I NO S e

*S 161 IS

12

tion that the program prepares

students to enter;

“(VI) may include integrated
education and training;

“(VII) may be offered as part of
an eligible career pathway program;

“(VIII) does not exceed by more
than 50 percent the minimum number
of clock hours required for training if
the State has established such a re-
quirement; and

“(IX) shall include institutional
credit articulation for a student en-
rolled in a noneredit job training pro-
oram.

“(11)  APPROVAL BY THE SEC-
RETARY.—In the case of a program that is
seeking to establish eligibility as an eligible
job training program under this subpara-
oraph, the Secretary shall make a deter-
mination about whether the program meets
the requirements of this subparagraph not
more than 60 days after the date on which
such program is submitted for consider-

ation as an eligible job training program.



O o0 N N B W =

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R e e T e T e T - T N
A W N = O VWV 00 NN O B BN~ WD = O

*S 161 IS

13
“(111) ADDITIONAL ASSURANCE.—The
Secretary shall not determine that a pro-
oram 1s an eligible job training program in
accordance with clause (1) unless the Sec-
retary receives a certification from the ap-
propriate State board containing an assur-
ance that the program meets the require-

ments of clause (1).

“(C) INSTITUTION OF HIGHER EDU-
CATION.—The term ‘institution of higher edu-
cation’” means—

“(1) an institution of higher education,
as defined in section 101; or

“(i1) a postsecondary vocational insti-
tution, as defined in section 102(c¢).

“(D) INSTITUTIONAL CREDIT ARTICULA-
TION.—The term ‘institutional credit articula-
tion” means an institution of higher education
provides a student who has completed a non-
credit program with the equivalent academic
credit that may be applied to a subsequent
credit-bearing certificate or degree program
upon enrollment in such program at such insti-

tution.



O o0 N N W kA W =

|\ IR N© TR NG T NS R NS R S e e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV o0 N O B BN~ WD = O

14

“(E) WIOA DEFINITIONS.—The terms ‘in-
dustry or sector partnership’, ‘in-demand indus-
try sector or occupation’, ‘recognized postsec-
ondary credential’, and ‘State board’ have the
meanings given such terms in section 3 of the
Workforece Innovation and Opportunity Act.

“(2) IN GENERAL.—For the award year begin-

ning on July 1, 2023, and each subsequent award

year

, the Secretary shall carry out a program

through which the Secretary shall award Federal

Pell

Grants to students in eligible job training pro-

orams (referred to as a ‘job training Kederal Pell

srant’). Each eligible job training Federal Pell

Grant awarded under this subsection shall have the

same terms and conditions, and be awarded in the

same manner, as other Federal Pell Grants awarded

under subsection (b), except as follows:

*S 161 IS

“(A) A student who is eligible to receive a
job training Federal Pell Grant under this sub-
section is a student who—

“(1)  has mnot yet attained a
postbaccalaureate degree;
“(11) attends an institution of higher

education;



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N Re - BN B e ) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

15

“(i11) 1s enrolled, or accepted for en-
rollment, in an eligible job training pro-
oram at such institution of higher edu-
cation; and

“(iv) meets all other -eligibility re-
quirements for a Federal Pell Grant (ex-
cept with respect to the type of program of
study, as provided in clause (ii1)).
“(B) The amount of a job training Federal

Pell Grant for an eligible student shall be deter-

mined under subsection (b), except that not-

withstanding subsection (b)(1)(B) a student
who is eligible for less than the minimum Fed-
eral Pell Grant for an academic year in which
the student i1s enrolled in an eligible program
full time may still be eligible for a Federal Pell

Grant.

“(3) INCLUSION IN TOTAL ELIGIBILITY PE-
RIOD.—Any period during which a student receives
a job training Federal Pell Grant under this sub-
section shall be included in calculating the student’s
period of eligibility for Federal Pell Grants under
subsection (d), and the eligibility requirements re-
carding students who are enrolled in an under-

eraduate program on less than a full-time basis shall

*S 161 IS



O o0 N N W BB W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
L A W NN = DO O XN R WD~ O

BLE JOB TRAINING PROGRAMS.

Higher Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 1099b(a)(4))

16

similarly apply to students who are enrolled in an el-
igible job training program at an eligible institution
on less than a full-time basis.”.

(3) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made
by paragraph (2) shall take effect as if included in
section 703 of the FAFSA Simplification Act (title
VII of division FF of Public Law 116-260), as
amended by the FAFSA Simplification Act Tech-
nical Corrections Act (Public Law 117-103), and
subject to the effective date of section 701(b) of
such Act.

(b) ACCREDITING AGENCY RECOGNITION OF KLIGI-

Section 496(a)(4) of the

1s amended—

(1) in subparagraph (A), by striking “and”
after the semicolon;

(2) in subparagraph (B)(ii), by inserting “and”
after the semicolon; and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

“(C) if such agency or association has or
seeks to include within its scope of recognition
the evaluation of the quality of institutions of
higher education participating in the job train-

ing Federal Pell Grant program under section

*S 161 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

*S 161 IS

17

401(k), such agency or association shall, in ad-
dition to meeting the other requirements of this
subpart, demonstrate to the Secretary that,
with respect to such eligible job training pro-
orams (as defined in that subsection)—

“(1) the agency or association’s stand-
ards include a process for determining if
the institution has the capability to effec-
tively offer an eligible job training pro-
oram; and

“(i1) the agency or association re-
quires a demonstration that the program—

“(I) has identified each recog-
nized postsecondary credential offered
and the corresponding industry or sec-
tor partnership that actively recog-
nizes each credential in the relevant
industry in the State or local area
where the industry is located; and

“(ITI) provides the academic con-
tent and amount of instructional time
that is sufficient to—

“(aa) meet the hiring re-
quirements of potential employ-

ers; and



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ N \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W N = O O 0N N RN = O

24
25

18

“(bb) satisfy any applicable
educational prerequisites for pro-
fessional licensure or certification
requirements so that the student
who completes the program and
secks employment qualifies to
take any licensure or certification
examination that is needed to
practice or find employment in
an occupation that the program
prepares students to enter.”.

(¢) INTERAGENCY DATA SHARING.—The Secretary
of Kducation shall coordinate and enter into a data shar-
ing agreement with the Secretary of Liabor to ensure ac-
cess to data related to indicators of performance collected
under section 116 of the Workforce Innovation and Oppor-
tunity Act (29 U.S.C. 3141). Under such data sharing
agreement, the Commissioner of the National Center for
Education Statistics shall collect and review the contents
of performance reports for eligible providers of training
services described in section 116(d)(4) of that Act not less
frequently than once each year.

(d) MINIMUM FEDERAL PELL GRANT.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 401(b)(4) of the

Higher Education Aect of 1965 (20 U.S.C.

*S 161 IS



1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21

19

1070a(b)(4)) is amended by striking “ten percent”

and inserting ‘5 percent’’.

(2) FAFSA SIMPLIFICATION.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Section 401(a)(2)(F) of
the Higher Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C.
1070a(a)(2)(F)), as amended by section 703 of
the FAFSA Simplification Act (title VII of divi-
sion FF of Public Law 116-260) and the
FAFSA Simplification Act Technical Correc-
tions Act (Public Law 117-103), is further
amended by striking “ten percent” and insert-
ing “5 percent’’.

(B) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment
made by this paragraph shall take effect as if
included in section 703 of the FAFSA Sim-
plification Act (title VII of division F'F of Pub-
lic Law 116-260) and the FAFSA Simplifica-
tion Act Technical Corrections Act (Public Law
117-103), and subject to the effective date of

section 701(b) of such Act.

(e) EFFECTIVE DATE.—Unless otherwise specified,

22 this section, and the amendments made by this section,

23 shall take effect on July 1, 2023.

*S 161 IS

O




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-02-09T22:09:57-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




