AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

118TH CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 1 308

AN ACT

To amend the Indian Self-Determination and Education As-
sistance Act to extend the deadline for the Secretary
of the Interior to promulgate regulations implementing

title IV of that Act, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

2 twes of the Unated States of America in Congress assembled,



1

2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

2
SECTION 1. EXTENSION OF DEADLINE TO PROMULGATE

CERTAIN REGULATIONS.

Section 413(a) of the Indian Self-Determination and
Education Assistance Act (25 U.S.C. 5373(a)) 1s amend-
ed—

(1) in paragraph (2), by striking “21 months”
and inserting ‘38 months”’; and

(2) in paragraph (3), by striking “30 months”
and inserting ‘50 months”.

Passed the Senate July 18, 2023.

Attest:

Secretary.

S 1308 ES






118TH CONGRESS
1ST SESSION ° H MWAV%

AN ACT

To amend the Indian Self-Determination and Edu-
cation Assistance Act to extend the deadline for
the Secretary of the Interior to promulgate regu-
lations implementing title IV of that Act, and for
other purposes.



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-07-19T04:44:41-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




