AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

117TH CONGRESS
L9 H, R. 686

AN ACT

To authorize appropriations for the Coast Guard, and for

other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

2 tiwes of the United States of America in Congress assembled,



wn B~ W

2
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TrrLE.—This Act may be cited as the
“Don Young Coast Guard Authorization Act of 2022,

(b) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents for

this Act is as follows:
See. 1. Short title; table of contents.
TITLE I—AUTHORIZATION

See. 101. Authorization of appropriations.

See. 102, Authorized levels of military strength and training.

See. 103. Shoreside infrastructure and facilities.

See. 104. Availability of amounts for acquisition of additional cutters.

TITLE II—COAST GUARD
Subtitle A—DMilitary Personnel Matters

See. 201. Authorized strength.

See. 202. Continuation of officers with certain critical skills on active duty.

See. 203. Number and distribution of officers on active duty promotion list.

Sec. 204. Coast Guard behavioral health policy.

See. 205. Improving representation of women and of racial and ethnic minori-
ties among Coast Guard active-duty members.

Subtitle B—Operational Matters

Sec. 206. Pilot project for enhancing Coast Guard cutter readiness through
condition-based maintenance.

Sec. 207. Unmanned systems strategy.

See. 208. Budgeting of Coast Guard relating to certain operations.

See. 209. Report on San Diego maritime domain awareness.

See. 210. Great Lakes winter shipping.

Sec. 211. Center of expertise for Great Lakes oil spill search and response.

Sec. 212. Study on laydown of Coast Guard cutters.

Subtitle C—Other Matters

See. 213. Responses of Commandant of the Coast Guard to safety reec-
ommendations.

Sec. 214. Conveyance of Coast Guard vessels for public purposes.

Sec. 215. Acquisition life-cycle cost estimates.

See. 216. National Coast Guard Museum funding plan.

Sec. 217. Report on Coast Guard explosive ordnance disposal.

See. 218. Pribilof Island transition completion actions.

See. 219. Notification of communication outages.

TITLE HOI—MARITIME
Subtitle A—Shipping

See. 301. Nonoperating individual.

*HR 6865 EH



See.
See.

See.
See.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

w w

W W W w

SO O
=

401.
402.
403.
404.
405.
406.
407.
408.
409.
410.
411.
412.
413.
414.
415.
416.
417.
418.

501.
502.

503.
504.

505.
506.
507.
508.
509.
510.
511.
512.
513.

o O
Sl

S
a

()}

3

Oceanographie research vessels.
Atlantic Coast port aceess routes briefing.

Subtitle B—Vessel Safety

Fishing vessel safety.

Requirements for DUKW-type amphibious passenger vessels.
Exoneration and limitation of liability for small passengers vessels.
Automatic identification system recquirements.

Subtitle C

Shipbuilding Program

Qualified vessel.
Establishing a capital construction fund.

TITLE IV—FEDERAL MARITIME COMMISSION

Short title.

Purposes.

Service contracts.

Shipping exchange registry.

Data collection.

National shipper advisory committee.
Annual report and public disclosures.
General prohibitions.

Prohibition on unreasonably declining cargo.
Detention and demurrage.
Assessment of penalties.
Investigations.

Injunctive relief.

Technical amendments.
Authorization of appropriations.
NAS study on supply chain industry.
Temporary emergency authority.
Terms and vacancies.

TITLE V—MISCELLANEOUS
Subtitle A—Navigation

Restriction on changing salvors.

Providing requirements for vessels anchored in established anchorage
grounds.

Aquatic Nuisance Species Task Force.

Limitation on recovery for certain injuries incurred in aquaculture ac-
tivities.

Subtitle B—Other Matters

Information on type approval certificates.

Passenger vessel security and safety requirements.

Cargo waiting time reduction.

Limited indemnity provisions in standby oil spill response contracts.
Port Coordination Council for Point Spencer.

Western Alaska oil spill planning eriteria.

Nonapplicability.

Report on enforcement of coastwise laws.

Land conveyance, Sharpe Army Depot, Lathrop, California.

*HR 6865 EH



S O 0 N N B~ W

—
[E—

See. 514.
See. 515.
See. 516.
See. 517.
See. 518.

4

Center of Expertise for Marine Environmental Response.

Prohibition on entry and operation.

St. Lcie River railroad bridge.

Assistance related to marine mammals.

Manning and crewing requirements for certain vessels, vehicles, and
structures.

TITLE VI—SEXUAL ASSAULT AND SEXUAL HARASSMENT

See. 601.
See. 602.
See. 603.

See. 604.
See. 605.
See. 606.
See. 607.
See. 608.
See. 609.
See. 610.
See. 611.
See. 612.

PREVENTION AND RESPONSE

Definitions.

Convicted sex offender as grounds for denial.

Sexual harassment or sexual assault as grounds for suspension or
revocation.

Accommodation; notices.

Protection against diserimination.

Alcohol prohibition.

Surveillance requirements.

Master key control.

Safety management systems.

Requirement to report sexual assault and harassment.

Civil actions for personal injury or death of seamen.

Administration of sexual assault forensic examination kits.

TITLE VII—TECHNICAL AND CONFORMING PROVISIONS

See. 701,
See. 702.

See. 703.
See. 704.

Technical corrections.

Transportation worker identification credential technical amend-
ments.

Reinstatement.

Determination of budgetary effects.

TITLE I—AUTHORIZATION

SEC. 101. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.

Section 4902 of title 14, United States Code, is

amended—

(1) iIn the matter preceding paragraph (1) by

striking “years 2020 and 20217 and inserting

“years 2022 and 20237;

(2) in paragraph (1)—
(A) in subparagraph (A)—
(1) by striking “$8,151,620,850 for

fiscal  year 2020”7 and  inserting

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

5
“$9,282,360,000 for fiscal year 20227;
and
(i1) by striking “$8,396,169,475 for
fiscal  year 2021”7  and  inserting
“$10,210,596,000 for fiscal year 2023";

(B) in subparagraph (B) by striking

“$17,035,000” and inserting “$17,723,5207;

and

(C) in subparagraph (C) by striking

“$17,376,000” and inserting “$18,077,990"’;

(3) in paragraph (2)—

*HR 6865 EH

(A) in subparagraph (A)—

(1) by striking “$2,794,745,000 for
fiscal  year 2020”7 and  inserting
“$3,312,114,000 for fiscal year 20227,
and

(i1) by striking “$3,312,114,000 for
fiscal  year 2021”7  and  inserting
“$3,477,600,000 for fiscal year 2023;
and
(B) in subparagraph (B)—

(1) by striking “$10,000,000 for fiscal
year 2020 and inserting “$20,400,000 for

fiscal vear 2022”7 and
o )



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I \© R O R O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A W D= O O 0NN N N R WD = O

6
(i1) by striking “$20,000,000 for fis-
cal year 2021”7 and inserting “$20,808,000

for fiscal year 20237,

(4) in paragraph (3)—

(A) by striking “$13,834,000 for fiscal
vear 2020”7 and inserting “$14,393,220 for fis-
cal year 2022”"; and

(B) by striking “$14,111,000 for fiscal
vear 20217 and inserting “$14,681,084 for fis-
cal year 2023”; and
(5) in paragraph (4)—

(A) by striking “$205,107,000 for fiscal
vear 2020”7 and inserting “$213,393,180 for
fiscal year 2022"; and

(B) by striking “$209,209,000 for fiscal
vear 2021”7 and inserting “$217,661,044 for

fiscal year 2023"".

SEC. 102. AUTHORIZED LEVELS OF MILITARY STRENGTH

AND TRAINING.

Section 4904 of title 14, United States Code, is

amended—

(1) in subsection (a) by striking “‘fiscal years

2020 and 20217 and inserting “‘fiscal years 2022
and 2023”; and

*HR 6865 EH



7
(2) in subsection (b) by striking “‘fiscal years

2020 and 20217 and inserting “fiscal years 2022

and 2023”7,

SEC. 103. SHORESIDE INFRASTRUCTURE AND FACILITIES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Of the amounts authorized to be
appropriated under section 4902(2)(A) of title 14, United
States Code, for each of fiscal years 2022 and 2023, up
to $585,000,000 shall be authorized for the Secretary of
the department in which the Coast Guard is operating to
fund the acquisition, construction, rebuilding, or improve-
ment of Coast Guard shoreside infrastructure and facili-
ties necessary to support Coast Guard operations and
readiness.

(b) BALTIMORE COAST GUARD YARD.—Of the
amounts set aside wunder subsection (a), up to
$175,000,000 shall be authorized to improve facilities at
the Coast Guard Yard in Baltimore, Maryland, including
improvements to piers and wharves, dry dock, capital
equipment utilities, or dredging necessary to facilitate ac-
cess to such Yard.

(¢) TRAINING CENTER CAPE MAY.—Of the amounts
set aside under subsection (a), up to $60,000,000 shall
be authorized to fund Phase I, in fiscal year 2022, and

Phase II, in fiscal year 2023, for the recapitalization of

*HR 6865 EH



8

I the barracks at the United States Coast Guard Training
2 Center Cape May in Cape May, New Jersey.

3 (d) MITIGATION OF HAZARD RISKS.—In carrying out
4 projects with funds authorized under this section, the
5 Coast Guard shall mitigate, to the greatest extent prac-
6 ticable, natural hazard risks identified in any Shore Infra-
7 structure Vulnerability Assessment for Phase I related to
8 such projects.

9 (e) Forr WADSWORTIH, NEW YORK.—Of the
10 amounts set aside under subsection (a), up to $1,200,000

11 shall be authorized to fund a construction project to—

12 (1) complete repairs to the United States Coast
13 Guard Station, New York, waterfront, including re-
14 pairs to the concrete pier; and

15 (2) replace floating piers Alpha and Bravo, the
16 South Breakwater and Ice Screen, the North Break-
17 water and Ice Screen, and the seawall.

18 SEC. 104. AVAILABILITY OF AMOUNTS FOR ACQUISITION OF
19 ADDITIONAL CUTTERS.
20 (a) IN GENERAL.—Of the amounts authorized to be

21 appropriated under—

22 (1) section 4902(2)(A)(i) of title 14, United
23 States Code, as amended by section 101 of this title,
24 for fiscal year 2022;

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I O TR NG I NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A LW N = O VWV 00 N O W BN~ W N = ©

4902(2)(A)(i1) of title 14, United States Code

9
(A) $300,000,000 shall be authorized for

the acquisition of a twelfth National Security
Cutter; and

(B) $210,000,000 shall be authorized for
the acquisition of 3 Fast Response Cutters; and
(2) section 4902(2)(A)(i1) of title 14, United

States Code, as amended by section 101 of this title,
for fiscal year 2023;

(A) $300,000,000 shall be authorized for
the acquisition of a twelfth National Security
Cutter; and

(B) $210,000,000 shall be authorized for
the acquisition of 3 Fast Response Cutters.

) ATV ) G ‘ J — 7 cutter
b) TREATMENT OF ACQUIRED CUTTER.—Any cutt

acquired using amounts authorized under subsection (a)
shall be in addition to the National Security Cutters and
Fast Response Cutters approved under the existing acqui-
sition baseline in the program of record for the National

Security Cutter and Fast Response Cutter.

(¢) GREAT LAKES ICEBREAKER ACQUISITION.—Of

the amounts authorized to be appropriated under section

(1) for fiscal year 2022, $350,000,000 shall be

authorized for the acquisition of a Great Liakes ice-

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N B W=

[\ I e e e e e T e e
S OV o0 N O B PR~ WD = O

21
22
23
24
25

10

breaker at least as capable as Coast Guard Cutter
Mackinaw (WLBB-30); and

(2) for fiscal year 2023, $20,000,000 shall be
authorized for the design and selection of
icebreaking cutters for operation in the Great Lakes,
the Northeastern United States, and the Arctic, as
appropriate, that are at least as capable as the

Joast Guard 140-foot icebreaking tugs.

(d) DrRUG AND MIGRANT INTERDICTION.—Of the
Fast Response Cutters authorized for acquisition under
subsection (a), at least 1 shall be used for drug and mi-
erant interdiction in the Caribbean Basin (including the
Gulf of Mexico).

TITLE II—COAST GUARD
Subtitle A—Military Personnel
Matters

SEC. 201. AUTHORIZED STRENGTH.

Section 3702 of title 14, United States Code, is
amended by adding at the end the following:

“(e¢) The Secretary may vary the authorized end
strength of the Coast Guard Selected Reserves for a fiscal
year by a number equal to not more than 3 percent of
such end strength upon a determination by the Secretary
that varying such authorized end strength is in the na-

tional interest.

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N B W =

|\ I O R NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 N O W B~ WD = ©

11

“(d) The Commandant may increase the authorized
end strength of the Coast Guard Selected Reserves by a
number equal to not more than 2 percent of such author-
ized end strength upon a determination by the Com-
mandant that such increase would enhance manning and
readiness in essential units or in critical specialties or rat-
ngs.
SEC. 202. CONTINUATION OF OFFICERS WITH CERTAIN

CRITICAL SKILLS ON ACTIVE DUTY.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Chapter 21 of title 14, United
States Code, is amended by inserting after section 2165
the following:

“§ 2166. Continuation on active duty; Coast Guard of-
ficers with certain critical skills

“(a) IN GENERAL.—The Commandant may authorize
an officer in a grade above grade O-2 to remain on active
duty after the date otherwise provided for the retirement
of such officer in section 2154 of this title, if the officer
possesses a critical skill, or specialty, or is in a career field
designated pursuant to subsection (b).

“(b) CRITICAL SKILLS, SPECIALTY, OR CAREER
FieLbD.—The Commandant shall designate any ecritical
skill, specialty, or career field eligible for continuation on

active duty as provided in subsection (a).

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N D B W=

e T = O =
W NN = O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

12

“(¢) DURATION OF CONTINUATION.—An officer con-
tinued on active duty pursuant to this section shall, if not
earlier retired, be retired on the first day of the month
after the month in which the officer completes 40 years
of active service.

“(d) Poricy.—The Commandant shall carry out this
section by presceribing policy which shall specify the eri-
teria to be used in designating any critical skill, specialty,
or career field for purposes of subsection (b).”.

(b) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The analysis for chap-
ter 21 of title 14, United States Code, is amended by in-
serting after the item relating to section 2165 the fol-
lowing:

“2166. Continuation on active dutV' Coast Guard officers with certain critical
sl

SEC. 203. NUMBER AND DISTRIBUTION OF OFFICERS ON
ACTIVE DUTY PROMOTION LIST.

(a) MaxiMuUM NUMBER OF OFFICERS.—Section

2103(a) of title 14, United States Code, is amended to
read as follows:
“(a) MAXIMUM TOTAL NUMBER.—
“(1) IN GENERAL.—The total number of Coast
Guard commissioned officers on the active duty pro-
motion list, excluding warrant officers, shall not ex-
ceed—

“(A) 7,100 in fiscal year 2022;

*HR 6865 EH



O© o0 3 O WD b W N =

[\O T \© R (O R i e e e e e e e T
N = O 00N N R WD = O

23

13
“(B) 7,200 in fiscal year 2023;
“(C) 7,300 in fiscal year 2024; and
“(D) 7,400 in fiscal year 2025 and each
subsequent fiscal year.

“(2) TEMPORARY INCREASE.—Notwithstanding
paragraph (1), the Commandant may temporarily
increase the total number of commissioned officers
permitted under such paragraph by up to 2 percent
for no more than 60 days following the date of the
commissioning of a Coast Guard Academy class.

“(3) NoOTIFICATION.—Not later than 30 days
after exceeding the total number of commissioned of-
ficers permitted under paragraph (1), and each 30
days thereafter until the total number of commis-
sioned officers no longer exceeds the number of such
officers permitted under paragraph (1), the Com-
mandant shall notify the Committee on Transpor-
tation and Infrastructure of the House of Represent-
atives and the Committee on Commerce, Science,
and Transportation of the Senate of the number of
officers on the active duty promotion list on the last
day of the preceding 30-day period.”.

(b) OFFICERS NOT ON ACTIVE DuTY PROMOTION

24 LisT.—

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16

17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

14

(1) IN GENERAL.—Chapter 51 of title 14,

United States Code, is amended by adding at the

end the following:
“§ 5113. Officers not on active duty promotion list

“Not later than 60 days after the date on which the
President submits to Congress a budget pursuant to sec-
tion 1105 of title 31, the Commandant shall submit to
the Committee on Transportation and Infrastructure of
the House of Representatives and the Committee on Com-
merce, Science, and Transportation of the Senate the
number of Coast Guard officers serving at other Federal
entities on a reimbursable basis but not on the active duty
promotion list.”.

(2) CLERICAL. AMENDMENT.—The analysis for
chapter 51 of title 14, United States Code, is

amended by adding at the end the following:

“5113. Officers not on active duty promotion list.”.
SEC. 204. COAST GUARD BEHAVIORAL HEALTH POLICY.

(a) INTERIM BEHAVIORAL HEALTH PoOLICY.—Not
later than 60 days after the date of enactment of this Act,
the Commandant of the Coast Guard shall establish an
interim behavioral health policy for members of the Coast
Guard equivalent to the policy described in section 5.28
(relating to behavioral health) of Department of Defense
Instruction 6130.03, volume 2, “Medical Standards for
Military Service: Retention”.

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N B W

[\O I \© R \O I O N N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N R, WD = O

24

15

(b) TERMINATION.—The interim policy established

under subsection (a) shall remain in effect until the date
on which the Commandant issues a permanent behavior
health policy for members of the Coast Guard which is,
to the extent practicable, equivalent to such section 5.28.

SEC. 205. IMPROVING REPRESENTATION OF WOMEN AND

OF RACIAL AND ETHNIC MINORITIES AMONG
COAST GUARD ACTIVE-DUTY MEMBERS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 180 days after the

date of enactment of this Act, the Commandant of the

Coast Guard shall—

(1) determine which recommendations in the
RAND representation report can practicably be im-
plemented to promote improved representation in the
Coast Guard of—

(A) women; and
(B) racial and ethnic minorities; and

(2) submit to the Committee on Transportation
and Infrastructure of the House of Representatives
and the Committee on Commerce, Science, and
Transportation of the Senate a report on the actions
the Commandant has taken, or plans to take, to im-
plement such recommendations.

(b) CURRICULUM AND TRAINING.—The Com-

25 mandant shall update, to reflect actions deseribed under

*HR 6865 EH



16

subsection (a)(2), the curriculum and training materials
used at—
(1) officer accession points, including the Coast

Guard Academy and the ILeadership Development

Jenter;

(2) enlisted member accession at the United

States Coast Guard Training Center Cape May in

Jape May, New Jersey; and

(3) the officer, enlisted member, and ecivilian
leadership courses managed by the Leadership De-
velopment Center.

(¢) DEFINITION.—In this section, the term “RAND
representation report’” means the report titled “Improving
the Representation of Women and Racial/Ethni¢c Minori-
ties Among U.S. Coast Guard Active-Duty Members”
issued by the Homeland Security Operational Analysis
Center of the RAND Corporation on August 11, 2021.

Subtitle B—Operational Matters
SEC. 206. PILOT PROJECT FOR ENHANCING COAST GUARD
CUTTER READINESS THROUGH CONDITION-
BASED MAINTENANCE.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 2 years after the
date of enactment of this Act, the Commandant of the
Coast Guard shall conduct a pilot project to enhance cut-

ter readiness and reduce lost patrol days through the de-

*HR 6865 EH



O© 00 3 O WD B W N -

O TN NG TN N T NG I NG R NS B S e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N N N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) LR ~S O T NO S e

17

ployment of commercially developed condition-based pro-
eram standards for cutter maintenance, in accordance

with the criteria set forth in subsection (b).

(b) CRITERIA FOR CONDITION-BASED MAINTENANCE

EvALUATION.—In conducting the pilot project under sub-

section (a), the Commandant shall—

(1) select at least 1 legacy cutter asset and 1
class of cutters under construction with respect to
which the application of the pilot project would en-
hance readiness;

(2) use commercially developed condition-based
program standards similar to those applicable to pri-
vately owned and operated vessels or vessels owned
or operated by other Federal agencies (such as those
currently operating under the direction of Military
Sealift Command);

(3) create and model a full ship digital twin for
the cutters selected under paragraph (1);

(4) install or modify instrumentation capable of
producing full hull, mechanical, and electrical data
necessary to analyze cutter operational conditions
with active maintenance alerts; and

(5) deploy artificial intelligence, prognostic-
based integrated maintenance planning wmodeled

after standards described in paragraph (2).

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N kA W =

O TN NG TN N T NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG O N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO S e

18

(¢) REPORT TO CONGRESS.—The Commandant shall

submit to the Committee on Commerce, Science, and
Transportation of the Senate and the Committee on
Transportation and Infrastructure of the House of Rep-
resentatives—

(1) an interim report not later than 6 months
after the date of enactment of this Act on the
progress in carrying out the pilot project described
in subsection (a); and

(2) a final report not later than 2 years after
the date of enactment of this Act on the results of
the pilot project described in subsection (a) that in-
cludes—

(A) options to integrate commercially de-
veloped condition-based program standards for
cutter maintenance to Coast Guard cutters; and

(B) plans to deploy commercially developed
condition-based program standards for cutter
maintenance to Coast Guard cutters.

SEC. 207. UNMANNED SYSTEMS STRATEGY.

(a) SUBMISSION TO CONGRESS.—Not later than 180
days after the date of enactment of this Act, the Com-
mandant of the Coast Guard shall submit to the Com-
mittee on Transportation and Infrastructure of the House

of Representatives and the Committee on Commerce,

*HR 6865 EH



19

1 Science, and Transportation of the Senate a detailed de-

2 seription of the strategy of the Coast Guard to implement

3 unmanned systems across mission areas, including—

4

O o0 9 O W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

(1) the steps taken to implement actions ree-
ommended in the consensus study report of the Na-
tional Academies of Sciences, Engineering, and Med-
icine published on November 12, 2020, titled
“Leveraging Unmanned Systems for Coast Guard
Missions: A Strategic Imperative”;

(2) the strategic goals and acquisition strategies
for proposed uses and procurements of unmanned
systems;

(3) a strategy to sustain competition and inno-
vation for procurement of unmanned systems and
services for the Coast Guard, including defining op-
portunities for new and existing technologies; and

(4) an estimate of the timeline, costs, staff re-
sources, technology, or other resources necessary to
accomplish the strategy.

(b) PrLoT PROJECT.—

(1) AUTONOMOUS CONTROL AND COMPUTER VI-
SION TECHNOLOGY.—The Commandant of the Coast
Guard, acting through the Blue Technology Center
of Expertise, shall conduct a pilot project to retrofit

an existing Coast Guard small boat with—

*HR 6865 EH



20

1 (A) commercially available autonomous
2 control and computer vision technology; and

3 (B) such sensors and methods of commu-
4 nication as are necessary to demonstrate the
5 ability of such control and technology to assist
6 in conducting search and rescue, surveillance,
7 and interdiction missions.

8 (2) COLLECTION OF DATA.—The pilot project
9 under paragraph (1) shall evaluate commercially
10 available products in the field and collect operational
11 data to inform future requirements.

12 (3) BRIEFING.—Not later than 6 months after
13 completing the pilot project required under para-
14 oraph (1), the Commandant shall brief the Com-
15 mittee on Transportation and Infrastructure of the
16 House of Representatives and the Committee on
17 commerce, Science, and Transportation of the Sen-
18 ate on the evaluation of the data derived from the
19 project.
20 SEC. 208. BUDGETING OF COAST GUARD RELATING TO CER-
21 TAIN OPERATIONS.
22 (a) IN GENERAL.—Chapter 51 of title 14, United

23 States Code, is further amended by adding at the end the

24 following:

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 9 N U B WD =

[\O 2 O R O R e e e e e e e T e T
N = OO 0 N R WD = O

23

21

“§5114. Expenses of performing and executing de-

fense readiness mission activities

“The Commandant of the Coast Guard shall include

in the annual budget submission of the President under
section 1105(a) of title 31, a dedicated budget line item
that adequately represents a calculation of the annual
costs and expenditures of performing and executing all de-

fense readiness mission activities, including—

“(1) all expenses related to the Coast Guard’s
coordination, training, and execution of defense
readiness mission activities in the Coast Guard’s ca-
pacity as an Armed Force (as such term is defined
in section 101 of title 10) in support of Department
of Defense national security operations and activities
or for any other military department or defense
agency (as such terms are defined in such section);

“(2) costs associated with Coast Guard detach-
ments assigned in support of the Coast Guard’s de-
fense readiness mission; and

“(3) any other expenses, costs, or matters the
Commandant determines appropriate or otherwise of
interest to Congress.””.

(b) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The analysis for chap-

24 ter 51 of title 14, United States Code, is further amended

25 by adding at the end the following:

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 9 N U B WD =

|\ JEE \© R O R O R N0 R T T S S S T e e
A W O = O O 0NN N R WD = O

22

“5114. Expenses of performing and executing defense readiness mission activi-

ties.”.

SEC. 209. REPORT ON SAN DIEGO MARITIME DOMAIN

AWARENESS.

Not later than 180 days after the date of enactment
of this Act, the Commandant of the Coast Guard shall
submit to the Committee on Transportation and Infra-
structure of the IHouse of Representatives and the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and Transportation of the

Senate a report containing—

(1) an overview of the maritime domain aware-

ness in the area of responsibility of the Coast Guard
sector responsible for San Diego, California, includ-

ing—

(A) the average volume of known maritime
traffic that transited the area during fiscal
yvears 2020 through 2022;

(B) current sensor platforms deployed by
such sector to monitor illicit activity occurring
at sea in such area;

(C) the number of illicit activity incidents
at sea in such area that the sector responded to
during fiscal years 2020 through 2022;

(D) an estimate of the volume of traffic
engaged 1n illicit activity at sea in such area

and the type and deseription of any vessels used

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N N RN = O

23

to carry out illicit activities that such sector re-

sponded to during fiscal years 2020 through

2022; and

(E) the maritime domain awareness re-
quirements to effectively meet the mission of
such sector;

(2) a description of current actions taken by the
Coast Guard to partner with Federal, regional,
State, and local entities to meet the maritime do-
main awareness needs of such area;

(3) a description of any gaps in maritime do-
main awareness within the area of responsibility of
such sector resulting from an inability to meet the
enduring maritime domain awareness requirements
of the sector or adequately respond to maritime dis-
order;

(4) an identification of current technology and
assets the Coast Guard has to miticate the gcaps
identified in paragraph (3);

(5) an identification of capabilities needed to
mitigate such gaps, including any ecapabilities the
Coast Guard currently possesses that can be de-

ployed to the sector;

*HR 6865 EH



24

(6) an identification of technology and assets
the Coast Guard does not currently possess and are
needed to acquire in order to address such gaps; and

(7) an 1dentification of any financial obstacles
that prevent the Coast Guard from deploying exist-
ing commercially available sensor technology to ad-
dress such gaps.

SEC. 210. GREAT LAKES WINTER SHIPPING.

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

(a) GREAT LAKES ICEBREAKING OPERATIONS.—

(1) GOVERNMENT ACCOUNTABILITY OFFICE RE-

PORT.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 1 year
after the date of enactment of this Act, the
Comptroller General of the United States shall
submit to the Committee on Commerce,
Science, and Transportation of the Senate and
the Committee on Transportation and Infra-
structure of the Iouse of Representatives a re-
port on Coast Guard icebreaking in the Great

Lakes.

(B) ELEMENTS.—The report required
under subparagraph (A) shall—
(1) evaluate—

(I) the economic impact related

to vessel delays or cancellations asso-

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ JEE \© R \O B \O B O R N e e e e T e T e e e e
A LW PO = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

25
ciated with ice coverage on the Great
Lakes;

(IT) the impact the standards
proposed in paragraph (2) would have
on Coast Guard operations in the
Great Lakes if such standards were
adopted;

(IIT) the fleet mix of medium ice-
breakers and icebreaking tugs nec-
essary to meet the standards proposed
in paragraph (2); and

(IV) the resources necessary to
support the fleet described in sub-
clause (IIT), including billets for crew
and operating costs; and
(1) make recommendations to the

Commandant for improvements to the
Great Lakes icebreaking program, includ-
ing with respect to facilitating shipping
and meeting all Coast Guard mission

needs.

(2) PROPOSED STANDARDS FOR ICEBREAKING

OPERATIONS.

The proposed standards, the impact

of the adoption of which is evaluated in subclauses

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

26
(IT) and (IIT) of paragraph (1)(B)(i), are the fol-
lowing:

(A) Except as provided in subparagraph
(B), the ice-covered waterways in the Great
Lakes shall be open to navigation not less than
90 percent of the hours that vessels engaged in
commercial service and ferries attempt to tran-
sit such ice-covered waterways.

(B) In a year in which the Great Lakes
are not open to navigation, as described in sub-
paragraph (A), because of ice of a thickness
that occurs on average only once every 10
years, ice-covered waterways in the Great Lakes
shall be open to navigation at least 70 percent
of the hours that vessels engaged in commercial
service and ferries attempt to transit such ice-
covered waterways.

(3) REPORT BY COMMANDANT.—Not later than
90 days after the date on which the Comptroller
General submits the report under paragraph (1), the
Commandant shall submit to the Committee on
Commerce, Science, and Transportation of the Sen-
ate and the Committee on Transportation and Infra-
structure of the House of Representatives a report

that includes the following:

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\O I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e D e e
W N = O O 0N N R WD = O

24
25

27

(A) A plan for Coast Guard implementa-
tion of any recommendation made by the Comp-
troller General under paragraph (1)(B)(i1) with
which the Commandant concurs.

(B) With respect to any recommendation
made under paragraph (1)(B)(ii) with which
the Commandant does not concur, an expla-
nation of the reasons why the Commandant
does not concur.

(C) A review of, and a proposed implemen-
tation plan for, the results of the fleet mix anal-
ysis under paragraph (1)(B)(1)(I1I).

(D) Any proposed modifications to current
Coast Guard standards for icebreaking oper-
ations in the Great Lakes.

(4) PrLoT PROGRAM.—During the 5 ice seasons
following the date of enactment of this Act, the
Coast Guard shall conduct a pilot program to deter-
mine the extent to which the current Coast Guard
Great Liakes icebreaking cutter fleet can meet the
proposed standards described in paragraph (2).

(b) DATA ON ICEBREAKING OPERATIONS IN TIE

GREAT LLAKES.

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Commandant shall col-

lect, during ice season, archive, and disseminate data

*HR 6865 EH



S O 0 N N B W

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG R NS B S N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D = O VO 0 NN N R WY e

28

on icebreaking operations and transits on ice-covered
waterways in the Great Lakes of vessels engaged in
commercial service and ferries.

(2) ELEMENTS.—Data collected, archived, and
disseminated under paragraph (1) shall include the
following:

(A) Voyages by vessels engaged in com-
mercial service and ferries to transit ice-covered
waterways in the Great Liakes that are delayed
or canceled because of the nonavailability of a
suitable icebreaking vessel.

(B) Voyages attempted by vessels engaged
in commercial service and ferries to transit ice-
covered waterways in the Great Lakes that do
not reach their intended destination because of
the nonavailability of a suitable icebreaking ves-
sel.

(C) The period of time that each vessel en-
caged In commercial service or ferry was de-
layed in getting underway or during a transit of
ice-covered waterways in the Great Lakes due
to the nonavailability of a suitable icebreaking
vessel.

(D) The period of time elapsed between

each request for icebreaking assistance by a

*HR 6865 EH



S O 0 N N B W

|\ I \© R O R O R O R T e e e T e T e e e e
A W N = O O 0 NN N N PR WD

29
vessel engaged in commercial service or ferry
and the arrival of a suitable icebreaking vessel
and whether such icebreaking vessel was a
Coast Guard or commercial asset.

(E) The percentage of hours that Great
Lakes ice-covered waterways were open to navi-
cation while vessels engaged in commercial
service and ferries attempted to transit such
waterways for each ice season after the date of
enactment of this Act.

(F) Relevant communications of each ves-
sel engaged in commercial service or ferry with
the Coast Guard or commercial icebreaking
service providers with respect to subparagraphs
(A) through (D).

(G) A description of any mitigating cir-
cumstance, such as Coast Guard Great Lakes
icebreaker diversions to higher priority mis-
sions, that may have contributed to the amount
of time described in subparagraphs (C) and (D)
or the percentage of time described in subpara-
oraph (E).

(3) VOLUNTARY REPORTING.—Any reporting by

operators of commercial vessels engaged in commer-

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N D B W=

O TN NG I N T NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N U N N = =N e R - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O TR NO S e

30

cial service or ferries under this section shall be vol-

untary.

(4) PuBLIC AVAILABILITY.—The Commandant
shall make the data collected, archived, and dissemi-
nated under this subsection available to the public
on a publicly accessible internet website of the Coast
Guard.

(5) CONSULTATION WITH INDUSTRY.—With re-
spect to the Great Lakes icebreaking operations of
the Coast Guard and the development of the data
collected, archived, and disseminated under this sub-
section, the Commandant shall consult operators
of—

(A) vessels engaged in commercial service;
and
(B) ferries.

(¢) REPORT ON COMMON HULL DESIGN.—Section
8105 of the William M. (Mac¢) Thornberry National De-
fense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2021 (Public Law
116-283) is amended by striking subsection (b) and in-
serting the following:

“(b) REPORT.—Not later than 90 days after the date
of enactment of this subsection, the Commandant shall
submit to the Committee on Commerce, Science, and

Transportation of the Senate and the Committee on

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N B W =

| \O 2N \© R O R \O I O B e e e e e T e e e e
A W N = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

31
Transportation and Infrastructure of the House of Rep-
resentatives a report on the operational benefits and limi-
tations of a common hull design for icebreaking cutters
for operation in the Great Lakes, the Northeastern United
States, and the Arctic, as appropriate, that are at least
as capable as the Coast Guard 140-foot icebreaking
»

tugs.”.

(d) DEFINITIONS.—In this section:

(1) COMMERCIAL SERVICE.—The term ‘‘com-
mercial service” has the meaning given such term in
section 2101 of title 46, United States Code.

(2)  GREAT LAKES.—The term  “Great
Lakes”—

(A) has the meaning given such term in
section 118 of the Kederal Water Pollution
Control Act (33 U.S.C. 1268); and

(B) includes harbors adjacent to such
waters.

(3) ICE-COVERED WATERWAY.—The term ‘‘ice-
covered waterway’’ means any portion of the Great
Lakes in which vessels engaged in commercial serv-
ice or ferries operate that is 70 percent or greater
covered by ice, but does not include any waters adja-

cent to piers or docks for which commercial

*HR 6865 EH



32

| icebreaking services are available and adequate for
2 the ice conditions.

3 (4) OPEN TO NAVIGATION.—The term “‘open to
4 navigation’”” means navigable to the extent necessary
5 to—

6 (A) meet the reasonable demands of ship-
7 ping;

8 (B) minimize delays to passenger ferries;

9 (C) extricate vessels and persons from dan-
10 oer;

11 (D) prevent damage due to flooding; and
12 (E) conduct other Coast Guard missions,
13 as required.

14 (5) REASONABLE DEMANDS OF SHIPPING.—The
15 term ‘‘reasonable demands of shipping” means the
16 safe movement of vessels engaged in commercial
17 service and ferries transiting ice-covered waterways
18 in the Great Liakes to their intended destination, re-
19 cardless of type of cargo.
20 SEC. 211. CENTER OF EXPERTISE FOR GREAT LAKES OIL
21 SPILL SEARCH AND RESPONSE.
22 Section 807(d) of the Frank LoBiondo Coast Guard

23 Authorization Act of 2018 (14 U.S.C. 313 note) is amend-

24 ed to read as follows:

*HR 6865 EH



2

O o0 9 N W Bk~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

33
“(d) DEFINTTION.—In this section, the term ‘Great
Lakes’ means—
“(1) Lake Ontario;
“(2) Lake Erie;
“(3) Lake Huron (including Liake St. Clair);
“(4) Lake Michigan;
“(5) Lake Superior; and
“(6) the connecting channels (including the fol-
lowing rivers and tributaries of such rivers: Saint
Mary’s River, Saint Clair River, Detroit River, Niag-
ara River, Illinois River, Chicago River, Fox River,
Grand River, St. Joseph River, St. Louis River, Me-
nominee River, Muskegon River, Kalamazoo River,
and Saint Lawrence River to the Canadian bor-
der).”.
SEC. 212. STUDY ON LAYDOWN OF COAST GUARD CUTTERS.
Not later than 120 days after the date of enactment
of this Act, the Secretary of Homeland Security, in con-
sultation with the Secretary of Transportation, shall con-
duct a study on the laydown of Coast Guard Fast Re-
sponse Cutters to assess Coast Guard mission readiness

and to identify areas of need for asset coverage.

*HR 6865 EH



34
1 Subtitle C—Other Matters
SEC. 213. RESPONSES OF COMMANDANT OF THE COAST
GUARD TO SAFETY RECOMMENDATIONS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Chapter 7 of title 14, United

2
3
4
5 States Code, is amended by adding at the end the fol-
6 lowing:

7 “§721. Responses to safety recommendations

8 “(a) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 90 days after the
9 submission to the Commandant of the Coast Guard of a
10 recommendation by the National Transportation Safety
11 Board relating to transportation safety, the Commandant
12 shall submit to the Board a written response to each rec-

13 ommendation, which shall include whether the Com-

14 mandant—

15 “(1) concurs with the recommendation;

16 “(2) partially concurs with the recommendation;
17 or

18 “(3) does not concur with the recommendation.
19 “(b) EXPLANATION OF CONCURRENCE.—A response

20 under subsection (a) shall include—

21 “(1) with respect to a recommendation to which
22 the Commandant concurs, an explanation of the ac-
23 tions the Commandant intends to take to implement
24 such recommendation;

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I e e e e e T e e
S OV o0 N O B R~ WD = O

21
22
23
24
25

35

“(2) with respect to a recommendation to which
the Commandant partially concurs, an explanation
of the actions the Commandant intends to take to
implement the portion of such recommendation with
which the Commandant partially concurs; and

“(3) with respect to a recommendation to which
the Commandant does not concur, the reasons why
the Commandant does not concur with such rec-
ommendation.

“(¢) FAILURE To RESPOND.—If the Board has not
received the written response required under subsection
(a) by the end of the time period described in such sub-
section, the Board shall notify the Committee on Trans-
portation and Infrastructure of the House of Representa-
tives and the Committee on Commerce, Science, and
Transportation of the Senate that such response has not
been received.”.

(b) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The analysis for chap-
ter 7 of title 14, United States Code, is amended by insert-

ing after the item relating to section 720 the following:

“721. Responses to safety recommendations.”.
SEC. 214. CONVEYANCE OF COAST GUARD VESSELS FOR
PUBLIC PURPOSES.
(a) REDESIGNATION AND TRANSFER.—
(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 914 of the Coast

Guard Authorization Act of 2010 (Public Law 111-

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N W B W =

e T S e e =
AN Ln A~ W NN = O

17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

36
281) 1s transferred to chapter 5 of title 14, United
States Code, inserted after section 508, redesignated
as section 509, and amended so that the enu-
merator, section heading, typeface, and typestyle
conform to those appearing in other sections in title
46, United States Code.
(2) CLERICAL: AMENDMENTS.—
(A) COAST GUARD AUTHORIZATION ACT OF
2010.—The table of contents in section 1(b) of
the Coast Guard Authorization Act of 2010
(Public Law 111-281) is amended by striking
the 1item relating to section 914.
(B) TrTLE 46.—The analysis for chapter 5
of title 14, United States Code, is amended by
inserting after the item relating to section 508

the following:

“509. Conveyance of Coast Guard vessels for public purposes.”.

(b) CONVEYANCE OF COAST GUARD VESSELS FOR

PuBLic PURPOSES.—Section 509 of title 14, United
States Code (as transferred and redesignated under sub-
section (a)), 1s amended—
(1) by amending subsection (a) to read as fol-
lows:

“(a) IN GENERAL.—At the request of the Com-

mandant, the Administrator of the General Services Ad-
ministration may transfer ownership of a Coast Guard

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N W BB W

e T S N N T = T = T =
O o0 N O »n B~ W NN = O

20
21
22
23
24

37
vessel or aircraft to an eligible entity for use for edu-
cational, cultural, historical, charitable, recreational, or
other public purposes if such transfer is authorized by
law.”; and
(2) in subsection (b)—
(A) in paragraph (1)—
(i) by inserting “as if such a request
were being processed’” after “‘vessels”; and
(ii) by inserting *, as in effect on the
date of enactment of the Don Young Coast
Guard Authorization Act of 20227 after
“Code of Federal Regulations”; and
(B) in paragraph (2) by inserting “, as in
effect on the date of enactment of the Don
Young Coast Guard Authorization Act of 2022
after “‘such title”.
SEC. 215. ACQUISITION LIFE-CYCLE COST ESTIMATES.
Section 1132(e) of title 14, United States Code, is
amended by striking paragraphs (2) and (3) and inserting
the following:
“(2) TYPES OF ESTIMATES.—For each Level 1
or Level 2 acquisition project or program, in addi-
tion to life-cycle cost estimates developed under

paragraph (1), the Commandant shall require that—

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG I N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N S = = N Re - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O IR NO I e

38
“(A) such life-cycle cost estimates be up-
dated before—
“(1) each milestone decision is con-
cluded; and
“(i1) the project or program enters a
new acquisition phase; and
“(B) an independent cost estimate or inde-
pendent cost assessment, as appropriate, be de-
veloped to validate such life-cycle cost estimates
developed under paragraph (1).”.
SEC. 216. NATIONAL COAST GUARD MUSEUM FUNDING
PLAN.

Section 316(¢)(4) of title 14, United States Code, is
amended by striking “the Inspector General of the depart-
ment in which the Coast Guard is operating” and insert-
ing “a third party entity qualified to undertake such a
certification process’.

SEC. 217. REPORT ON COAST GUARD EXPLOSIVE ORD-
NANCE DISPOSAL.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 1 year after the
date of enactment of this Act, the Commandant of the
Coast Guard shall submit to the Committee on Transpor-
tation and Infrastructure of the House of Representatives
and the Committee on Commerce, Science, and Transpor-

tation of the Senate a report on the wviability of estab-

*HR 6865 EH



O© o0 2 O WD A W N e

|\ T N© TR NG T NS R NS R e e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 N O B BN WD = O

39
lishing an explosive ordnance disposal program (herein-
after referred to as the “Program’) in the Coast Guard.

(b) CONTENTS.

The report required under sub-
section (a) shall contain, at a minimum, an explanation
of the following with respect to such a Program:

(1) Where within the organizational structure
of the Coast Guard the Program would be located,
including a discussion of whether the Program
should reside in—

(A) Maritime Safety and Security Teams;

(B) Maritime Security Response Teams;

(C) a combination of the teams described
under subparagraphs (A) and (B); or

(D) elsewhere within the Coast Guard.

(3) The vehicles and dive craft that are Coast
Guard airframe and vessel transportable that would
be required for the transportation of explosive ord-
nance disposal elements.

(4) The Coast Guard stations at which—

(A) portable explosives storage magazines
would be available for explosive ordnance dis-
posal elements; and

(B) explosive ordnance disposal elements

equipment would be pre-positioned.

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

40
(5) How the Program would support other ele-
ments within the Department of Homeland Security,
the Department of Justice, and in wartime, the De-
partment of Defense to—
(A) counter improvised explosive devices;
(B) counter unexploded ordnance;
(C) combat weapons of destruction;
(D) provide service in support of the Presi-
dent; and
(E) support mnational security special
events.
(6) The career progression of Coast Guardsman
participating in the Program from—
(A) Seaman Recruit to Command Master
Chief Petty Officer;
(B) Chief Warrant Officer 2 to that of
Chief Warrant Officer 4; and
(C) Ensign to that of Rear Admiral.
(7) Imitial and annual budget justification esti-

mates on a single program element of the Program

for

(A) civilian and military pay with details
on military pay, including special and incentive
pays such as—

(i) officer responsibility pay;

*HR 6865 EH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

41

(i1) officer SCUBA diving duty pay;

(ii1) officer demolition hazardous duty
pay;

(iv) enlisted SCUBA diving duty pay;

(v) enlisted demolition hazardous duty
pay;

(vi) enlisted special duty assignment
pay at level special duty-5;

(vii) enlisted assignment incentive
pays;

(vii1) enlistment and reenlistment bo-
nuses;

(ix) officer and enlisted full civilian
clothing allowances;

(x) an exception to the policy allowing
a third hazardous duty pay for explosive
ordnance disposal-qualified officers and en-
listed; and

(x1) parachutist hazardous duty pay;

(B) research, development, test, and eval-

uation;

*HR 6865 EH

(C) procurement;

(D) other transaction agreements;
(E) operations and support; and

(

F') overseas contingency operations.



O o0 9 N U kA WD =

—
o = O

13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

42
SEC. 218. PRIBILOF ISLAND TRANSITION COMPLETION AC-

TIONS.

(a) EXTENSIONS.—Section 524 of the Pribilof Island
Transition Completion Act of 2016 (Public Law 114-120)
18 amended—
(1) in subsection (b)(5) by striking “5 years”
and inserting ‘6 years’; and
(2) in subsection (¢)(3) by striking “60 days”
and inserting “120 days”.

Not

(b) AcTUAL USE AND OCCUPANCY REPORTS.
later than 90 days after enactment of this Act, and quar-
terly thereafter, the Secretary of the department in which
the Coast Guard is operating shall submit to the Com-
mittee on Transportation and Infrastructure of the House
of Representatives and the Committee on Commerce,
Science, and Transportation of the Senate a report de-
seribing—

(1) the degree to which Coast Guard personnel
and equipment are deployed to St. Paul Island,
Alaska, in actual occupancy of the facilities, as re-
quired under section 524 of the Pribilof Island
Transition Completion Act of 2016 (Public Law
114-120