AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

115TH CONGRESS
L H,R. 595

To amend the Federal Reserve Act to reform the Federal Reserve System.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

JANUARY 20, 2017

Mr. CArPUANO introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Com-
mittee on Financial Services, and in addition to the Committees on Rules,
and Oversight and Government Reform, for a period to be subsequently
determined by the Speaker, in each case for consideration of such provi-
sions as fall within the jurisdiction of the committee concerned

A BILL

To amend the Federal Reserve Act to reform the Federal

Reserve System.

[E—

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Bailout Prevention Act

of 20177,

(O Y N )



2

1 SEC. 2. DISCOUNTS FOR INDIVIDUALS, PARTNERSHIPS,

2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

AND CORPORATIONS.

Section 13(3)(B) of the Federal Reserve Act (12
U.S.C. 343(3)(B)) is amended by striking clauses (i) and

(iii) and inserting the following:

“()(I) The Board shall establish proce-
dures to prohibit borrowing from programs and
facilities by borrowers that are insolvent. A bor-
rower shall not be eligible to borrow from any
emergency lending program or facility unless
the Board and all Federal banking regulators
with jurisdiction over the borrower certify that,
at the time the borrower initially borrows under
the program or facility, the borrower is not in-
solvent. Solvency shall be assessed by examining
the last 4 months of relevant financial data and
determining whether the fair value of the bor-
rower’s assets exceeds the fair value of the bor-
rower’s liabilities, with appropriate adjustment
for temporary illiquidity in relevant markets.

“(II) A borrower shall be considered insol-
vent for purposes of this subparagraph if the
borrower is—

“(aa) in bankruptey, resolution under
title IT of the Dodd-Frank Wall Street Re-

form and Consumer Protection Act (12

*HR 595 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I NS R T e e T e T e T e T e T e T
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R~ WD = O

22
23
24

Q
(3}

U.S.C. 5381 et seq.), or any other Federal
or State insolvency proceeding; or

“(bb) a bridge financial company (as
defined 1n section 201(a) of the Dodd-

Frank Wall Street Reform and Consumer

Protection Act (12 U.S.C. 5381(a))) or a

bridge depository institution (as defined in

section 3 of the Federal Deposit Insurance

Act (12 U.S.C. 1813)).

“(II) If the Board or any other banking
regulator makes a certification of solvency, the
Board or banking regulator, as applicable, shall
issue a contemporaneous public statement pro-
viding a detailed explanation of the certification
decision.

“(iii) A program or facility shall be consid-
ered a program or facility with broad-based eli-
eibility only if not fewer than 5 companies are
eligible to participate in the program or facility
in a significant manner.”.

SEC. 3. PENALTY RATE REQUIREMENT; CONGRESSIONAL
APPROVAL REQUIREMENT.
Section 13(3) of the Federal Reserve Act (12 U.S.C.

343(3)) 1s amended by adding at the end the following:

*HR 595 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

4

“(F) Any emergency lending under this
paragraph shall be provided at an annual inter-
est rate not less than 500 basis points greater
than the cost of borrowing for the United
States Treasury for a commensurate loan term.

“(G)(1) If the Board determines that the
Board shall create an emergency lending pro-
oram or facility that does not comply with the
broad-based eligibility requirement described in
subparagraph (B)(ii1) or the penalty rate re-
quirement described in subparagraph (F'), the
Board—

“(I) may create such a program or fa-
cility; and
“(IT) not later than 3 days after the

date on which a program or facility is cre-

ated under clause (1), shall submit to Con-

oress a report that describes the reasons

why the Board is unable to comply with

any requirement described in the matter

preceding subclause (I).

“()(I) A program or facility created under
clause (1)(I) shall terminate on the date that is
30 calendar days after the date on which Con-

oress receives a report described in clause

*HR 595 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

5}

(1)(IT) unless there is enacted into law a joint
resolution approving the program or facility not
later than 30 calendar days after the date on
which the report is received. Any loan offered
through the program or facility that are out-
standing as of the date on which the facility is
terminated shall be repaid in full not later than
30 calendar days after the date on which the
program or facility is terminated.

“(IT) For the purpose of this section, the
term ‘joint resolution’” means only a joint reso-
lution—

“(aa) that 1s introduced not later than

3 calendar days after the date on which

the report referred to in clause (1)(I) is re-

ceived by Congress;
“(bb) that does not have a preamble;
“(ce) the title of which 1s as follows:

‘Joint resolution relating to the approval of

a program or facility created by the Board

of Governors of the Federal Reserve Sys-

tem’; and
“(dd) the matter after the resolving
clause of which is as follows: ‘“That Con-

oress approves the program or facility cre-

*HR 595 IH



O o0 N N W B W =

O TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
LN R W NN = DO VO NN R WD~ O

6

ated by the Board of Governors of the
Federal Reserve System on

. (The blank space

being appropriately filled in).

“(IIT)(aa) Upon receipt of a report under
subsection (a)(3), the Speaker, if the House
would otherwise be adjourned, shall notify the
Members of the House that, pursuant to this
section, the IHouse shall convene not later than
the second calendar day after receipt of such
report.

“(bb) Any committee of the House of Rep-
resentatives to which a joint resolution is re-
ferred shall report it to the House not later
than 5 calendar days after the date of receipt
of the report described in clause (1)(II). If a
committee fails to report the joint resolution
within that period, the committee shall be dis-
charged from further consideration of the joint
resolution and the joint resolution shall be re-
ferred to the appropriate calendar.

“(ce) After each committee authorized to
consider a joint resolution reports it to the
House or has been discharged from its consid-

eration, 1t shall be in order, not later than the

*HR 595 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

7

sixth day after Congress receives the report de-
scribed in clause (1)(IT), to move to proceed to
consider the joint resolution in the House. All
points of order against the motion are waived.
Such a motion shall not be in order after the
House has disposed of a motion to proceed on
the joint resolution. The previous question shall
be considered as ordered on the motion to its
adoption without intervening motion. The mo-
tion shall not be debatable. A motion to recon-
sider the vote by which the motion is disposed
of shall not be in order.

“(dd) The joint resolution shall be consid-
ered as read. All points of order against the
joint resolution and against its consideration
are waived. The previous question shall be con-
sidered as ordered on the joint resolution to its
passage without intervening motion except 2
hours of debate equally divided and controlled
by the proponent and an opponent. A motion to
reconsider the vote on passage of the joint reso-
lution shall not be in order.

“(IV)(aa) Upon receipt of a report under
clause (1)(IT), if the Senate has adjourned or re-

cessed for more than 2 days, the majority lead-

*HR 595 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

8

er of the Senate, after consultation with the mi-
nority leader of the Senate, shall notify the
Members of the Senate that, pursuant to this
subparagraph, the Senate shall convene not
later than the second calendar day after receipt
of such message.

“(bb) Upon introduction in the Senate, the
joint resolution shall be placed immediately on
the calendar.

“(ce)(AA) Notwithstanding Rule XXII of
the Standing Rules of the Senate, it is in order
at any time during the period beginning on the
fourth day after the date on which Congress re-
ceives a report described in clause (1)(II) and
ending on the sixth day after the date on which
Congress receives the report (even though a
previous motion to the same effect has been dis-
agreed to) to move to proceed to the consider-
ation of the joint resolution, and all points of
order against the joint resolution (and against
consideration of the joint resolution) are
waived. The motion to proceed is not debatable.
The motion is not subject to a motion to post-
pone. A motion to reconsider the vote by which

the motion is agreed to or disagreed to shall not

*HR 595 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

9

be in order. If a motion to proceed to the con-
sideration of the resolution is agreed to, the
joint resolution shall remain the unfinished
business until disposed of.

“(BB) Debate on the joint resolution, and
on all debatable motions and appeals in connec-
tion therewith, shall be limited to not more than
10 hours, which shall be divided equally be-
tween the majority and minority leaders or
their designees. A motion further to lmit de-
bate is in order and not debatable. An amend-
ment to, or a motion to postpone, or a motion
to proceed to the consideration of other busi-
ness, or a motion to recommit the joint resolu-
tion is not in order.

“(CC) The vote on passage shall occur im-
mediately following the conclusion of the debate
on a joint resolution, and a single quorum call
at the conclusion of the debate if requested in
accordance with the rules of the Senate.

“(DD) Appeals from the decisions of the
Chair relating to the application of the rules of
the Senate, as the case may be, to the proce-
dure relating to a joint resolution shall be de-

cided without debate.

*HR 595 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

10
“(V)(aa) If, before the passage by one
House of a joint resolution of that House, that
House receives from the other House a joint
resolution, then the following procedures shall
apply:
“(AA) The joint resolution of the
other House shall not be referred to a com-
mittee.
“(BB) With respect to a joint resolu-
tion of the House receiving the resolu-
tion—
“(CC) the procedure in that House
shall be the same as if no joint resolution
had been received from the other House;
but
“(DD) the vote on passage shall be on
the joint resolution of the other House.
“(bb) If one House fails to introduce or
consider a joint resolution under this section,
the joint resolution of the other House shall be
entitled to expedited floor procedures under this
section.

“(ce) If, following passage of the joint res-
olution in the Senate, the Senate then receives

the companion measure from the House of Rep-

*HR 595 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

11

resentatives, the companion measure shall not
be debatable.

“(dd) If the President vetoes the joint res-
olution, the period beginning on the date the
President vetoes the joint resolution and ending
on the date the Congress receives the veto mes-
sage with respect to the joint resolution shall be
disregarded in computing the 30-calendar-day
period described in subclause (I) and debate on
a veto message in the Senate under this section
shall be 1 hour equally divided between the ma-
jority and minority leaders or their designees.

“(ee) This subclause and subclauses (II),
(ITI), and (IV) are enacted by Congress—

“(AA) as an exercise of the rule-
making power of the Senate and IHouse of

Representatives, respectively, and as such

it 18 deemed a part of the rules of each

House, respectively, but applicable only

with respect to the procedure to be fol-

lowed in that House in the case of a joint
resolution, and it supersedes other rules
only to the extent that it is inconsistent

with such rules; and

*HR 595 IH



O o0 N N B W =

[ w—
e

12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

12
“(BB) with full recognition of the
constitutional right of either House to
change the rules (so far as relating to the
procedure of that IHouse) at any time, in
the same manner, and to the same extent
as 1n the case of any other rule of that

House.” .

SEC. 4. PUBLIC DISCLOSURE OF INFORMATION RELATED

TO CREDIT FACILITIES.

REPORTS ON GAO AUDITS.—Section

714(f)(3)(C)(111) of title 31, United States Code, 18 amend-

(1) by striking “1 year” and inserting 60

and

(2) by striking “24 months” and inserting “60

(b) PUBLIC DISCLOSURES BY THE BOARD OF GOV-

(a)
ed—

days’’;

days”.
ERNORS.

Section 11 of the Federal Reserve Act (12

U.S.C. 248) is amended—

(1) in the first subsection (s) (relating to trans-

parency and the release of information)—

*HR 595 IH

(A) in paragraph (2)—
(1) in subparagraph (A), by striking

“1 year” and inserting “60 days’’; and



O o0 N N W BB W

[a—
S

13

(i) in subparagraph (B), by striking
“the last day of the eighth calendar quar-
ter following the calendar quarter 1in
which” and inserting ‘“the date that is 60

days after the date on which”; and
(B) in paragraph (5), by striking “24-

month” and inserting “60 days’; and

(2) by redesignating the second subsection (s)
(relating to assessments, fees, and other charges) as

subsection (t).

*HR 595 IH




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2017-01-31T05:05:48-0500
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




