AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1141H CONGRESS
L HLR. 1779

To reauthorize the Runaway and Homeless Youth Aect; and for other purposes.

Mr.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

ApriL 14, 2015

YarMuTH (for himself and Mr. REICIIERT) introduced the following bill;
which was referred to the Committee on Education and the Workforce,
and in addition to the Committee on the Judiciary, for a period to be
subsequently determined by the Speaker, in each case for consideration
of such provisions as fall within the jurisdiction of the committee con-
cerned

A BILL

To reauthorize the Runaway and Homeless Youth Act; and

[E—

O o0 9 N U B W

for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Runaway and Home-
less Youth and Trafficking Prevention Act of 2015,

SEC. 2. RUNAWAY AND HOMELESS YOUTH AND TRAF-
FICKING PREVENTION.
(a) REFERENCES.—Except as otherwise specifically

provided, whenever in this section an amendment or repeal



O© 00 3 O WD B W N =

[\© TN NG I N T NG N NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ N N O N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O B NO S e

2

1s expressed in terms of an amendment to, or repeal of,
a provision, the amendment or repeal shall be considered
to be made to a provision of the Runaway and Homeless

Youth Act (42 U.S.C. 5701 et seq.).

(b) FINDINGS.—Section 302 (42 U.S.C. 5701) is

amended—

“age, gender,

(1) in paragraph (2), by inserting
and culturally and” before “linguistically appro-
priate’’;

(2) in paragraph (4), by striking “outside the
welfare system and the law enforcement system”
and inserting ““, in collaboration with public assist-
ance systems, the law enforcement system, and the

child welfare system’’;

(3) in paragraph (5)
(A) by inserting “‘a safe place to live and”
after “‘youth need”; and
(B) by striking “and” at the end;
(4) in paragraph (6), by striking the period and
inserting “; and”’; and
(5) by adding at the end the following:
“(7) runaway and homeless youth are at a high
risk of becoming victims of sexual exploitation and
trafficking in persons.”.

(¢) BASIC CENTER GRANT PROGRAM.—

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG R NG B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N s = N Re - BN B e ) W ) TR “S O I NO S e

3

(1) GRANTS FOR CENTERS AND SERVICES.

Section 311(a) (42 U.S.C. 5711(a)) is amended—
(A) in paragraph (1), by striking “‘serv-
ices” and all that follows through the period
and inserting ‘“‘safe shelter and services, includ-
ing trauma-informed services, for runaway and
homeless youth and, if appropriate, services for
the families of such youth, including (if appro-
priate) individuals identified by such youth as
family.”; and
(B) in paragraph (2)—
(i) in subparagraph (A), by striking
“mental health,”;
(i1) in subparagraph (B)—
(I) in clause (i), by striking “21
days; and” and inserting “30 days;”’;
(IT) in clause (i1)—

(aa) by inserting ‘“‘age, gen-
der, and culturally and linguis-
tically appropriate to the extent
practicable” before “individual’’;

(bb) by inserting *, as ap-
propriate,” after “group’; and

(ece) by striking “as appro-

priate” and inserting ‘‘including

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

4

(if appropriate) counseling for in-

dividuals identified by such youth

as family”’; and

(IIT) by adding at the end the
following:

“(i11)  suicide prevention — services;
and”’; and

(ii1) in subparagraph (C)—

(I) in clause (i1), by inserting
“age, gender, and culturally and lin-
cuistically appropriate to the extent
practicable’” before “home-based serv-
ices”’;

(IT) in eclause (i), by striking
“and” at the end;

(ITI) in eclause (iv), by striking
“diseases.” and inserting ‘‘infec-
tions;”’; and

(IV) by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(v) trauma-informed and gender-re-
sponsive services for runaway or homeless
youth, including such youth who are vie-
tims of trafficking in persons or sexual ex-

ploitation; and

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W Bk W =

| \O 2N \© R \O R O N O R N e e e e e T e e e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

5}

“(v1) an assessment of family engage-
ment in support and reunification (if re-
unification 18 appropriate), interventions,
and services for parents or legal guardians
of such youth, or (if appropriate) individ-

uals identified by such youth as family.”.

(2) ELIGIBILITY; PLAN REQUIREMENTS.—Sec-

tion 312 (42 U.S.C. 5712) is amended—

44(7)

(A) in subsection (b)—
(i) in paragraph (5), by inserting “, or
(if appropriate) individuals identified by

Y

such youth as family,” after “parents or
legal guardians’;

(i1) in paragraph (6), by striking “cul-
tural minority and persons with limited
ability to speak KEnglish” and inserting
“cultural minority, persons with limited
ability to speak English, and runaway or
homeless youth who are wvictims of traf-
ficking in persons or sexual exploitation’;

(ii1) by striking paragraph (7) and in-
serting the following:

shall keep adequate statistical records

profiling the youth and family members of such

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e e e e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

6

youth whom the applicant serves, including demo-
eraphic information on and the number of—
“(A) such youth who are not referred to
out-of-home shelter services;
“(B) such youth who are members of vul-
nerable or underserved populations;
“(C) such youth who are victims of traf-
ficking in persons or sexual exploitation,

disageregated by

“(1) such youth who have been coerced
or forced into a commercial sex act, as de-
fined in section 103 of the Trafficking Vie-
tims Protection Act of 2000 (22 U.S.C.
7102);

“(i1) such youth who have been co-
erced or forced into other forms of labor;
and

“(i11) such youth who have engaged in
a commercial sex act, as so defined, for
any reason other than by coercion or foree;
“(D) such youth who are pregnant or par-

enting;
“(E) such youth who have been involved in

the child welfare system; and

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N N RN = O

7

“(F) such youth who have been involved in
the juvenile justice system;”’;
(iv) by redesignating paragraphs (8)
through (13) as paragraphs (9) through
(14);
(v) by inserting after paragraph (7)
the following:
“(8) shall ensure that—

“(A) the records described in paragraph
(7), on an individual runaway or homeless
youth, shall not be disclosed without the con-
sent of the individual youth and of the parent
or legal guardian of such youth or (if appro-
priate) an individual identified by such youth as
family, to anyone other than another agency
compiling statistical records or a government
agency involved in the disposition of criminal
charges against an individual runaway or home-
less youth; and

“(B) reports or other documents based on
the statistics described in paragraph (7) shall
not disclose the identity of any individual run-

away or homeless youth;”’;

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N N RN = O

*HR 1779 IH

8

(vi) in paragraph (9), as so redesig-
nated, by striking “statistical summaries”
and inserting “‘statisties’;

(vii) in paragraph (13)(C), as so re-
designated—

(I) by striking clause (i) and in-
serting:

“(1) the number and characteristics of
runaway and homeless youth, and youth at
risk of family separation, who participate
in the project, including such information
on—

“(I) such youth (including both
types of such participating youth) who
are victims of trafficking in persons or

sexual  exploitation,  disaggregated

by
“(aa) such youth who have
been coerced or forced into a
commercial sex act, as defined in
section 103 of the Trafficking
Victims Protection Act of 2000

(22 U.S.C. 7T102);



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N N RN = O

*HR 1779 IH

“(bb) such youth who have
been coerced or forced into other
forms of labor; and

“(ee¢) such youth who have
engaged in a commercial sex act,
as so defined, for any reason
other than by coercion or force;
“(II) such youth who are preg-

nant or parenting;

“(ITI) such youth who have been
imvolved in the child welfare system;
and

“(IV) such youth who have been
involved in the juvenile justice system;
and”’; and

(IT) in clause (i1), by striking
“and” at the end;

(viii) in paragraph (14), as so redesig-
nated, by striking the period and inserting
“for natural disasters, inclement weather,
and mental health emergencies;”’; and

(ix) by adding at the end the fol-

lowing:



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

10

“(15) shall provide age, gender, and culturally

and linguistically appropriate services to the extent

practicable to runaway and homeless youth; and

“(16) shall assist youth in completing the Free

Application for Federal Student Aid described in

section 483 of the IHigher Education Act of 1965
(20 U.S.C. 1090).”; and

*HR 1779 IH

(B) in subsection (d)—

(1) in paragraph (1)—

(I) by inserting ‘“‘age, gender, and
culturally and linguistically appro-
priate to the extent practicable” after
“provide’’;

(IT) by striking ‘“families (includ-
ing unrelated individuals in the family
households) of such youth” and in-
serting “families of such youth (in-
cluding unrelated individuals in the
family households of such youth and,
if appropriate, individuals identified
by such youth as family)”; and

(ITI) by inserting ‘“‘suicide pre-
vention,” after  “physical health

care,”’; and



11

| (ii) in paragraph (4), by inserting ,
2 including training on trauma-informed and
3 youth-centered care” after ‘‘home-based
4 services’’.

5 (3) APPROVAL OF APPLICATIONS.—Section
6 313(b) (42 U.S.C. 5713(b)) is amended—

7 (A) by striking “priority to” and all that
8 follows through “who” and inserting ‘‘priority
9 to eligible applicants who’’;

10 (B) by striking ‘‘; and” and inserting a pe-
11 riod; and

12 (C) by striking paragraph (2).

13 (d) TRANSITIONAL LIVING GRANT PROGRAM.—Sec-

14 tion 322(a) (42 U.S.C. 5714-2(a)) 1s amended—

15 (1) in paragraph (1)—

16 (A) by inserting ‘“‘age, gender, and cul-
17 turally and linguistically appropriate to the ex-
18 tent practicable” before “‘information and coun-
19 seling services”; and

20 (B) by striking “job attainment skills, and
21 mental and physical health care” and inserting
22 “yob attainment skills, mental and physical
23 health care, and suicide prevention services’’;

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

12

(2) by redesignating paragraphs (3) through
(8) and (9) through (16) as paragraphs (5) through
(10) and (12) through (19), respectively;

(3) by inserting after paragraph (2) the fol-
lowing:

“(3) to provide counseling to homeless youth
and to encourage, if appropriate, the involvement in
such counseling of their parents or legal guardians,
or (if appropriate) individuals identified by such
youth as family;

“(4) to provide aftercare services, if possible, to
homeless youth who have received shelter and serv-
ices from a transitional living youth project, includ-
ing (to the extent practicable) such youth who, after
receiving such shelter and services, relocate to a
State other than the State in which such project is
located;”’;

(4) in paragraph (9), as so redesignated—

(A) by inserting ‘“‘age, gender, and cul-
turally and linguistically appropriate to the ex-
tent practicable” after ‘‘referral of homeless
youth to”’;

(B) by striking “and health care pro-
orams’’ and inserting ‘“‘mental health service

and health care programs, including programs

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

13

providing wrap-around services to victims of

trafficking in persons or sexual exploitation,’;

and

(C) by striking ‘“‘such services for youths;”
and inserting “‘such programs described in this
paragraph;’’;

(5) by inserting after paragraph (10), as so re-
designated, the following:

“(11) to develop a plan to provide age, gender,
and culturally and linguistically appropriate services
to the extent practicable that address the needs of
homeless and street youth;”’;

(6) in paragraph (12), as so redesignated, by
striking ““the applicant and statistical” through
“who participate in such project,” and inserting
“the applicant, statistical summaries describing the
number, the characteristics, and the demographic in-
formation of the homeless youth who participate in
such project, including the prevalence of trafficking
in persons and sexual exploitation of such youth,”;
and

(7) in paragraph (19), as so redesignated, by
inserting “‘regarding responses to natural disasters,
inclement weather, and mental health emergencies”

after “‘management plan”.

*HR 1779 IH



14

(e) COORDINATING, TRAINING, RESEARCH, AND

OTHER ACTIVITIES.

(1) COORDINATION.—Section 341 (42 U.S.C.
5714-21) 1s amended—

(A) in the matter preceding paragraph (1),
by inserting  ‘“safety, well-being,” after
“health,”; and

(B) in paragraph (2), by striking “other
Federal entities” and inserting ‘‘the Depart-
ment of Housing and Urban Development, the
Department of Education, the Department of
Labor, and the Department of Justice’.

(2) GRANTS FOR TECIHNICAL ASSISTANCE AND
TRAINING.—Section 342 (42 U.S.C. 5714-22) 1is
amended by inserting °‘, including onsite and web-
based techniques, such as on-demand and online
learning,” before ‘“‘to public and private entities”.

(3) GRANTS FOR RESEARCI, EVALUATION,
DEMONSTRATION, AND SERVICE PROJECTS.—Section
343 (42 U.S.C. 5714-23) 1s amended—

(A) in subsection (b)—

(1) in paragraph (5)
(I) in subparagraph (A), by in-
serting “‘violence, trauma, and” before

“sexual abuse and assault’;

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

15

(IT) i subparagraph (B), by
striking “‘sexual abuse and assault;
and” and inserting ‘‘sexual abuse or
assault, trafficking in persons, or sex-
ual exploitation;”’;

(ITI) in subparagraph (C), by
striking “who have been sexually vie-
timized” and inserting “who are vie-
tims of sexual abuse or assault, traf-
ficking in persons, or sexual exploi-
tation”’; and

(IV) by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(D) best practices for identifying and pro-
viding age, gender, and culturally and linguis-
tically appropriate services to the extent prac-
ticable to—

“(1) vulnerable and underserved youth
populations; and

“(i1) youth who are victims of traf-
ficking in persons or sexual exploitation;
and

“(E) verifying youth as runaway or home-
less to complete the Free Application for Fed-

eral Student Aid described in section 483 of the

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG I N T NG N NG R NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N e R - BN B o) W ) TR ~SU O I NO R e

16
Higher Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C.

1090);;

(i) in paragraph (9), by striking
“and” at the end;

(ii1) in paragraph (10), by striking the
period and inserting ‘‘; and”; and

(iv) by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(11) examining the intersection between the
runaway and homeless youth populations and traf-
ficking in persons, including noting whether such
yvouth who are vietims of trafficking in persons were
previously involved in the child welfare or juvenile
justice systems.”’; and

(B) in subsection (¢)(2)(B), by inserting *,
including such youth who are victims of traf-
ficking in persons or sexual exploitation” after

“runaway or homeless youth.

(4) PERIODIC ESTIMATE OF INCIDENCE AND

PREVALENCE OF YOUTH HOMELESSNESS.—Section
345 (42 U.S.C. 5714-25) 1s amended—
(A) 1n subsection (a)—
(1) in paragraph (1)—
(I) by striking “13” and insert-

ing “127; and

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

17
(IT) by striking “and” at the end;
(i1) in paragraph (2), by striking the
period and inserting a semicolon; and
(111) by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(3) that includes demographic information
about and characteristics of runaway or homeless
youth, including such youth who are victims of traf-
ficking in persons or sexual exploitation; and

“(4) that does not disclose the identity of any
runaway or homeless youth.”’; and

(B) in subsection (b)(1)—

(1) in the matter preceding subpara-
oraph (A), by striking “13” and inserting
“127;

(1) 1 subparagraph (A), by striking
“and” at the end;

(iii) by redesignating subparagraph
(B) as subparagraph (C);

(iv) by inserting after subparagraph
(A) the following:

“(B) incidences, if any, of—
“(1) such individuals who are victims

of trafficking in persons; or

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG I N T NG I NG R NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO S e

18
“(11) such individuals who are victims
of sexual exploitation; and’’; and
(v) in subparagraph (C), as so redes-
ignated—

(I) in clause (i), by striking *;
and” and inserting “, including men-
tal health services;”’; and

(IT) by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(iv) access to education and job
training; and”’.
(f) SEXUAL ABUSE PREVENTION PROGRAM.—Sec-
tion 351 (42 U.S.C. 5714-41) 1s amended—
(1) in subsection (a)—
(A) by inserting “public and” before ‘“non-
profit”’; and
(B) by striking “‘prostitution, or sexual ex-
ploitation.” and inserting ‘‘violence, trafficking
in persons, or sexual exploitation.”; and
(2) by adding at the end the following:

“(¢) ELIGIBILITY REQUIREMENTS.—To be eligible to

receive a grant under subsection (a), an applicant shall
certify to the Secretary that such applicant has systems
in place to ensure that such applicant can provide age,

cgender, and culturally and linguistically appropriate serv-

*HR 1779 IH



19

ices to the extent practicable to all youth described in sub-
section (a).”.
() GENERAL PROVISIONS.—
(1) REPORTS.—Section 382(a) (42 U.S.C.
5715(a)) is amended—

(A) in paragraph (1)—

(1) by redesignating subparagraphs
(B) through (D) as subparagraphs (C)
through (E), respectively; and

(11) by inserting after subparagraph
(A) the following:

“(B) collecting data on trafficking in per-
sons and sexual exploitation of runaway and
homeless youth;”’; and

(B) in paragraph (2)—

(1) by striking subparagraph (A) and
inserting the following:

“(A) the number and characteristics of
homeless youth served by such projects, includ-
ng—

“(1) such youth who are victims of
trafficking in persons or sexual exploi-
tation;

“(i1) such youth who are pregnant or

parenting;

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS B N e e T e e T e T e e T
[ N N O N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) B ~S O B NO R e

20
“(i11) such youth who have been in-
volved in the child welfare system; and
“(iv) such youth who have been in-
volved in the juvenile justice system;”’; and
(i1) in subparagraph (F'), by striking
“intrafamily  problems” and inserting
“problems within the family, including (if
appropriate) individuals identified by such
youth as family,”.
(2) NONDISCRIMINATION.—Part F i1s amended

by inserting after section 386A (42 U.S.C. 5732-1)

the following:

“SEC. 386B. NONDISCRIMINATION.

“(a) IN GENERAL.—No person in the United States
shall, on the basis of actual or perceived race, color, reli-
gion, national origin, sex, gender identity (as defined in
section 249(¢)(4) of title 18, United States Code), sexual
orientation, or disability, be excluded from participation
in, be denied the benefits of, or be subjected to diserimina-
tion under any program or activity funded in whole or in
part with funds made available under this title.

“(b) EXCEPTION.—If sex segregation or sex-specific
programming is necessary to the essential operation of a
program, nothing in this section shall prevent any such

program or activity from consideration of an individual’s

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W Bk W =

O TN NG I N T NG I NS R NS B N e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N = =N e R - BN B e ) W ) SR ~S O B NO I e

21

sex. In such circumstances, grantees may meet the re-
quirements of this section by providing comparable serv-
1ces to individuals who cannot be provided with the sex-
segregated or sex-specific programming.

“(¢) DISQUALIFICATION.—The authority of the Sec-
retary to enforce this section shall be the same as that
provided for with respect to section 654 of the Head Start
Act (42 U.S.C. 9849).

“(d) CoNSTRUCTION.—Nothing in this section shall
be construed, interpreted, or applied to supplant, displace,
preempt, or otherwise limit the responsibilities and liabil-
ities under other Federal or State civil rights laws.”.

(3) DEFINITIONS.—Section 387 (42 U.S.C.
H732a) 1s amended—

(A) by redesignating paragraphs (1)
through (6), and paragraphs (7) and (8), as
paragraphs (2) through (7), and paragraphs (9)
and (10), respectively;

(B) by inserting before paragraph (2), as
so redesignated, the following:

“(1) CULTURALLY AND LINGUISTICALLY AP-
PROPRIATE.—The term ‘culturally and linguistically
appropriate’, with respect to services, has the mean-
ing given the term ‘culturally and linguistically ap-

propriate services’ in the ‘National Standards for

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

22

Culturally and Linguistically Appropriate Services in

Health and Health Care’, issued in April 2013, by

the Office of Minority Health of the Department of

Health and Human Services.”’;

(C) in paragraph (6)(B)(v), as so redesig-

nated—

(1) by redesignating subclauses (II)
through (IV) as subclauses (IIT) through
(V), respectively;

(11) by inserting after subclause (I),
the following:

“(IT) trafficking in persons;’’;

(111) in subclause (IV), as so redesig-
nated—

(I) by striking “‘diseases” and in-
serting “‘infections’; and
(IT) by striking “and” at the end;

(iv) in subclause (V), as so redesig-
nated, by striking the period and inserting
“;and”; and

(v) by adding at the end the following:

“(VI) suicide.”;

(D) in paragraph (7)(B), as so redesig-

nated, by striking “prostitution,” and inserting

“trafficking in persons,”’;

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS R e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = N R - BN B e ) W ) T ~S O T NO I e

23
(E) by inserting after paragraph (7), as so
redesignated, the following:

“(8) TRAFFICKING IN PERSONS.—The term
‘trafficking in persons’ has the meaning given the
term ‘severe forms of trafficking in persons’ in sec-
tion 103 of the Trafficking Victims Protection Act
of 2000 (22 U.S.C. 7102).”;

(F') in paragraph (9), as so redesignated—
(1) by inserting ‘“‘to homeless youth”
after “provides’’; and
(i1) by inserting ““, to establish a sta-
ble family or community supports,” after
“self-sufficient living”’; and
(G) in paragraph (10)(B), as so redesig-
nated—
(1) in clause (11)—
(I) by inserting ‘“‘or able” after
“willing”’; and
(IT) by striking “or”” at the end;
(i1) in clause (iii), by striking the pe-

2

riod and inserting “‘; or”’; and
(1) by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(iv) who 1s involved in the child wel-

fare or juvenile justice system, but who is

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 N N W B W =

|\ I O R NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 N O W B W DN = ©

24

not receiving government-funded hous-

7

ing.”.

(4) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.

Section 388(a) (42 U.S.C. 5751(a)) is amended—

(A) in paragraph (1), by striking
“$140,000,000” and all that follows through
“20137, and inserting “such sums as may be
necessary for fiscal years 2016 through 20207;

(B) in paragraph (3)(B), by striking
“2009, 2010, 2011, 2012, and 2013” and in-
serting “2016 through 2020”’; and

(C) in paragraph (4), by striking
“$25,000,000” and all that follows through
“20137, and inserting “such sums as may be
necessary for fiscal years 2016 through 20207.

SEC. 3. RESPONSE TO MISSING CHILDREN AND VICTIMS OF
CHILD SEX TRAFFICKING.

(a) MISSING CHILDREN’S ASSISTANCE ACT.—Section
404(b)(1)(P)(iii) of the Missing Children’s Assistance Act
(42 U.S.C. 5773(b)(1)(P)(ii1)) i1s amended by striking
“child prostitution” and inserting “‘child sex trafficking”.

(b) CRIME CONTROL ACT OF 1990.—Section 3702
of the Crime Control Act of 1990 (42 U.S.C. 5780) 1is

amended—

*HR 1779 IH



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

end;

25

(1) in paragraph (2), by striking “and” at the

(2) in paragraph (3)

(A) by redesignating subparagraphs (B)
and (C) as subparagraphs (C) and (D), respec-
tively; and

(B) by inserting after subparagraph (A)
the following:

“(B) a recent photograph of the child, if
available;”’; and
(3) in paragraph (4)—

(A) in subparagraph (A), by striking “60
days” and inserting ‘30 days’’;

(B) in subparagraph (B), by striking
“and” at the end;

(C) in subparagraph (C)—

(1) by inserting ‘“State and local child
welfare systems and” before “‘the National
Center for Missing and Exploited Chil-
dren”’; and

(ii) by striking the period at the end
and inserting ‘; and”’; and
(D) by adding at the end the following:
“(D) grant permission to the National

Crime Information Center Terminal Contractor

*HR 1779 IH



o BN =) T V) B SN UV N \ O]

26

for the State to update the missing person
record in the National Crime Information Cen-
ter computer networks with additional informa-
tion learned during the investigation relating to
the missing person.”.
SEC. 4. SHORT TITLE.
This Act may be cited as the “Runaway and Home-

less Youth and Trafficking Prevention Act of 20157,
O

*HR 1779 IH




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2015-04-17T06:15:45-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




