Wy Jii 29 M 512

MurieL BowsEeERr
Mayor

The Honorable Phil Mendelson
Chairman

Council of the District of Columbia
1350 Pennsylvania Ave., NW, Suite 506
Washington, D.C. 20004

Dear Chairman Mendelson:

Enclosed for consideration and approval by the Council of the District of Columbia is a proposed
resolution entitled the “2017 District of Columbia Construction Codes Approval Resolution of
2020.” This rulemaking will repeal the 2013 District of Columbia Construction Codes, published
March 28, 2014 at 61 DCR 3096, as amended, and, in its place, adopt the 2017 District of
Columbia Construction Codes, consisting of the following:

(A) Model Codes:

I

2.

the 2015 edition of the International Building Code published by the International Code
Council (ICC);

the 2015 edition of the International Residential Code published by the International
Code Council (ICC);

the 2015 edition of the International Fuel Gas Code published by the International Code
Council (ICC);

the 2015 edition of the International Mechanical Code published by the International
Code Council (ICC);

the 2015 edition of the International Plumbing Code published by the International Code
Council (ICC);

the 2015 edition of the International Property Maintenance Code published by the
International Code Council (ICC); '

the 2015 edition of the International Fire Code published by the International Code
Council (ICC);

the 2013 edition of the Energy Standard for Buildings Except Low-Rise Residential
Buildings (ANSI/ASHRAE/IES 90.1-2013) published by the American Society of
Heating, Refrigeration and Air-Conditioning Engineers, Inc. (ASHRAE), and the 2015
edition of the International Energy Conservation Code-Residential Provisions published
by the International Code Council (ICC);

the 2015 edition of the International Existing Building Code published by the
International Code Council (ICC);



10. the 2012 edition of the International Green Construction Code published by the

International Code Council (ICC);

11. the 2015 edition of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code published by the

International Code Council (ICC); and

12. the 2014 edition of the National Electrical Code (NFPA 70) published by the National

Fire Protection Association.

(B) All additions, insertions, and deletions to the Model Codes, as identified in the District of
Columbia Construction Codes Supplement of 2017, to be codified in Title 12 of the District of
Columbia Municipal Regulations (DCMR), Subtitles A through L (the District of Columbia
Construction Codes Supplement of 2017); and

(C) Appendices in the Model Codes that are specifically adopted by the District of Columbia in
the District of Columbia Construction Codes Supplement of 2017.

During the code development cycle, which spanned a four-year period, more than 100 public and
private sector stakeholders participated through meetings of the Construction Codes
Coordinating Board (the “CCCB”) and its Technical Advisory Groups. Members of the
Technical Advisory Groups include representatives of diverse stakeholders including the
following: DCRA, DOEE, FEMS, DDOT, WASA, Office of Disability Rights, Department of
Parks and Recreation, Legal Aid, Office of the Tenant Advocate, Bread for the City, AOBA,
DCBIA, fire protection engineers, structural engineers, mechanical engineers, environmental
engineers, architects, property management companies, builders, and District of Columbia
residents.

In addition to incorporating up-to-date fire safety and building practices, the 2017 District of
Columbia Construction Codes will advance the following public interest goals:

Energy Conservation

1.

The 2017 District of Columbia Energy Conservation Code provides an important and
effective mechanism for the District to achieve the ambitious reduction targets set out in the
Clean Energy DC Plan and Sustainable DC 2.0 to mandate net-zero construction for new
construction in single family, two family and low-rise multifamily buildings by 2022 and
new construction in all other building types (ex: commercial and multifamily) by 2026. The
new Energy Conservation Code will advance the goals of the Paris Climate Accords, and the
Mayor’s commitment to those goals, specifically a 50% reduction in GHG by 2032, that
includes a 50% energy use reduction by 2032 and 50% increase in renewable generation by
2032 for all energy types; and a target of carbon neutrality by 2050.

The 2017 District of Columbia Energy Conservation Code provides new and alternative
compliance pathways for commercial and residential projects. This allows greater flexibility
to the construction industry to design cutting-edge, high-performance energy projects (for
example, net-zero energy buildings).



Flood Hazard Protection

In order to comply with FEMA recommendations, the 2017 District of Columbia Building Code
adopts new, comprehensive provisions for flood-resistant construction, where construction
occurs in flood hazard areas, that are consistent with FEMA requirements. By placing these
regulations within the Building Code, increased coordination between DCRA and DOEE will be
ensured for new construction and substantial improvements in flood hazard areas, thereby
achieving greater compliance with the FEMA requirements necessary to ensure the District’s
participation in the National Flood Insurance Program.

Use of Innovative Construction Materials and Processes.

The 2017 District of Columbia Building Code will facilitate the use of mass timber as a type of
construction in the District of Columbia. This change will potentially foster a new, innovative
and environmentally attractive construction technology in the District of Columbia. Mass
timber, an innovative new construction material with low embodied carbon, will help the District
achieve greater energy efficient targets, carbon reductions, and potentially create new jobs. A
number of mass timber projects are already being developed in DC and the regulatory change
will provide greater certainty for these developers.

Renovation and Improvement of Existing Buildings

The 2017 District of Columbia Building Code allows fagade projections on existing buildings, up
to 6 inches beyond the lot line, or building restriction line if one exists, into the public right-of-
way in order to facilitate improvement, renovation and energy efficiency of existing buildings
that were built up to the lot lines. This codifies a policy adopted in 2018 by the Directors of
DDOT and DCRA, with the concurrence of the Public Space Commiittee.

Increased Fire Safety in Existing Buildings

The 2017 District of Columbia Fire Code addresses significant fire safety issues in the District of
Columbia, including, most notably, by proposing a more robust enforcement approach to bring
existing buildings into compliance with minimum fire safety provisions. Although prior codes
have required existing buildings to come into compliance with the minimum fire safety
provisions for existing buildings in Chapter 11 of the Fire Code, compliance with these
provisions has lagged, with safety implications for firefighters and building occupants. In order
to expedite compliance by owners of existing buildings with these provisions, the new rules
provide 24-months from code adoption for existing building owners to submit a permit
application to DCRA for the work needed to come into compliance with the minimum fire safety
standards for existing buildings.

New Requirements for Protection of Adjoining Premises By Persons Doing Construction Work

The 2017 District of Columbia Building Codes clarifies and strengthens the provisions for
protection of adjoining premises by persons doing construction work. Significant elements of the
revised requirements include: (1) posting of a sign on the premises where the construction



activity will take place to provide notice to the neighbor whose property may be structurally
affected by the construction work; and (2) a requirement that the person doing the work must
obtain written permission from the adjoining neighbor to perform protective work that requires
access on a neighbor’s property.

A Notice of Proposed Rulemaking was published in the September 28, 2018 edition of the
District of Columbia Register (65/40-Part 2 DCR 10111-10973). No public comments were
received in response to the Notice of Proposed Rulemaking that requested any changes in the
proposed Property Maintenance Code Supplement of 2017 (12-G DCMR) or the proposed
Swimming Pool and Spa Code Supplement of 2017 (12-L DCMR). Public comments received
with respect to the other subtitles were carefully considered by the Construction Codes
Coordinating Board (CCCB), and a Second Notice of Proposed Rulemaking was published in the
July 26, 2019 edition of the District of Columbia Register (66/31-Part 2 DCR 8854-9719) (with
changes as needed to address these public comments.

In response to the Second Notice, ten parties submitted comments by the August 27, 2019
deadline. All of these comments were carefully considered by the CCCB and its Technical
Advisory Groups. After due consideration, the CCCB confirmed that all of the comments: (1)
were untimely filed in that the comments should have been submitted in response to the first
Notice of Proposed Rulemaking or raised at any point during the four-year code development
cycle; and/or (2) did not warrant a change in the proposed rules. This CCCB determination also
took into account that the code development cycle spanned four years, and that all stakeholders
were actively solicited to provide input during the code development cycle, either through
participation in CCCB meetings or in the Technical Advisory Groups.

Following publication of the Second Notice of Proposed Rulemaking, a small number of
typographical, grammatical and other non-substantive corrections were made to the Building
Code Supplement (12A DCMR) and the Energy Conservation Code Supplement-Commercial
Provisions (12I[CE] DCMR). These revisions do not alter the intent, application, or purpose of
the proposed rules.

After adoption of the proposed 2017 District of Columbia Construction Codes the CCCB is
proposing to publish a proposed amendment to address any of the untimely comments that it
deems to have merit, and which it believes should be considered before the next code
development cycle.

If you have any questions on this matter, please contact Ernest Chrappah, Director, Department
of Consumer and Regulatory Affairs, at (202) 442-8935.

Sincerely,

Mutiel Bédwser

Endosures



OO W~

10
11
12
15
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28

29

30

31

32

33

34

35

36

% s
éhairmah Phil Mendelson
at the request of the Mayor

A PROPOSED RESOLUTION

IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

Chairman Phil Mendelson, at the request of the Mayor, introduced the following resolution,
which was referred to the Committee on

To approve the proposed rules to adopt the 2017 District of Columbia Construction Codes
and to amend Title 12, Subtitles A-L, of the District of Columbia Municipal
Regulations.

RESOLVED, BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA, That this
resolution may be cited as the “2017 District of Columbia Construction Codes Approval
Resolution of 2020.”

Sec. 2. Pursuant to Section 10 of the Construction Codes Approval and Amendments Act
of 1986, effective March 21, 1987 (D.C. Law 6-216; D.C. Official Code § 6-1409), the Council
approves the proposed rules which will amend Title 12, Subtitles A-L, of the District of
Columbia Municipal Regulations by repealing the 2013 District of Columbia Construction Codes
and replacing them with the 2017 District of Columbia Construction Codes.

Sec. 3. The Council adopts the fiscal impact statement contained in the committee report
as the fiscal impact statement required by section 602(c)(3) of the District of Columbia Home

Rule Act, approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813; D.C. Official Code § 1-206.02(c)(3)).

Sec. 4. The Secretary of the Council shall transmit a copy of this resolution, upon its



1  adoption, to the Director of the Department of Consumer and Regulatory Affairs.

2 Sec. 5. This resolution shall take effect immediately.



Government of the District of Columbia
Office of the Chief Financial Officer

* * %
EERE
T

Jeffrey S. DeWitt

Chief Financial Officer

MEMORANDUM

TO: The Honorable Phil Mendelson

Chairman, Council of the District of Columbia
FROM: Jeffrey S. DeWitt J) @W
Chief Financial Officer & ?

DATE: October 25, 2019

SUBJECT: Fiscal Impact Statement - 2017 District of Columbia Construction
Codes Approval Resolution of 2019

REFERENCE: Draft resolution provided to the Office of Revenue Analysis on October
18,2019

Conclusion

Funds are sufficient in the fiscal year 2020 through fiscal year 2023 budget and financial plan to
implement the resolution.

Background

The resolution approves rulemaking! to make clarifications and updates to the District of Columbia
Construction Codes (“DCCC”"). The changes include new construction requirements that reflect
advances in technology, engineering and safety practices. The changes were adopted by the
District’s Construction Codes Coordinating Board? as part of an approval process that allowed for
public comments. The codes have not been comprehensively updated since 2014.

Among the changes, the updates align the DCCC with the Clean Energy DC Plan3, Sustainable DC
2.0, and the Federal Emergency Management Agency’s requirements for new construction and
improvements on sites within flood hazard zones. The changes also include additional notifications

166 DCR 8854-9719 (July 26, 2019), available at
h der C

2 Constructmn Codes Coordinating Board web page (https: Hdgra dc. ggy[;grylgemonstmcpon goclgs
coordinating-board).

3 Clean Energy DC Plan is published here (https://doee.dc.gov/cleanenergydc).
* Sustainable DC 2.0 plan is published her:

://doee.dc.gov/sites /default/files/dc/si ddoe/servi ontent/attachmen 04202.0%20Edi
%20V2%20web4.pdf).

1350 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW, Suite 203, Washington, DC 20004 (202)727-2476
www.cfo.dc.gov



The Honorable Phil Mendelson
FIS: “2017 District of Columbia Construction Codes Approval Resolution of 2019,” Draft resolution shared
with the Office of Revenue Analysis on October 18, 2019

to neighboring properties when construction may affect the structural stability of an adjoining
property.

Financial Plan Impact

Funds are sufficient in the fiscal year 2020 through fiscal year 2023 budget and financial plan to
implement the resolution. The Department of Consumer and Regulatory Affairs can absorb any
costs of training its building inspectors and plans reviewers. There are no other anticipated costs to
the District as a result of the resolution.

Page 2 of 2



GOVERNMENT OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA
OFFICE OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL
* % %
EEESE
KARL A. RACINE
ATTORNEY GENERAL ERRERRT

LEGAL COUNSEL DIVISION

MEMORANDUM

TO: Gianelle Rivera
Acting Executive Director
Office of Legislative Support

FROM: Brian K. Flowers
Deputy Attorney General
Legal Counsel Division

DATE: November 12, 2019

SUBJECT: Legal Sufficiency Review of Proposed Resolution, the “2017 District of
Columbia Construction Codes Approval Resolution of 2019”
(AD-19-675)

ThiS is to Cel‘tify th AL this Office has reviewed the above-referenced

legislation and has found it to be legally sufficient. If you have questions regarding this
certification, please do not hesitate to contact me at 724-5524.

; \5?/&.;—— /{%’f\: >

Brian K. Flowers

1350 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW, Suite 409, Washington, DC 20004 « Tel: (202) 724-5524 Email: brian.flowers@dc.gov



DC Register

Vol 66/31-part 2

*Includes non-substantive revisions

DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

CONSTRUCTION CODES SUPPLEMENT OF 2017
12-A DCMR BUILDING CODE SUPPLEMENT OF 2017

The District of Columbia adopts the 2015 edition of the International Building Code (IBC), as
amended by this Supplement.

IBC CHAPTERS AMENDED OR NEWLY CREATED IN THIS SUPPLEMENT:

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS

CHAPTER 3 USE AND OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION

CHAPTER 4 SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON USE AND
OCCUPANCY

CHAPTER 5 GENERAL BUILDING HEIGHTS AND AREAS

CHAPTER 6 TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION

CHAPTER 7 FIRE AND SMOKE PROTECTION FEATURES

CHAPTER 9 FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS

CHAPTER 10 MEANS OF EGRESS

CHAPTER 11 ACCESSIBILITY

CHAPTER 12 INTERIOR ENVIRONMENT

CHAPTER 15 ROOF ASSEMBLIES AND ROOFTOP STRUCTURES

CHAPTER 16 STRUCTURAL DESIGN

CHAPTER 17 SPECIAL INSPECTIONS AND TESTS

CHAPTER 18 SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS

CHAPTER 21 MASONRY

CHAPTER 23 WOOD

CHAPTER 29 PLUMBING SYSTEMS

CHAPTER 30 ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS

CHAPTER 31 SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION

CHAPTER 32 ENCROACHMENTS INTO PUBLIC SPACE, THE PUBLIC RIGHT-
OF-WAY OR BUILDING RESTRICTION AREA

CHAPTER 33 SAFEGUARDS DURING CONSTRUCTION

CHAPTER 34 EXISTING BUILDINGS

CHAPTER 35 REFERENCED STANDARDS

APPENDIX E SUPPLEMENTARY ACCESSIBILITY REQUIREMENTS

APPENDIX G FLOOD-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION

APPENDIX N SIGNS

" The District of Columbia Building Code (2017), referred to as the “Building Code,” consists of the 2015 edition of
the International Building Code (International Building Code), published by the International Code Council (ICC),
as amended by the Building Code Supplement of 2017 (12-A DCMR). The International Building Code is
copyrighted by the ICC and therefore is not republished here. However, a copy of the text may be obtained at:
https://codes.iccsafe.org/public/document/IBC2015.



https://codes.iccsafe.org/public/document/IBC2015

DC Register
Vol 66/31-part 2
*includes non-substantive revisions



DC Register
Vol 66/31-part 2
*includes non-substantive revisions

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT

101 GENERAL

102 APPLICABILITY

103 DEPARTMENT OF CONSUMER AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS

104 DUTIES AND POWERS OF THE CODE OFFICIAL

105 PERMITS

106 SUBMITTAL DOCUMENTS

107 TEMPORARY STRUCTURES AND USES

108 FEES

109 INSPECTIONS

110 LETTERS OF CORE AND SHELL COMPLETION AND CERTIFICATES
AUTHORIZING OCCUPANCY AND USE OF PREMISES

111  REVOCATION OF PERMITS AND CERTIFICATES

112 INTERNAL AGENCY REVIEW AND APPEALS OF FINAL DECISIONS OF
CODE OFFICIAL AND ZONING ADMINISTRATOR

113 VIOLATIONS, REMEDIES, PENALTIES, AND OTHER ENFORCEMENT
ACTIONS

114 STOP WORK ORDERS

115  UNSAFE CONDITIONS

116 EMERGENCY CONDITIONS

117  POSTING OF OCCUPANT LOAD AND LIVE LOAD SIGNS

118 ADDRESSES OF PREMISES

119 SERVICE UTILITIES

120 COVENANTS AND AGREEMENTS

121 [RESERVED]

122 AMENDMENTS AND COPIES

123  TRANSITORY PROVISIONS

Strike Section 101 €hapter— of the International Building Code in its entirety and insert a new
Section 101 €hapter into the Building Code in its place to read as follows:

101

GENERAL

101.1 The Construction Codes. The 2017 District of Columbia Construction Codes,
hereinafter referred to as the “Construction Codes,” shall consist of:

1. The following Model Codes:

1.1 The International Building Code (2015) published by the International Code
Council (“ICC”);



DC Register
Vol 66/31-part 2
*includes non-substantive revisions

1.2 The International Residential Code (2015) published by the ICC;

1.3 The National Electrical Code (2014) published by the National Fire Protection
Association (“NFPA”);

1.4 The International Fuel Gas Code (2015) published by the ICC;

1.5 The International Mechanical Code (2015) published by the ICC;

1.6 The International Plumbing Code (2015) published by the ICC;

1.7 The International Property Maintenance Code (2015) published by the ICC;

1.8 The International Fire Code (2015) published by the ICC;

1.9 The Energy Standard for Buildings Except Low-Rise Residential Buildings
(ANSI/ASHRAE/IES 90.1-2013) published by the American Society of
Heating, Refrigeration and Air-Conditioning Engineers, Inc. (ASHRAE) and the
International Energy Conservation Code-Residential Provisions (2015)
published by the ICC;-and;

1.10 The International Existing Building Code (2015) published by the ICC;

1.11 The International Green Construction Code (2012) published by the ICC; and

1.12 The International Swimming Pool and Spa Code (2015):-and.

2. All additions, insertions, and deletions to the Model Codes, as identified in the
District of Columbia Construction Codes Supplement of 2017 (the “Construction
Codes Supplement’), codified in Title 12 of the District of Columbia Municipal
Regulations (DCMR).

3. Appendices in the Model Codes shall not apply unless specifically adopted in the
Construction Codes Supplement.

101.1.1 Authority to Adopt Construction Codes. The Construction Codes are adopted
in the District of Columbia pursuant to the provisions of the Construction Codes Act (as
defined in Section 202.2).

101.1.2 Administration and Enforcement. Chapter 1 of 12-A DCMR shall serve as
the administrative and enforcement provisions for the Building Code, Residential Code,
Electrical Code, Fuel Gas Code, Mechanical Code, Plumbing Code, Energy
Conservation Code, Existing Building Code, Green Construction Code and Swimming
Pool and Spa Code, except as otherwise provided herein. Administrative and
enforcement provisions for the Property Maintenance Code and the Fire Code are set
forth in 12-G DCMR, Chapter 1, and 12-H DCMR, Chapter 1, respectively.

101.1.3 Definitions. Italicized words and terms shall have the meanings set forth in the
Construction Codes.



DC Register
Vol 66/31-part 2
*includes non-substantive revisions

101.2 Building Code. The District of Columbia Building Code 2017 (“Building Code”) shall
consist of the 2015 edition of the International Building Code (“International Building Code™),
as amended by the Building Code Supplement of 2017 (12-A DCMR) of the District of
Columbia Construction Codes Supplement of 2017.

101.2.1 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices of the International Building Code
shall not apply unless specifically adopted in the Construction Codes Supplement.

101.2.2 Administration and Enforcement. Chapter 1 of the International Building
Code is deleted in its entirety. In its place, the provisions of 12-A DCMR A, Chapter 1,
shall apply to the Building Code and are incorporated herein by this reference.

101.2.3 Scope. The provisions of the Building Code shall apply to the construction,
alteration, addition, relocation, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and
occupancy, location, maintenance, removal, demolition and raze of every building or
structure or any appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or structures.

Exceptions:

1. Detached one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses not more than three
stories above grade plane in height with a separate means of egress and their
accessory structures that comply with the Residential Code and Chapters 17, 18,
32, and 33 of the Building Code.

2. Existing buildings undergoing repair, alteration, addition or change of occupancy
that comply with the Existing Building Code.

3. Home day care in dwelling units in Group R-3 dwellings that comply with
Appendix M of the Residential Code.

101.2.4 Intent. The purpose of the Building Code is to establish the minimum
requirements to provide a reasonable level of safety, public health, and general welfare
through structural strength, means of egress facilities, stability, sanitation, adequate light
and ventilation, energy conservation, accessibility, sustainability, and safety to life and
property from fire and other hazards attributed to the built environment, and to provide a
reasonable level of safety to fire fighters and emergency responders during emergency
operations.

101.3 Residential Code. The District of Columbia Residential Code (2017) (“Residential
Code”) shall consist of the 2015 edition of the International Residential Code (“International
Residential Code”), as amended by the Residential Code Supplement of 2017 (12-B DCMR) of
the District of Columbia Construction Codes Supplement of 2017.



DC Register
Vol 66/31-part 2
*includes non-substantive revisions

101.3.1 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices of the International Residential Code
shall not apply unless specifically adopted in the Construction Codes Supplement.

101.3.2 Administration and Enforcement. Chapter 1 of the International Residential
Code is deleted in its entirety. In its place, the provisions of 12-A DCMR, Chapter 1,
shall apply to the Residential Code and are incorporated by this reference.

101.3.3 Scope. The provisions of the Residential Code shall apply to the construction,
alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy,
location, demolition, and raze of detached one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses
not more than three stories above grade plane in height with a separate means of egress
and their accessory structures.

Exceptions:

1. Live/work units complying with the requirements of Section 419 of the Building
Code shall be allowed to be built as one- and two-family dwellings or
townhouses. Fire suppression required by Section 419.5 of the Building Code,
when a unit is constructed under the Residential Code, shall conform to Section
2904 of the Residential Code.

2. Owner-occupied lodging houses with five or fewer guestrooms shall be permitted
to be constructed in accordance with the Residential Code when equipped with a
fire sprinkler system that is in accordance with Section 2904 of the Residential
Code.

3. Detached one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses not more than three
stories above grade plane in height with a separate means of egress, and their
accessory structures, shall be permitted to comply with the Building Code defined
in Section 101.2.

4. Existing buildings undergoing repair, alteration, change of occupancy, addition to
or relocation shall comply with the Existing Building Code defined in Section
101.4.8 or the current Construction Codes.

101.3.3.1 Home Day Care. Appendix M of the Residential Code shall apply to
home day care, including Child Development Homes where oversight is provided
by the Office of the State Superintendent of Education or a successor agency, in
dwelling units within either: (1) detached one- and two-family dwellings or
townhouses within the scope of the Residential Code; or (2) R-3 dwellings.

101.3.4 Intent. The purpose of the Residential Code is to establish the minimum
requirements to provide a reasonable level of safety, public health, and general welfare
through affordability, structural strength, means of egress facilities, stability, sanitation,

6



DC Register
Vol 66/31-part 2
*includes non-substantive revisions

adequate light and ventilation, energy and resource conservation, and safety to life and
property from fire and other hazards attributed to the built environment, and to provide a
reasonable level of safety to fire fighters and emergency responders during emergency
operations.

101.4. Electrical Code. The District of Columbia Electrical Code (2017) (“Electrical Code™)
shall consist of the 2014 edition of the National Electrical Code (“National Electrical Code”)
published by the National Fire Protection Association (“NFPA™), as amended by the Electrical
Code Supplement of 2017 (12-C DCMR) of the District of Columbia Construction Codes
Supplement of 2017.

101.4.1. Annexes. Provisions in the annexes to the National Electrical Code are
provided for informational purposes only, in accordance with Article 90, Section
90.5 of the MNational Electrical Code, unless otherwise specified in the
Construction Codes Supplement.

101.4.2 Administration and Enforcement. The provisions of 12-A DCMR,
Chapter 1, shall apply to the Electrical Code and are incorporated by this
reference, without deletion of Article 90 of the National Electrical Code except as
specified.

Exceptions: Sections 90.1(A), 90.1(C), 90.2, 90.4 and 90.6 of Article 90
of the National Electrical Code are deleted in their entirety.

101.4.3 Scope. The provisions of the Electrical Code shall apply to the design,
installation, maintenance, alteration, conversion, changing, repairing, removal,
and inspection of electrical conductors, equipment, and raceways; signaling and
communications conductors, equipment, and raceways; and optical fiber cables
and raceways for the following:

1. Public and private premises, including, but not limited to, buildings, other
structures, mobile homes, recreational vehicles, and floating buildings.

2. Yards, lots, parking lots, carnivals, circuses, fairs and similar events, and
industrial substations.

3. Installation of conductors and equipment that connect to the supply of
electricity.

4. Installations used by the electric utility, such as office buildings,
warehouses, garages, machine shops, and recreational buildings, that are

not an integral part of a generating plant, substation, or control center.

Exceptions:



DC Register
Vol 66/31-part 2

*Includes non-substantive revisions

Installations in ships, watercraft other than floating buildings, railway
rolling stock, aircraft, or automotive vehicles other than mobile homes and
recreational vehicles.

Installations underground in mines and self-propelled mobile surface
mining machinery and its attendant electrical trailing cable.

Installation of railways for generation, transformation, transmission, or
distribution of power used exclusively for operation of rolling stock or
installations used exclusively for signaling and communications purposes.

Installations of communications equipment under the exclusive control of
communications utilities located outdoors or in building spaces used
exclusively for such installations.

Installations under the exclusive control of an electrical utility where such
installations:

5.1 Consist of service drops or service laterals, and associated
metering, or

5.2 Are on property owned or leased by the electric utility for the
purpose of communications, metering, generation, control,
transformation, transmission, or distribution of electric energy, or

5.3 Are located in legally established easements or rights-of-way,
or

5.4 Are located by other written agreements either designated by
or recognized by public service commissions, utility commissions,
or other regulatory agencies having jurisdiction for such
installations.  These written agreements shall be limited to
installations for the purpose of communications, metering,
generation, control, transformation, transmission, or distribution of
electrical energy where legally established easements or rights-of-
way cannot be obtained. These installations shall be limited to
federal lands, Native American reservations through the U.S.
Department of the Interior, Bureau of Indian Affairs, military
bases, lands controlled by port authorities and state agencies and
departments, and lands owned by railroads.

6. Installations that are part of detached one- and two-family dwellings and

townhouses not more than three stories above grade plane in height with

8



DC Register

Vol 66/31-part 2
*includes non-substantive revisions

separate means of egress and their accessory structures that comply with
the Residential Code.

101.4.4 Intent. The purpose of the Electrical Code is to establish minimum
requirements to safeguard persons and property from hazards arising from the use
of electricity, and is not intended as a design specification or as an instruction
manual for untrained persons.

101.5 Fuel Gas Code. The District of Columbia Fuel Gas Code (2017) (“Fuel Gas
Code”) shall consist of the 2015 edition of the International Fuel Gas Code
(“International Fuel Gas Code”), as amended by the Fuel Gas Code Supplement of 2017
(12-D DCMR) of the District of Columbia Construction Codes Supplement of 2017.

101.5.1 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices of the International Fuel Gas
Code shall not apply unless specifically adopted in the Construction Codes
Supplement.

101.5.2 Administration and Enforcement. Chapter 1 of the International Fuel
Gas Code is deleted in its entirety. In its place, the provisions of 12-A DCMR,
Chapter 1, shall apply to the Fuel Gas Code and are incorporated by this
reference.

101.5.3 Scope. The provisions of the Fuel Gas Code shall apply to the
installation of fuel gas piping systems, fuel gas utilization equipment, gaseous
hydrogen systems, and related accessories, as follows:

1. Gaseous hydrogen systems shall be regulated by Chapter 7.

2. The regulations shall cover piping systems for natural gas with an
operating pressure of 125 pounds per square inch gauge (psig) (862 kPa
gauge) or less, and for LP-gas with an operating pressure of 20 psig (140
kPa gauge) or less, except as provided in Section 402.6.1. Coverage shall
extend from the point of delivery to the outlet of the equipment shutoff
valves. Piping system requirements shall include design, materials,
components, fabrication, assembly, installation, testing, inspection,
operation, and maintenance.

3. Requirements for gas utilization equipment and related accessories shall
include installation, combustion and dilution air, and venting and
connection to piping systems.

4, The requirements for the design, installation, maintenance, alteration, and
inspection of mechanical appliances operating with fuels other than fuel
gas shall be regulated by the Mechanical Code.



DC Register
Vol 66/31-part 2

*Includes non-substantive revisions

Exception to 101.5.3: Detached one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses
not more than three stories above grade plane in height with separate means of
egress and their accessory structures that comply with the Residential Code.

101.5.3.1 Exempted Installations and Equipment. The Fuel Gas Code
shall not apply to the following:

1.

10.

1.

12.

Portable LP-Gas equipment of all types that is not connected to a
fixed fuel system.

Installation of farm equipment such as brooders, dehydrators, dryers
and irrigation equipment.

Raw material (feedstock) applications except for piping to special
atmosphere generators.

Oxygen-fuel gas cutting and welding systems.

Industrial gas applications using gases such as acetylene and
acetylenic compounds, hydrogen, ammonia, carbon monoxide,
oxygen and nitrogen.

Petroleum refineries, pipeline compressor or pumping stations,
loading terminals, compounding plants, refinery tank farms and
natural gas processing plants.

Integrated chemical plants or portions of such plants where
flammable or combustible liquids or gases are produced by chemical
reactions or used in chemical reactions.

LP-Gas installations at utility gas plants.

Liquefied natural gas (LNG) installations.

Fuel gas piping in power and atomic energy plants.

Proprietary items of equipment, apparatus, or instruments such as gas
generating sets, compressors and calorimeters.

LP-Gas equipment for vaporization, gas mixing and gas
manufacturing.

10



DC Register

Vol 66/31-part 2
*includes non-substantive revisions

13. Temporary LP-Gas piping for buildings under construction or
renovation that is not to become part of the permanent piping system.

14. Installation of LP-Gas systems for railroad switch heating.

15. Installation of LP-Gas and compressed natural gas (CNG) systems on
vehicles.

16. Except as provided in Section 401.1.1 of the Fuel Gas Code, gas
piping, meters, gas pressure regulators, and other appurtenances used
by the serving gas supplier in the distribution of gas, other than
undiluted LP-Gas.

17. Building design and construction, except as specified herein.

18. Piping systems for mixtures of gas and air within the flammable
range with an operating pressure greater than 10 psig (69 kPa gauge).

19. Portable fuel cell appliances that are neither connected to a fixed
piping system nor interconnected to a power grid.

101.5.4 Intent. The purpose of the Fuel Gas Code is to establish minimum
standards to provide a reasonable level of safety, health, property, and public
welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction, installation, quality
of materials, location, operation and maintenance or use of fuel gas systems.

101.6 Mechanical Code. The District of Columbia Mechanical Code (2017)
(“Mechanical Code”) shall consist of the 2015 edition of the International Mechanical
Code (“International Mechanical Code”), as amended by the Mechanical Code
Supplement of 2017 (12-E DCMR) of the District of Columbia Construction Codes
Supplement of 2017.

101.6.1 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices of the International
Mechanical Code shall not apply unless specifically adopted in the Construction
Codes Supplement.

101.6.2 Administration and Enforcement. Chapter 1 of the International
Mechanical Code is deleted in its entirety. In its place, the provisions of 12-A
DCMR, Chapter 1, shall apply to the Mechanical Code and are incorporated by
this reference.

101.6.3 Scope. The provisions of the Mechanical Code shall regulate the design,
installation, maintenance, alteration, and inspection of mechanical systems that
are permanently installed and utilized to provide control of environmental

11



DC Register

Vol 66/31-part 2
*includes non-substantive revisions

conditions and related processes within buildings. The Mechanical Code shall
also regulate those mechanical systems, systems components, equipment and
appliances specifically addressed therein. The installation of fuel gas distribution
piping and equipment, fuel gas-fired appliances and fuel gas-fired appliance
venting systems shall be regulated by the Fuel Gas Code.

Exception: Detached one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses not more
than three stories above grade plane in height with separate means of egress and
their accessory structures that comply with the Residential Code.

101.6.4 Intent. The purpose of the Mechanical Code is to establish minimum
standards to provide a reasonable level of safety, health, property protection and
public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction, installation,
quality of materials, location, operation and maintenance or use of mechanical
systems.

101.7 Plumbing Code. The District of Columbia Plumbing Code (2017) (“Plumbing
Code”) shall consist of the 2015 edition of the International Plumbing Code
(“International Plumbing Code”), as amended by the Plumbing Code Supplement of
2017 (12-F DCMR) of the District of Columbia Construction Codes Supplement of 2017.

101.7.1 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices of the International Plumbing
Code shall not apply unless specifically adopted in the Construction Codes
Supplement.

101.7.2 Administration and Enforcement. Chapter 1 of the International
Plumbing Code is deleted in its entirety. In its place, the provisions of 12-A
DCMR, Chapter 1, shall apply to the Plumbing Code and are incorporated by this
reference.

101.7.3 Scope. The provisions of the Plumbing Code shall apply to the erection,
installation, alteration, repairs, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or
maintenance of plumbing systems within the District of Columbia. The Plumbing
Code shall also regulate non-flammable medical gas, inhalation anesthetic,
vacuum piping, non-medical oxygen systems and sanitary and condensate vacuum
collection systems.

Exceptions:
1. Detached one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses not more
than three stories above grade plane in height with separate means of

egress and their accessory structures that comply with the Residential
Code.

12



DC Register

Vol 66/31-part 2
*includes non-substantive revisions

2. The design and installation of fuel gas distribution piping and
equipment, fuel gas fired water heaters, and water heater venting
systems shall be regulated by the Fuel Gas Code.

3. The design and installation of chilled water piping in connection with
refrigeration process and comfort cooling, and hot water piping in
connection with building heating, shall conform to the requirements of
the Mechanical Code.

4. The design and installation of piping for fire sprinklers and standpipes
shall conform to the requirements of the Building Code. Water and
drainage connections to such installations shall be made in accordance
with the requirements of the Plumbing Code.

101.7.4 Intent. The purpose of the Plumbing Code is to establish minimum
standards to provide a reasonable level of safety, health, property protection
and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction,
installation, quality of materials, location, operation and maintenance or use of
plumbing equipment and systems.

101.8 Property Maintenance Code. The District of Columbia Property Maintenance
Code (2017) (“Property Maintenance Code”) shall consist of the 2015 edition of the
International Property Maintenance Code (“International Property Maintenance Code”)
as amended by the Property Maintenance Code Supplement of 2017 (12-G DCMR) of the
District of Columbia Construction Codes Supplement of 2017.

101.8.1 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices of the International Property
Maintenance Code shall not apply unless specifically adopted in the Construction
Codes Supplement.

101.8.2 Administration and Enforcement. Chapter 1 of the International
Property Maintenance Code 1is deleted in its entirety. Administration and
enforcement provisions for the Property Maintenance Code are set forth in 12-G
DCMR, Chapter 1.

101.8.3 Scope. The provisions of the Property Maintenance Code shall apply to
all existing residential and nonresidential premises and shall constitute minimum
requirements and standards for: premises, equipment, and facilities for light,
ventilation, space, heating, sanitation, protection from the elements, a reasonable
level of safety from fire and other hazards, and for a reasonable level of sanitary
maintenance; the responsibility of owners, operators and occupants; the
occupancy of existing premises; and for administration, enforcement and
penalties.

13



DC Register
Vol 66/31-part 2
*includes non-substantive revisions

101.8.4 Intent. The purpose of the Property Maintenance Code is to ensure
public health, safety and welfare insofar as they are affected by the continued
occupancy and maintenance of premises. Existing premises that do not comply
with these provisions shall be altered or repaired to provide a minimum level of
health and safety as required therein.

101.9 Fire Code. The District of Columbia Fire Code (2017) (“Fire Code”) shall consist of the
2015 edition of the International Fire Code (“International Fire Code”), as amended by the Fire
Code Supplement of 2017 (12-H DCMR) of the District of Columbia Construction Codes
Supplement of 2017.

101.9.1 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices of the International Fire Code
shall not apply unless specifically adopted in the Construction Codes Supplement.

101.9.2 Administration and Enforcement. Chapter 1 of the International Fire
Code is deleted in its entirety. Administration and enforcement provisions for the
Fire Code are set forth in 12-H DCMR, Chapter 1.

101.9.3 Scope. The provisions of the Fire Code shall establish regulations
affecting or relating to premises, processes, and safeguards regarding: the hazard
of fire and explosion arising from the storage, handling or use of structures,
materials or devices; conditions hazardous to life, property or public welfare in
the occupancy of premises; fire hazards on the premises from occupancy or
operation; and conditions affecting the safety of fire fighters and emergency
responders during emergency operations.

101.9.4 Intent. The purpose of the Fire Code is to establish the minimum
requirements consistent with nationally recognized good practice for providing a
reasonable level of life safety and property protection from the hazards of fire,
explosion, or dangerous conditions in all premises, and to provide a reasonable
level of safety to fire fighters and emergency responders during emergency
operations.

101.10 Energy Conservation Code. The District of Columbia Energy Conservation
Code (2017) (“Energy Conservation Code) shall consist of the Energy Conservation
Code-Commercial Provisions and the Energy Conservation Code-Residential Provisions.
The Energy Conservation Code-Commercial —Provisions shall consist of
ANSI/ASHRAE/IES 90.1-2013, Energy Standard for Buildings Except Low-Rise
Residential Buildings (“ASHRAE 90.1”), as amended by the Energy Conservation Code
Supplement of 2017 — Commercial Provisions (12-I[CE] DCMR) of the District of
Columbia Construction Codes Supplement of 2017. The Energy Conservation Code-
Residential Provisions shall consist of the Residential Provisions of the 2015 edition of
the International Energy Conservation Code (“International Energy Conservation Code-
Residential Provisions”), as amended by the Energy Conservation Code Supplement of

14



DC Register
Vol 66/31-part 2
*includes non-substantive revisions

2017 — Residential Provisions (12-I[RE] DCMR) of the District of Columbia
Construction Codes Supplement of 2017.

101.10.1 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices to the Energy Conservation
Code-Commercial Provisions shall not apply unless specifically adopted in the
Construction Codes Supplement. The Energy Conservation Code-Residential
Provisions has no appendices.

101.10.1.1 Normative and Informative Appendices. Normative
Appendices A, B, C, D and G of ASHRAE 90.1, as amended by the
Energy Conservation Code Supplement, are adopted in the District of
Columbia as an integral part of the mandatory requirements of the Energy
Conservation Code-Commercial Provisions, which, for reasons of
convenience are placed apart from all other normative elements.
Informative Appendices E and F of ASHRAE 90.1 and informative notes
located within the Energy Conservation Code-Commercial Provisions
contain additional information and are not mandatory requirements.

101.10.1.2 Appendix Z. Appendix Z to the Energy Conservation Code-

Commercial Provisions provides an alternative compliance path. See
Section 101.10.6 +0