An Act

ENROLLED HOUSE
BILL NO. 3253 By: Osburn of the House

and

Pugh of the Senate

An Act relating to professions and occupations;
amending 59 0.S. 2021, Sections 46.3, 46.4, as
amended by Section 1, Chapter 62, 0.S.L. 2023, 46.7,
46.9, 46.10, 46.21, 46.21b, and 46.38 (59 0.S. Supp.
2023, Section 46.4), which relate to the State
Architectural and Registered Commercial Interior
Designers Act; changing certain definitions;
clarifying provisions for the Board of Governors of
the Licensed Architects, Landscape Architects and
Registered Commercial Interior Designers of Oklahoma;
adding powers and duties of the Board; clarifying
certain partnership terms and definitions;
implementing certificate renewal fee provisions;
adding cancellation language; adding exception
provision; adding definition of exempted buildings;
omitting certain terms from interior designer
provisions; amending 59 0.S. 2021, Sections 475.1,
475.2, 475.3, as amended by Section 1, Chapter 63,
0.S.L. 2023, 475.4, 475.6, 475.7, 475.8, 475.9,
475.10, 475.11, 475.12a, 475.12b, 475.12c, 475.13,
475.14, 475.15, 475.16, 475.17, 475.18, 475.19,
475.20, 475.21, 475.22, and 475.22a (59 0.S. Supp.
2023, Section 475.3), which relate to engineering and
land surveying; modifying license language; modifying
definitions; clarifying board member appointments;
adding board member qualifications; modifying board
power and authority; adding executive director
duties; expanding list of requirements for record of
proceedings; adding roster requirements; modifying
engineer and surveyor licensure requirements;
prescribing engineer and surveyor intern
certification regquirements; modifying structural
engineering qualifications; clarifying application



form requirements; stating examination provisions;
prescribing license design details; modifying license
renewal and replacement provisions; prescribing
disciplinary provisions; modifying notice and hearing
language; increasing administrative penalties;
clarifying conditions for practice for firms;
modifying licensing exceptions; repealing 59 0.S.
2021, Section 46.11, which relates to displaying an
architect license or certificate; and providing an
effective date.

SUBJECT: Professions and occupations
BE IT ENACTED BY THE PEOPLE OF THE STATE OF OKLAHOMA:

SECTION 1. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 46.3, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 46.3 As used in the State Architectural and Registered
Commercial Interior Designers Act:

1. "Architect" means any person who is licensed in the practice
of architecture in the State of Oklahoma as hereinafter defined;

2. "Practice of architecture" means rendering or offering to
render certain services, in connection with the design and
construction, enlargement or alteration of a building or a group of
buildings and the space surrounding such buildings, including
buildings which have as their principal purpose human occupancy Or
habitation. The services referred to include planning, providing
preliminary studies, designs, drawings, specifications,
investigations and—ether or technical submissions, the
administration of construction contracts, and the coordination of
any elements of technical submissions prepared by other consultants
including, as appropriate and without limitation, consulting
engineers and landscape architects; provided, that the practice of
architecture shall include such other professional services as may
be necessary for the rendering of or offering to render
architectural services.

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 2



The preparation of plans and specifications for the following

tasks is within the scope of practice of both architecture and

engineering:

a.

I

|®

site plans depicting the location and orientation of a
building on the site based on:

(1) a determination of the relationship of the
intended use with the environment, topography,
vegetation, climate, and geographic aspects, and

(2) the legal aspects of site development, including
setback requirements, zoning, and other legal
restrictions,

life safety plans and related codes analyses,

roof plans and details depicting the design of roof
system materials, components, drainage, slopes, and
directions and location of roof accessories and
equipment, not involving structural engineering
calculations,

design of shallow spread footing foundations, and

the incorporation of other design professionals'
depiction of building systems, including
architectural, structural, mechanical, electrical, and
plumbing systems into the design professionals' own
work, in:

(1) plan views,

(2) cross-sections depicting building components from
a hypothetical cut line through buildings, and

(3) the design of details of components and
assemblies;

3. "Registration" or "license" means a certificate of
registration or license issued by the Board. The definition of
"license" shall apply to those persons licensed under a practice
act. The definition of "registration” shall apply to those persons
registered under the title registered commercial interior designer
under this act;

ENR. H. B. NO.

3253 Page 3



n
TT

PR N S
I TUT T O

£ - £
[ S -

N3 ot 3o
O

o
SoCcLrroCc Ttoarc CUIo ooty

P Ny

"Building" means =

4.

a1l 1l o

any
shelter,

ot o
LJ(.A.J_ o

PN 73+ PRI N A T = +h o
LU Ly W I CTT o WL CTITOT T o CTITI T

= Al
(ST uavs

o
T T OUT O

£
structure used,

1
[ i g

Wt T Oy

or

to support,

or intended to be used,

enclose any use Oor occupancy

.
’

means the Board of Governors of the Licensed
Landscape Architects and Registered Commercial Interior

"Board"

Architects,

4

Designers of Oklahoma

"Certificate of authority" means the authorization granted

by the Board for persons to practice or offer to practice

architecture,

through a partnership,

or landscape architecture,

P BN
oo U 1T T IULlLy

£

limited liability company or limited

corporation,

liability partnership

T LTIty

4

"Certificate of title" means the authorization granted by

limited

liability company or limited liability partnership to use the title

registered commercial interior designer or any modification or

derivation of these terms

corporation,

P R R
oo uvCo 1T Uy

el

£ 2 v
ey 3 7

the Board for a partnership,

r

plans,

"Technical submissions" means drawings,

8.
specifications,

studies and any other technical reports or documents

landscape

which are issued in the course of practicing architecture,

architecture or registered commercial interior design with the

intent that they be considered as formal or final documents but

Technical submissions shall not include record drawings

n o

ol g oo o

Nt +a~ahna AT
ToTc——CceCr=Cax

o

ot iaal 1 S o

LI LT Ut UtTypPpLTCd L MLAllo

Dy
plans.

or prototypical

technical submissions may be further defined by

OO Lo o TUTTO

& S my oy

However,

4

Board rules

S A
[CTsaws

£ A2 vt A~ o
|\ SR s s S N 7 SR L O i B g e

PP

2
CIIC— ortoorrc

"Responsible control" means #£h

9.

o]

S A

L OITU S TCTU T & N S N7 i R Eiy WPl Nl W WPl U R Sy & R

i EENEEA PSRN

e aaa o]

Nnoramnmnal aaam~atzd o g A £ v~
PSSO T—SuptCE v STot—0T
A

=

%5 i Ny i I H WPl WPl W P 0 Sy @ g Sy

A At o2 1 A

PRV |
WO LT

o
=}

P IV ANPNE
o TOTIC T

r A

N

~

ER

et o]

oo

ot o
J_C\j_l_o LSS g

o

T TaoLr TIircocT O

O COTTItr

g A\ A\ NSl Uy @ R S S N W 4

nco

o
T T T TITIoCTXK

4

a s

reog oo

O I e I

o

N

el

n

I PN

Adizra e~ + 1

-] vrruartiial 11Ty = I S W By W ) Wl W Yy

PO AT UL &y

LS 1 5 g g my

\Z v Eapuap e )

+~

4

Anmm ey~ ] RSN ENE VN

v

o1 ot
oo CcCoT o Ccomnmc oo

r

PN NI SN S
A

ENC S S AT IeA e § T4 S appe i a) ) 3 gu 2y w) o) ey ey e )

1 andaon o

PN, NI SN S

T
a

S S i L W N S g

T oy

T CCT

o

at an Ao A
[CASIC T S AV L& S w S

P |

oo g

A o

PRSI
J_\_/\iu_LJ_\_/\.A. t/J_UJ_\_/b_)b_)_LUJ.J.U._L

ST 79 v~ e

r o

PSP
\SASTSIE RS S A )

T

|\ @ g oy

I

= = T = = ¥ A
ot
T

o
coTT™

13

~

wrh ot h

fa R EE oWt 2L & X B i n

=AY =4

Nt A A Ao~ o]
COoOTTTct o= T oSOt

o

A

rm o
TIThO

WITC TITCT T

TV o LTUlly

[S3 32w ay =

T

|\ g g

T

manoram

na

o

S A

n et oy

=

m

Sgoth o v
(SASAS AR ST ¥ A

1z r
O

I

o

I

A

oI T g Tt CTT T

o TTrTve ol T oorTaor

moT™TT

TaL

+ 1

.
T

ENEP SN I SNPE SR TP

TolTgo COopr T oL clirrcoc T TtorT

1 am Ao~

PN

ENE N AN I
& N S N7 g R Sy Wy

n LT FaNE
cTCTTTOoOIr OV

W

CcIIc
A
T

ctTcorCy

7

|\ g g

nco

Ao a
e CToT=O0ITS

o
[=)

v

FSIE P
S o ToTICT

v

N

v

ER

ot o

mm

PR —INE o
oo o ToO CommnmTc oo

r

-
Tr

I

S E i A W W S g

n o

o
T T CTITToTT

14

P SN T SN = 2N

WIT T CTT

Azl A~
oIV IICCES

n
[ e ny W i 4 & u

nt o

1ot o

CTIIC

T

O LT UL

TTCO

T IO C L It

Page 4

H. B. NO. 3253

ENR.



N S - R
L - T [ NN S N e ) u )

regis the——seatl;—signrature;—and—date the active and
personal management by a licensed architect, landscape architect, or
registered commercial interior designer of the firm's personnel and
practice, applying the required standard of care, to maintain
detailed knowledge over the design and technical decisions related
to the preparation and implementation of the professional services
to which the licensee or registrant affixes his or her seal,

signature, and date;

10. "Landscape architect”™ means a person licensed to practice
landscape architecture as provided in the State Architectural and
Registered Commercial Interior Designers Act;

11. "Landscape architecture" means the performance of
professional services defined as teaching, consultations,
investigations, reconnaissance, research, planning, design,
preparation of construction drawings and specifications,
construction observation and the coordination of any elements of
technical submissions prepared by others in connection with the
planning and arranging of land and the elements thereon for public
and private use and enjoyment, including the design and layout of
roadways, service areas, parking areas, walkways, steps, ramps,
pools, parks, parkways, trails and recreational areas, the location
and site of improvements including buildings and other structures,
and the grading of the land, surface and subsoil drainage, erosion
control, planting, reforestation, and the preservation of the
natural landscape, in accordance with accepted professional
standards, and to the extent that the dominant purpose of such
services or creative works is the preservation, conservation,
enhancement, or determination of proper land uses, natural land
features, ground cover and plantings, or naturalistic and aesthetic
values.

The practice of landscape architecture shall include the
location and arrangement of tangible objects and features as are
incidental and necessary to the purpose outlined for landscape
architecture. The practice of landscape architecture shall not
include the design of structures or facilities with separate and
self-contained purposes for habitation or industry, or the design of
public streets, highways, utilities, storm and sanitary sewers and
sewage treatment facilities, that are statutorily defined as the
practice of engineering or architecture;

12. "Code" means the nationally recognized codes adopted by the
Uniform Building Code Commission of the State of Oklahoma;

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 5



4+

13. = i i i teiat™ "Building official" means
the eff+ 1 —responsik

other designated authority, or duly authorized representative
charged with the administration and enforcement of the building code
as implemented by the local, municipal or county jurisdiction in
which a building is located. Where no building code has been
adopted by the local, municipal or county jurisdiction, the
apptieabte building official shall be defined as the State Fire
Marshal;

PP - P Lo PN I N £ o+ adeopted officer
o LT 1 ».)LJUJ.J.U_I_ [ ) Ji S N I (.A.LJLJ_L_L\./(.AL,_L\JJ.J. g CTIT &AW LWy (AL W 4

14. "Registered commercial interior designer" means a person
recognized by this state who is registered, qualified by examination
and meeting all the requirements set forth in the State
Architectural and Registered Commercial Interior Designers Act and
the Board's rules;

15. "Plans" means technical documents issued by the licensed
and/or registered professionals intended to meet all current and
applicable codes as adopted by the Uniform Building Code Commission
of the State of Oklahoma, other statutory codes and applicable
federal codes and which shall be submitted to all required building
code and/or permit offices required by the State of Oklahoma,
county, municipal and/or federal government;

16. "Equivalent standards" means those standards adopted by the
Board intended to be used as alternative equivalents to determine
competency for education, training and testing for licensing
architects and/or landscape architects and registering commercial
interior designers and for complying with the Military Service
Occupation, Education and Credentialing Act for military personnel
and their spouses;

17. "Commercial interior design" means the rendering of or the
offering to render designs, consultations, studies, planning,
drawings, specifications, contract documents or other technical
submissions and the administration of interior construction and
contracts relating to nonstructural interior construction by a
registered commercial interior designer in a new constructed or
existing building when the core and shell elements are not going to
be changed;

18. "Nonstructural commercial interior construction" means the

construction of elements which do not include exterior components of
a building such as exterior walls, any load-bearing wall, any load-

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 6



bearing column or any other load-bearing elements of a building
essential to the structural integrity of the building such as wind
loads and seismic loads and to any element which must be designed
for wind loads and seismic loads; and

19. "Fire and life safety systems" means those systems and
construction that pertain to fire and life safety protection, such
as fire sprinklers, fire alarms, smoke evacuation systems, fire
walls, fire barriers or smoke barriers as defined by the current
International Building Code adopted by the Oklahoma Uniform Building
Code Commission.

The definitions in the State Architectural and Registered
Commercial Interior Designers Act shall have the same meaning when
applicable to any rule promulgated pursuant to such act.

SECTION 2. AMENDATORY 59 0.S5. 2021, Section 46.4, as
amended by Section 1, Chapter 62, 0.S.L. 2023 (59 0.S. Supp. 2023,
Section 46.4), is amended to read as follows:

Section 46.4 There is hereby re-created, to continue until July
1, 2026, in accordance with the provisions of the Oklahoma Sunset
Law, a board to be known as the "Board of Governors of the Licensed
Architects, Landscape Architects and Registered Commercial Interior
Designers of Oklahoma", hereinafter referred to as the Board. The
Board shall be composed of eleven (11) members including six persons
who are duly licensed to practice architecture and are in good
standing in this state, two persons who are duly licensed to
practice landscape architecture and are in good standing in this
state, two persons who are registered commercial interior designers
and who are active and in good standing and one lay member. Each
member of the Board shall be a qualified elector of this state, and
the architect, landscape architect and registered commercial
interior designer members shall have had five (5) years' licensing
or registration experience as the professional position requires in
this state. Re-creation of the Board shall not alter existing

staggered terms. Board members, other than the lay member, shall be
appointed for a period of five (5) years +thereafter;—provided;—that
n Ty vy~ a7 ~fFL "~ 1 e £ £~ £ sz I 1o A
J.J.\JL_LL_LJ.J.& [ N N NI S N S R [N 2 NN Ny & R S OO CT T T T C T A\ A\ N . E W ey |\ (_/LJ.l_YUJ.l\_, AR T4 = ) (&
member—of +the BoardoenMay3+—3957. A member may be reappointed to

succeed sueh—membership themselves. The licensed architect,
landscape architect or the registered commercial interior designer
members may be appointed by the Governor from a list of nominees
submitted by respective professional societies of this state.
Membership in a professional society shall not be a prerequisite to

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 7



appointment to the Board. The lay member of the Board shall be
appointed by the Governor to a term coterminous with that of the
Governor. The lay member shall serve at the pleasure of the
Governor. Previdedy All board members, including the lay member,
may continue to serve after the expiration of £he their term ef—+the
member until such time as a successor is appointed. Vacancies which
may occur in the membership of the Board shall be filled by
appointment by the Governor. Each person who has been appointed to
fill a vacancy shall serve for the remainder of the term for which
the member the person shall succeed was appointed and until a
successor, in turn, has been appointed and shall have qualified.
Each member of the Board, before entering upon the discharge of the
duties of the member, shall make and file with the Secretary of
State a written ocath or affirmation for the faithful discharge of
official duties. Each member of the Board amd—staff shall be
reimbursed for travel expenses pursuant to the State Travel
Reimbursement Act.

SECTION 3. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 46.7, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 46.7 A. In addition to the other powers and duties
imposed by law, the Board shall have the power and duty to:

1. Prescribe such rules and to make such orders, as it may deem
necessary or expedient in the performance of its duties;

2. Prepare, conduct, and grade examinations of persons who
shall apply for the issuance of licenses and registrations to them,
and to promulgate such rules with reference thereto as it may deem
proper as a portion used to determine competency for the issuance of
licenses or registrations;

3. Work with nationally recognized licensing and registration
organizations to prepare, conduct, and grade examinations, written
or oral, of persons who shall apply for the issuance of licenses or
registrations;

4. Determine the satisfactory passing score on examinations and
issue licenses and registrations to persons who shall have passed

examinations, or who shall otherwise be entitled thereto;

5. Determine eligibility for licenses and certificates of
authority and issue them;

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 8



6. Determine eligibility for registration as a registered
commercial interior designer and for certificate of title and issue
them;

7. Promulgate rules to govern the issuing of reciprocal
licenses and registrations;

8. Upon good cause shown, as hereinafter provided, deny the
issuance of a license, registration, certificate of authority or
certificate of title or suspend, revoke, refuse to renew or issue
probation orders for licenses or registrations, and/or require
additional educational coursework and determine when the objectives
have been met;

9. Upon proper showing, reinstate or conditionally reinstate
licenses, registrations, certificates of title or certificates of
authority previously issued;

10. Review, affirm, reverse, vacate or modify its order with
respect to any such denial, suspension, revocation, probation and/or
educational coursework requirements or refusal to renew;

11. Prescribe rules governing proceedings for the denial of
issuance of a license, registration, certificate of authority or
certificate of title, suspension, revocation or refusal to renew, to
issue probation orders and/or require additional educational
coursework and determine when the objectives have been met for
cause, and reinstate them;

12. Prescribe such penalties, as it may deem proper, to be
assessed against holders of licenses, registrations, certificates of
authority or certificates of title for the failure to pay the
biennial fee hereinafter provided for;

13. Levy civil penalties plus the legal costs incurred by the
Board to prosecute the case against any person or entity who shall
violate any of the provisions of the State Architectural and
Registered Commercial Interior Designers Act, or any rule
promulgated pursuant thereto;

14. Obtain an office, secure such facilities, and employ,
direct, discharge and define the duties and set the salaries of such
office personnel and set the salaries of such unclassified and
exempt office personnel as deemed necessary by the Board;

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 9



15. 1Initiate disciplinary action, prosecute and seek
injunctions against any person or entity who has violated any of the
provisions of the State Architectural and Registered Commercial
Interior Designers Act or any rule of the Board promulgated pursuant
to said act and against the owner/developer of the building type not
exempt;

16. Investigate alleged violations of the State Architectural
and Registered Commercial Interior Designers Act or of the rules,
orders or final decisions of the Board;

17. Promulgate rules of conduct governing the practice of
licensed architects, landscape architects and registered commercial
interior designers;

18. Keep accurate and complete records of proceedings, and
certify the same as may be appropriate;

19. Whenever it deems it appropriate, confer with the Attorney
General or the Attorney General's assistants in connection with all
legal matters and questions. The Board may also retain an attorney
who is licensed to practice law in this state. The attorney shall
serve at the pleasure of the Board for such compensation as may be
provided by the Board. The attorney shall advise the Board and
perform legal services for the Board with respect to any matters
properly before the Board. In addition to the above, the Board may
employ hearing examiners to conduct administrative hearings under
the provisions of the Administrative Procedures Act;

20. Prescribe by rules, fees to be charged as required by this
act;

21. Adopt rules providing for a program of continuing education
in order to ensure that all licensed architects or landscape
architects and registered commercial interior designers remain
informed of those technical and professional subjects that the Board
deems appropriate. The Board may by rule describe the methods by
which the requirements of such program may be satisfied. Failure to
meet such requirements of continuing education shall result in
nonrenewal of the license issued to the architect or landscape
architect or nonrenewal of the registration issued to the registered
commercial interior designer;

22. Adopt rules regarding requirements for intern development
as a prerequisite for licensure or registration;

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 10



23. Give scholarships, as determined by the Board, to an
individual or individuals advancing toward obtaining an accredited
National Architectural Accreditation Board, Landscape Architectural
Accreditation Board or Council for Interior Design Accreditation
degree in one of these three professions in an Oklahoma higher
education institution; and

24. Take such other action as may be reasonably necessary or
appropriate to effectuate the State Architectural and Registered
Commercial Interior Designers Act. The Board may, at its

discretion, contract with other state agencies and nonprofit
corporations for the endowment, management, and administration of
scholarships. The requirements of such scholarships shall be
determined by the Board. However, nothing contained herein shall be
construed as requiring the Board to endow or award any scholarship.

B. The Board may use its funds to establish and conduct
instructional programs for persons who are currently licensed under
this act, persons seeking licensure, as well as refresher courses
for persons interested in obtaining adequate instruction or programs
of study to qualify them for licensure to practice. The Board may
expend its funds for these purposes and may conduct, sponsor, and
arrange for instructional programs and may carry out instructional
programs through extension courses or other media. The Board may
enter into plans or agreements with community colleges, public or
private institutions of higher learning, the State Board of
Education, the Oklahoma Department of Career and Technology
Education, or nonprofit organizations for the purpose of planning,
scheduling or arranging courses, instruction, extension courses, or
assisting in obtaining courses of study or programs in the fields of
architecture, landscape architecture, or commercial interior design.
The Board shall encourage the educational institutions in Oklahoma
to offer courses necessary to complete the educational requirements
of Section 46.1 et seqg. of this title. For the purpose of carrying
out these objectives, the Board may adopt rules as may be necessary
for educational programs, instruction, extension services or for
entering into plans or contracts with persons or educational
institutions and the Oklahoma Department of Career and Technology
Education.

SECTION 4. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 46.9, is
amended to read as follows:

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 11



Section 46.9 A. The practice of architecture or landscape
architecture or offering to practice these professions for others by
persons licensed under this act through a partnership, fi=ms
asseetatieon; corporation, limited liability company or limited
liability partnership as directors, partners, officers,
shareholders, emptoyeesy; managers, members or principals is
permitted, subject to the provisions of the State Architectural and
Registered Commercial Interior Designers Act, provided:

1. One or more of the directors, partners, officers,
shareholders, managers, members or principals of said partnership,
octationy corporation, limited liability company or limited
o ey a1 fnr +1
W Mb_LJ.J.\.j J_\,utlullu_LM_L\, i L N T
ally responsible for the entity
A corporation, limited

y partnership;

g—=
docisio“s leg
of said partnershlp, firm—asseoeiatie
liability company or limited liabilit

2. Such director, partner, officer, shareholder, manager,
member or principal is duly licensed under the State Architectural
and Registered Commercial Interior Designers Act; and

B

0]
q
|__|.
ar

3 AT e PP I IS O £ o PR

. I 11 t/\./J_L)UJ.J.J.J.\.a [S N & u SR W § t/uJ_ L./J.J.\./J_L_)J.l_l_t/, J__LJ_J.lI., (&) A2 (& _LUJ.J.,

P E gy I e I T A I U SO I PN I I I P, AN, I g
\./\J-LtJ\J.Lul—_Lull, [ S ) ) i Sy G PR W ) [ S Sy @ I NI S i l__y \./\Jllltlull A\ [ S ) ) R S U PR W ) [ S Sy @ I NI S S L,_Y
N, TN S, I ey I [ A, A I £+ O~ D Uy N o foac ot ar o
t/uJ_ L_,J.J.\_,J_g_)J.L_I_t/ WIT I T L |y Ay [NV NEP i G5 R S . T | \PI R ) L.,_Y [ S N CITI T o J:/J_UJ_\./UU_LUJ.J.U
1 + at+ N+ N 3~ 13 ~ n o = 11 A 1 + Q4+ ~ Aro~hha + PSRN | A

i S T o C AT &7 N S ) [ E L WL WSl i W A A W LW I B W B e LS i By T T J7 A W SN NP R A ) WS NP W U U R Sy @ R ¥ uLw s

4-— Said partnership, firm—asseciatieny corporation, limited
liability company or limited liability partnership has been issued a
certificate of authority by the Board.

B. The Board shall have the power to issue, revoke, deny, or
refuse to renew a certificate of authority for a partnership, fEems
asSeetatien; corporation, limited liability company or limited
liability partnership as provided for in the State Architectural and
Registered Commercial Interior Designers Act.

C. A partnership, firm—asseeiatieny corporation, limited
liability company or limited liability partnership desiring to
practice architecture or landscape architecture shall file with the
Board an application for a certificate of authority, and pay all
fees, for each office location performing work on Oklahoma projects
on a form approved by the Board which shall include the names,
addresses, state of licensure and license number of all partners,
directors, officers, members, managers or principals of the

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 12



partnership, firm—asseeiatieons corporation, limited liability
company or limited liability partnership legally responsible for the
entity's practice. The form shall name an individual having the
practice of architecture in such person's charge who is a director,
partner, officer, member, manager or principal. The person shall be
duly licensed as an architect to practice architecture or licensed
as a landscape architect to practice landscape architecture in this
state through said partnership, firm—asseeiatiens corporation,
limited liability company or limited liability partnership legally
responsible for the entity's practice or services offered and other
information required by the Board. In the event there shall be a
change in any of these persons during the term of the certification,
such change shall be filed with the Board within thirty (30) days
after the effective date of said change. 1If all of the requirements
of this section and the Board's current rules have been met, the
Board shall issue a certificate of authority to such partnership,
firmr—asseoeiatieonys corporation, limited liability company or limited
liability partnership.

D. Any other person licensed pursuant to the State
Architectural and Registered Commercial Interior Designers Act, not
practicing these professions as a partnership, firm—asseeciationy
corporation, limited liability company or limited liability
partnership, shall practice as an individual.

E. No such partnership, firm—asseeiatieony corporation, limited
liability company or limited liability partnership shall be relieved
of responsibility for the conduct or acts of its agents, employees,
partners, directors, officers, managers, members or principals by
reason of its compliance with the provisions of this section, or
shall any individual practicing these professions be relieved of
responsibility for professional services performed as an individual
by reason of such person's employment or relationship with such
partnership, firm—asseeiatien; corporation, limited liability
company or limited liability partnership.

F. The Secretary of State shall not issue a certificate of
incorporation or register a foreign corporation or any other entity
which includes among the objectives for which it is established any
of the words "Architect", "Architectural", "Architecture",
"Landscape Architect", "Landscape Architecture" or any modification
or derivation of these words, unless the Board has issued for said
applicant either a certificate of authority for an entity, or a
letter indicating eligibility for an exemption pursuant to the State
Architectural and Registered Commercial Interior Designers Act. The

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 13



entity applying shall supply such certificate or letter from the
Board with its application for incorporation or registration.

G. The Secretary of State shall not register any trade name or
service mark which includes such words, as set forth in subsection F
of this section, or modifications or derivatives thereof in its firm
name or logotype except those entities or individuals holding
certificates of authority issued under the provisions of this
section or letters of eligibility issued by the Board.

H. The use of the title "Registered Commercial Interior
Designer" by a partnership, firmy—asseeiatien; corporation, limited
liability company or limited liability partnership is allowed to
those entities listed, provided:

1. One or more of the directors, partners, officers,
shareholders, members, managers or principals is registered with the
Board as a registered commercial interior designer and is in good
standing with the Board; and

2. The partnership, firm—asseeiatieony corporation, limited
liability company or limited liability partnership has been issued a
certificate of title by the Board.

I. The Board shall have the power to issue, revoke, deny or
refuse to renew a certificate of title for a partnership, firms
asseeiatieny corporation, limited liability company or limited
liability partnership as provided for in the State Architectural and
Registered Commercial Interior Designers Act.

J. A partnership, firm—asseeiationsy corporation, limited
liability company or limited liability partnership shall file with
the Board an application for a certificate of title on a form
approved by the Board which shall include the names, addresses,
state of registration and registration number of all directors,
partners, officers, shareholders, members, managers, or principals
of the partnership, firm—asseeiatioeny corporation, limited
liability company or limited liability partnership. In the event
there shall be a replacement of any of these persons during the term
of certification, the change shall be filed with the Board within
thirty (30) days after the effective date of the change. If all the
requirements of this section, this act and the current rules of the
Board have been met, the Board shall issue a certificate of title to
such partnership, firm—asseeiation; corporation, limited liability
company or limited liability partnership.

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 14



K. The Secretary of State shall not issue a certificate of
incorporation or register a foreign corporation or any other entity
which includes among the objectives for which it is established any
of the words "Registered Commercial Interior Designer" or any
modification or derivation of these words, unless the Board has
issued for the applicant either a certificate of title for an
entity, or a letter indicating the eligibility for an exemption
pursuant to the State Architectural and Registered Commercial
Interior Designers Act. The firm applying shall supply such
certificate of title or letter from the Board with its application
for incorporation or registration.

L. The Secretary of State shall not register any trade name or
service mark which includes such words as set forth in subsection K
of this section, or modification or derivatives thereof in its firm
name or logotype except those entities or individuals holding
certificates of title issued under the provisions of this section or
letters of eligibility issued by the Board.

M. Upon application for renewal and upon compliance with the
provisions of the State Architectural and Registered Commercial
Interior Designers Act and the rules of the Board, a certificate of
title shall be renewed as provided in this act.

N. Upon application for renewal and upon compliance with the
provisions of the State Architectural and Registered Commercial
Interior Designers Act and the rules of the Board, a certificate of
authority shall be renewed as provided in this act.

SECTION 5. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 46.10, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 46.10 A. Every licensed architect, landscape architect
and, registered commercial interior designer, partnership,
corporation, limited liability company, or limited liability
partnership shall pay to the Board a renewal fee as prescribed by
the rules of the Board prior to or on June 30 of odd years. No
license, registration, certificate of authority, or certificate of
title shall be issued or renewed for longer than two (2) years.
Upon receipt of the fee, the Board shall issue a renewal of—the
Heense—or—registratien, which shall authorize the person,
partnership, corporation, limited liability company, or limited
liability partnership to practice architecture, landscape

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 15



architecture or use the title registered commercial interior
designer, as the case may be, in this state.

B. The license of an architect or landscape architect or the
registration of a registered commercial interior designer which has
been canceled by the Board for nonpayment of dues may be renewed at
any time within three (3) years from the date of the cancellation,

£ +1h ocaneanl ]l ot 0 A S A Yﬂa-.nk ol a hoass 2N PN NN e BT —R i = + 2 m £
O [ i wy 2L & S i 5 N7 Nl Ei Sy @ S Ui S N i 8 Tt TT1ICTT AAYAY = w 5 ITTrV T T8 TTT t/ [ |3 (SR i wy (S p g 4wy . =
roadnatat At oA A 11 c0c0ana LS P PvE B Ik VAL i PN N =N ISEEW=E2N Y'\/'q A
LT O I To COCTITTTITC T ITOT [ i LTI T TITTIOS T A= .LCKJLLJ C LT IUIT LJCCLL AT Y] tJC ATy
+ +1h T+ + £ +1 + +
together—withpayment—of—+the—amount—of and any penalties

have—been prescribed by the Board. If a license or registration,
initially granted by the State of Oklahoma that was the sole license
of a professional, remains canceled for a period exceeding three (3)
consecutive years, it shaldl—smot may be reinstated uwnltess—the

14 oc0ana LS 1o S+ P JoE T 2 I~ N B ENEE - ENE T ~

J E i W) W B ATND ) W ) A J_\.,\.j_l_o |SP Sy @ R i gy Wy TTTOO CTOINCTTT UJ_ O o TIT T T O T Ay \SPA Ny wy J_ (&8 \1U_LLI -

= sub'ect to Board rev1ew r o S d A S O Nt et N SN o £
j g aIT Ay €% 11 ) 1) A S Ry Y @ A WP S N A O I o T T O UUTo CTTUITCO OO e

+h T Ada 79 Ao on o masz tgarvaeandt A o moacr N nr ralh A Iy

T LTI TV OO T T A @ e i lllu_y AL S S @ i i AT & ) ulu._y 1T tJ_LCOLzJ_ (== AN W § Ly LSS i iy

Beard. Upon review, the Board may prescribe a test or an
examination in order to determine continued competency of the
licensee or registrant. An individual who is licensed in another
jurisdiction and whose Oklahoma license has been canceled for a
period exceeding three (3) consecutive years may reapply as
prescribed in the rules of the Board. A partnership, fErmy
asseeiation; corporation, limited liability company or limited
liability partnership shatd—pay—te—the Boardthe fee preseribed—=
may reinstate a certificate of authority or a certificate of title

nd
T

canceled for a period exceeding three (3) years in the manner
provided by the rules of the Board fer—the—renewal—of—the

PP S R = PP £ et s I S R =l RPN £ + 34+ 7 vy ook

NSV N U S S T A L/LUL.LL\JJ__LL._Y A NSV S U S S T A\ T LS ) [ S N [SawS T
Bartrmarald o~ £ PP P S cormaratian IR I P T B P P e I I
tJ()._L L,llC_LOLJ._LtJ, J_J_J_lll, ().OOU\/_L().L,_LULII \/U_LtJU_L().L,_LULII [ N ) Sy S WSl W 8 _L_L(,ILJ_L_L_LK,_Y
ST <7 RV I VN T N R e T N B S NN Y S NN 2Pl N I

\/UllltJ().ll A\ = [ S ) ) i A8 [ A iy @ I N J S S Sy Wy tJ()._L k,llC_LOlL_LtJ-

SECTION 6. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 2021, Section 46.21, 1is

amended to read as follows:

Section 46.21 A. The State Architectural and Registered
Commercial Interior Designers Act shall not apply to any persons,
firms, corporations, limited liability companies or limited
liability partnerships that do not hold a license, registration or
certification in any jurisdiction for exempted Code Use Groups
defined by the State Architectural and Registered Commercial
Interior Designers Act, providing such persons and/or entities shall
not represent such person or entity to be an architect or other
title of profession or business using a form of the word,

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 16



"Architect". This act shall not prevent such persons and/or
entities from advertising or selling their services.

Any architect, landscape architect or registered commercial
interior designer from any jurisdiction that contracts, provides or
holds out to the public that they are able to provide professional
services in Oklahoma is required to hold a license, registration or
certificate of authority or certificate of title as needed from the
Board, even on exempt Code Use Groups, and an architect or landscape
architect is required to sign, seal and date all construction
documents and technical submissions.

B. Nothing in this act shall be construed to prevent the
preparation of technical submissions or the administration of
construction contracts by employees of a person or entity lawfully
engaged in the practice of architecture when such employees are
acting under the responsible control of a licensed architect.

C. The following shall govern design competitions in the state:

1. ©Nothing in this act shall prohibit a person or firm from
participating in an architectural design competition involving only
architectural programming, planning, schematic design or design
development information provided to a sponsor; and

2. The competition winner, prior to seeking the commission for
architectural services on the proposed project, shall apply for
licensing in this state within ten (10) days of notification of
winning the competition and complete the process within thirty (30)
days.

D. Nothing in this act shall prohibit an officer or employee of
the United States Armed Forces or an employee of the United States
government from practicing within the scope of their authority and
employment.

SECTION 7. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 46.21b, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 46.21b A. An architect shall be required to plan,
design and prepare plans and specifications for the following Code
Use Groups except where specifically exempt from the provisions of
the State Architectural and Registered Commercial Interior Designers
Act. All Code Use Groups in this section are defined by the current
International Building Code.

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 17



B. The construction, addition or alteration of a building of
any size or occupancy in the following Code Use Groups shall be
subject to the provisions of the State Architectural and Registered
Commercial Interior Designers Act:

1. Code Use Group I - Institutional;

2. Code Use Group R-2 - Residential, limited to dormitories,
fraternities and sororities, and monasteries and convents;

3. Code Use Group A-1 Assembly and theaters;

4. Code Use Group A-4 Assembly, arenas and courts;

5. Code Use Group A-5
and

Assembly, bleachers and grandstands;

6. Buildings for which the designated Code Use Group changes
are not exempt from the State Architectural and Registered
Commercial Interior Designers Act.

C. The following shall be exempt from the provisions of the
State Architectural and Registered Commercial Interior Designers
Act; provided that, for the purposes of this subsection, a basement
is not to be counted as a story for the purpose of counting stories
of a building for height regulations:

1. The construction, addition or alteration of a building no
more than two stories in height and with a code-defined occupancy of
no more than fifty (50) persons for the Code Use Groups A-2 and A-3
- Assembly and Code Use Group E - Education;

2. The construction, addition or alteration of a building no
more than two stories in height and no more than sixty-four
transient lodging units per building for the Code Use Group R1 -
Residential, including, but not limited to, hotels and motels;

3. The construction, addition or alteration of a building no
more than two stories in height and with a gross square footage not
exceeding one hundred thousand (100,000) in the Code Use Group B -
Business;

4. The construction, addition or alteration of a building no
more than two stories in height and with a gross square footage not

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 18



exceeding two hundred thousand (200,000) in the Code Use Group M -
Mercantile; arnéd

5. The construction, addition or alteration of a building no
more than two stories in height in the following Code Use Groups or
buildings:

a. Code Use Group U - Utility,

b. Code Use Group F - Factory and Industrial,

c. Code Use Group H - High hazard,

d. Code Use Group S - Storage,

e. Code Use Group R2 - Residential, including apartments

containing no more than thirty-two dwelling units or
thirty-two guest units per building,

f. Code Use Groups R3 and R4 - Residential,

g. all buildings used by a municipality, county, state,
public trust, public agency or the federal government
with a construction value under One Hundred Fifty-
eight Thousand Dollars ($158,000.00),

h. incidental buildings or appurtenances associated with
paragraphs 1 through 5 of this subsection, and

i. all uninhabitable, privately owned agricultural
buildings; and
6. Single or two-family residential dwellings, as defined by
the International Residential Code adopted by the Oklahoma Uniform
Building Code Commission.

D. The addition, renovation or alteration of buildings where
the use was exempt as new construction shall remain exempt if the
Code Use Group does not change.

E. Upgrades, repairs, replacements and changes made on projects
in Code Use Groups found in this title requiring an architect are
exempt from hiring an architect if the upgrades, repairs,
replacements or changes do not affect the existing primary
structural, mechanical, or electrical systems, life-safety systems,

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 19



fire codes or exit passageways and/or egress as determined by the
apptieakte building official having jurisdiction.

SECTION 8. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 46.38, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 46.38 A. Except as otherwise provided in the State
Architectural and Registered Commercial Interior Designers Act, no
registration shall be issued to any person to represent that the
person is a "registered commercial interior designer"™ nor shall any
person be allowed to use the term unless the person pays to the
Board the required fees and/or penalties if applicable as
established by the rules of the Board and:

1. Holds an accredited professional degree in interior design
from an interior design program accredited by the Council for
Interior Design Accreditation or its successor, or from an interior
design program determined by the Board to be substantially
equivalent to an accredited program;

2. Provides proof of a minimum of two (2) years of full-time
diversified and appropriate experience within established standards
as the Board shall prescribe; and

3. Provides to the Board proof of passage of the examination
administered by the Council for Interior Design Qualification or its
successor or an equivalent examination as determined by the Board.

B. The Board may waive the requirements of the State
Architectural and Registered Commercial Interior Designers Act for
an individual who holds a current valid registration from another
state, jurisdiction or foreign country where the requirements for
registration are substantially equivalent to those required for
registration in this state and pays the required fees and/or
penalties, if applicable, to the Board.

C. This section does not apply to a person licensed to practice
architecture pursuant to the laws of this state.

D. Nothing in this act shall be construed to authorize the
Board to regulate or prohibit persons who are rendering interior
design services and are not registered commercial interior designers
under the provisions of this act or to adopt regulations that would
exceed the powers and responsibilities expressly authorized under
this act.

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 20



E. Certificate of title shall be subject to the following:

1. The use of the title "Registered Commercial Interior
Designer" by a partnership, firm—asseeiatieny corporation, limited
liability company or limited liability partnership is allowed to
those entities listed, provided:

a. one or more of the directors, partners, officers,
shareholders, members, managers, or principals is a
registered commercial interior designer and is in good
standing with the Board, and

b. the partnership, firm—asseeiatien; corporation,
limited liability company or limited liability
partnership has been issued a certificate of title by
the Board;

2. The Board shall have the power to issue, revoke, deny or
refuse to renew a certificate of title for a partnership, firms
asseetatieon; corporation, limited liability company or limited
liability partnership as provided for in this act;

3. A partnership, firm—asseeiatieny corporation, limited
liability company or limited liability partnership shall file with
the Board an application for a certificate of title on a form
approved by the Board which shall include the names, addresses,
state of registration and registration number of all directors,
partners, officers, shareholders, members, managers or principals of
the partnership, firm—asseeiatieny corporation, limited liability
company or limited liability partnership. In the event there shall
be a change in any of these persons during the term of
certification, the change shall be filed with the Board within
thirty (30) days after the effective date of the change. If all the
requirements of this section and the Board's current rules have been
met, the Board shall issue a certificate of title to the
partnership, firm—asseeiatien; corporation, limited liability
company or limited liability partnership;

4. The Secretary of State shall not issue a certificate of
incorporation or register a foreign corporation or any other entity
which includes among the objectives for which it is established the
words "Registered Commercial Interior Designer" or any modification
or derivation of these words, unless the Board has issued for the
applicant either a certificate of title for an entity, or a letter

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 21



indicating the eligibility for an exemption pursuant to the
requirements of this act. The firm applying shall supply the
certificate of title or letter from the Board with its application
for incorporation or registration;

5. The Secretary of State shall not register any trade name or
service mark which includes such words as set forth in paragraph 4
of this subsection, or modification or derivatives thereof in its
firm name or logotype except those entities or individuals holding
certificates of title issued under the provisions of this section or
letters of eligibility issued by the Board; and

6. Upon application for renewal and upon compliance with the
provisions of this act and the rules of the Board, a certificate of
title shall be renewed as provided by this act.

F. ©No registration for registered commercial interior designers
or a certificate of title for a partnership, firm—association;
corporation, limited liability company or limited liability
partnership, shall be issued or renewed for longer than two (2)
years. A registration or certificate of title may be renewed upon
application, compliance with the rules of the Board and payment of
fees prior to or on June 30 of alternate years. The registration
for registered commercial interior designers shall begin July 1,
2007, and shall end June 30, 2009, unless renewed every two (2)
years thereafter. A new registration to replace a lost, destroyed
or mutilated registration shall be issued by the Board upon payment
of a fee established in accordance with the rules of the Board.

SECTION 9. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.1, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.1 1In order to safeguard life, health and property,
and to promote the public welfare, the practice of engineering and
the practice of +amd surveying in this state are hereby declared to
be subject to regulation in the public interest. It shall be
unlawful for any person or entity to practice or to offer to
practice engineering er—3and and/or surveying in this state, as
defined in the provisions of Seetien 4751t —-et——seg—ef this £itlte
act, or to use in connection with any name or otherwise assume or
advertise any title or description tending to convey the impression
that anypersen—is—an they are a licensed engineer, professional
engineer, professional structural engineer, dand a licensed surveyor
e¥ and/or professional damd surveyor, unless such person has been
duly licensed e¥, authorized, or is exempt under the provisions of

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 22



Seetion—4+5+—+—et—seg—of this £it+e act. The practice of
engineering or damd surveying shall be deemed a privilege granted by
the state through the State Board of Licensure for Professional
Engineers and Eand Surveyors, based on the qualifications of the
individual as evidenced by a eertifiecate—eofItieensure license, which
shall not be transferable.

SECTION 10. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.2, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.2 As used in Seetion 4751 et-seg—of this £itlte
act:

g Sg—ata v oG SET¥2 Snwas 2w e > S S e
ahrd—enginecering experiencer 1s qualified to practice engineering by

reason of engineering education, training, experience, and
examination in the application of engineering principles and the
interpretation of engineering data and is qualified, after meeting
the requirements of Seetien—4+5+—I+—et—seg—oF this +itd+e act and the
regulations issued by the Board pursuant thereto, to be duly
licensed as a professional engineer by the Board and engage in the

practice of engineering;

" "

3+~ "Professional Structural Engineer", ‘P B "—"S =" "P.E.,
S.E." or "S.E." means an individual who has been duly licensed as a
professional engineer by the Board, and who has been further
authorized by the Board to use the title Professional Structural
Engineer, P.E. S.E., or S.E., and perform structural engineering
analysis and design services for significant structures based upon
education, experience and examinations as described in subseetionb
ef Section 3+ 475.12c of this aef£ title. For purposes of this

definition, the term "significant structures" may bedefined by
Board—rutes—provided;—however;—sueh—definitieon shall not include any

structure that is a residential structure;

4 —Engineer—interna™ 3. "Engineer Intern”" or "E.I." means a
person who complies with the requirement for education and has

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 23



passed an examination in the fundamental engineering subjects, as
provided in Seetien4+5-t—et—seg—of this £itdle act and the
regulations issued by the Board pursuant thereto;

5+ 4. "Practice of engineering" means any service or creative
work requiring engineering education, training and experience in the
application of engineering principles and the interpretation of
engineering data to engineering activities, including the
engineering design of buildings, structures, products, machines,
processes, and systems, that may potentially impact the life,
health, property and welfare of the public. The services may
include, but are not limited to, suveh serwviee '

0]
q
3
q
d
q
[8))

= consuttation

ﬁi

A O
(
<
o))
|,__|
[or

- - - C)
qr
|.._|
q
P

i

i

o]
©
|__|
o]
i
|__|
o]
©
[0)]
ar
@
[OR
|__|
[(
[0)]

i

Je— PTG P ES et e Bamt ana

. LA = S e IT ll\j_l_ll _L_Lll\j UtJ_Lll_LUllO,

] + 1 KRN NN S RN r patzd Ay I SR S PN PN T N
. CTIT _LllotJC\/k,_Lull A\ = 1OV I TV A - CUIT o C IO OC TIUIT i S N LSS iy

q
P
(o,
|__|
P
q
q
I
l__l
P
(o,
B
q
HO
q
I
ar
0]
q
I
l__l
l__l

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 24



ary—eof—whieh—embraces—suveh providing planning, studies, designs,
design coordination, drawings, specifications, and other technical
submissions; engineering reports or material developed in connection
with expert witness testimony or anticipated testimony;
commissioning of engineered systems; and performing surveying that
is incidental to the practice of engineering and reviewing
construction or other design products for the purposes of monitoring
compliance with drawings and specifications related to engineered
works. Surveying incidental to the practice of engineering excludes
the surveying of real property for the establishment or
determination of land boundaries, rights-of-way, easements, and the
dependent or independent surveys or resurveys of the United States
Public Land Survey System and is limited to conducting field
measurements to supplement the documentation of existing conditions.
Unless a Professional Surveyor has provided the professional
engineer with geocentric/geodetic control coordinates which meet the
accuracy standards set forth in OAC 245:15-13-2, the professional
engineer shall only use a coordinate system based on assumed values
for the project, and so state on the documents. These services or
work, either public or private, may be performed in connection with
any utilities, structures, buildings, machines, equipment,
processes, work systems, projects, communication systems,
transportation systems and industrial or consumer products or
equipment of a mechanical, electrical, chemical, environmental,
hydraulic, pneumatic, thermal, control system or communications
nature, insofar as they involve safeguarding life, health or
property, and including such other professional services as may be
necessary to the design review—apd—integratiern coordination of a
multidiscipline work, planning, progress and completion of any
engineering services.

N I U P I T s I PO SR S s o
_Lll\/_LL/l\J._Lll\j T ().tJtJ_LUtJ_L_L().L,C (@B EAw W LT CITOTCT i A ) i k,(/lk,_l_\}ll, Cll\j_LllCCJ_O’

SN, A LIS PR SN, A T o] itz o S| I A

AL I T T T T Toy _L().ll\J.O\/().tJ | € N S W i R Sy Wy ooy TSk [ g mp v Loy I Cr A\ WP i i e
rofocational o oot mo dan I 4 A ot S A £+ Aecd o ~ K
tJJ_\JJ_\_/QQ_L\JJ.J.L/L_LQ W LT _Ll.lv L% I B A B e I |\ N R S NG W WS S N R A\ LS B By \_/J.J.g_LJ.J.\_/\_/J_ . [ N i s
Aafamay o o R D e T L. IR IO SO, S et o A P
|\ I\ NI S S R R S W S N B A\ oL O_L\jll - VT A4 (@ yaw 8 [ S N Ny \j_l_().b_l_ull J\J_Y ll\jJ_lICCJ_O AW AW A wyw) TToCT
oot e P N B DDA A Ry = SN, IR [ I, [ N
1 OO O 1 1T T T [ - \—rw) A\ WP i B o i E— — I o T t/J_UJ_\_,»_)s_)_LUJ.J.L/L_L kA.-Lb_)k/-LbJJ—J—J.l\_/AJ (€7 N S
P IS s £ v oy iy o oot S P Ly

AU CTIT IO T 2T Ry |\ N N o A t/\_/J—J—UJ—lLL T o L COCT A J_\_/vu_LL/LL.,J_Ullt

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 25



resurveys—of—the publie land survey——system Design coordination

includes the review and coordination of technical submissions

prepared by others,

including the work of other professionals

working with or under the direction of an engineer, with

professional regard for the ability of each professional involved in

a multidisciplinary effort.

a.

ENR. H. B. NO.

An engineer is responsible for the engineering plans

and specifications of a building. The term

"engineering plans and specifications" means:

(1)

plans for a structural, mechanical, plumbing,

electrical, low voltage fire suppression,
utilities, or geotechnical system in a building,

specification of structural elements and

connections of a building,

evaluation of structural members before the

addition of roof-mounted equipment or a heavier
roof covering,

design of changes in roof pitch by the addition

of structural members and diaphragm,

repair of damaged structural systems including,

but not limited to, roof structural members and
diaphragm,

hydrologic management calculations and design of

surface water control and detention necessary for
compliance with ordinances and regulations,

design of changes in roof pitch by the addition

of structural framing members,

evaluation and repair of damaged roof structural

framing,

design of electrical and signal and control

systems,

shop drawings by manufacturers or fabricators of

3253

materials and products to be used in the building
features designed by the engineer, and

Page 26



(11) specifications listing the nature and quality of
materials and products for construction of
features of the building elements or systems
designed by an engineer.

b. The preparation of engineering plans and
specifications for the following tasks is within the
scope of the practice of engineering:

(1) site plans depicting the location and orientation
of a building on the site based on:

(a) a determination of the relationship of the
intended use with the environment,
topography, vegetation, climate, and
geographic aspects,

(b) the legal aspects of site development,
including setback requirements, zoning, and
other legal restrictions, and

(c) surface drainage,

(2) the depiction of the building systems, including
structural, mechanical, electrical, and plumbing
systems, in:

(a) plan views,

(b) cross-sections depicting building components
from a hypothetical cut line through a
building, and

(c) the design of details of components and
assemblies, including any part of a building
exposed to water infiltration or fire-spread
considerations,

(3) 1life safety plans and sheets, including
accessibility ramps and related code analyses,

(4) roof plans and details depicting the design of
roof system materials, components, drainage,
slopes, and directions and location of roof

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 27



accessories and equipment not involving
structural engineering calculations.

C. The following activities may be performed by an
engineer:

(1) programming for construction projects, including:

(a) ddentification of economic, legal, and
natural constraints, and

(b) determination of the scope of functional
elements,

(2) recommending and overseeing appropriate
construction project delivery systems,

(3) consulting with regard to investigating, and
analyzing the design, form, materials, and
construction technology used for the
construction, enlargement, or alteration of a
building or its environment, and

(4) providing expert opinion and testimony with
respect to issues within the responsibility of
the engineer.

d. A person or entity shall be construed to practice or
offer to practice engineering, within the meaning and
intent of Seetien47+5+—I+—-et—seg—of this £itde act who
does any of the following: practices any branch of
the profession of engineering; by wverbal claim, sign,
advertisement, letterhead, card or in any other way
represents such person to be a professional engineer
or through the use of some other title implies that
any person is a professional engineer or is licensed
or qualified under Seetion4+5-1—-et——seg—of this £itlte
act; or who represents qualifications or ability to
perform or who does practice engineering;

sgrveyer't—eoer—1 S.
"Professional Surveyor", "P.L.S.", or "P.S." means a person who is
qualified to practice surveying by reason of surveying education
training, experience, and examination in the application of

surveying principles and the interpretation of surveying data and

I {1 o P = M I
U e [ I S NV NN NP D W R E N R N @ R LT

(07

nAa
T

ISEER S TR E N | r 5
SO veyOoTr O .

=

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 28



has been duly licensed as a professional +amd surveyor pursuant to
Seetion47+5-1——et——seg—of this £itde act and the regulations issued
by the Board pursuant thereto;—and—isa person who—by reaseon—of

surveyeor—intera™ 6. "Surveyor Intern" or S+

"L.I." means a person who complies with the requirement for
education and has passed an examination in the fundamental d=rd
surveying subjects, as provided in Seetieon 4751+ et seg—of this
#3+tdte act and regulations issued by the Board pursuant thereto;

&=

"Practice of d+@md surveying" means any authoritative
service or work performed to a stated accuracy, the
adequate performance of which involves the application
of special knowledge of the principles of mathematics,
methods of measurement, and the law for the
determination and preservation of Jlamd boundaries.
"Practice of +@md surveying" includes, without
limitation:

~J
Q

(1) restoration and rehabilitation of corners and
boundaries in the United States Public Land
Survey System or the subdivision thereof,

(2) obtaining and evaluating evidence for the
accurate determination of +ard boundaries,

(3) monumenting the subdivision of land parcels into
smaller parcels and the preparation of the
descriptions in connection therewith,

(4) measuring and platting underground mine workings,

(5) creation, preparation or modification of
electronic or computerized data including
portions of geographic information systems and
land information systems, relative to the
performance of the practice of 4+amd surveying,

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 29



ENR. H. B. NO.

(6) establishment, restoration, and rehabilitation of
+anrd survey monuments and bench marks,

(7) preparation of *ame survey plats, condominium
plats, monument records, and survey reports, and
site plans as an ancillary service to surveying
work, such as noting proposed site improvements,

(8) surveying, monumenting, and platting of
easements, and rights-of-way,

(9) measuring, locating, or establishing lines,
angles, elevations, natural and man-made features
in the air, on the surface of the earth,
utilities and other structures within underground
workings, and on the beds of bodies of water fer
thepurposeof determining arcas—and—votlumes—for
a—sgrvey, the configuration or contour of the
earth's surface, or the position of fixed objects

on the earth's surface,

(10) geodetic surveying,

(11) any other activities incidental to and necessary
for the adequate performance of the services
described in this paragraph, =ad

(12) surveying reports or like material developed in
connection with expert witness testimony or
anticipated testimony, and

(13) locating or laying out alignments, positions, or
elevations for the construction of fixed works
for public projects.

A person or entity shall be construed to practice or
offer to practice +amd surveying, within the meaning
and intent of Seetien4+5-1+—-et—seg—eof this £itle act,
who does any one of the following: practices any
branch of the profession of +amd surveying; by verbal
claim, sign, advertisement, letterhead, card or in any
other way represents such person to be a professional
+and surveyor or through the use of some other title
implies that such person or entity is a professional

3253 Page 30



+and surveyor or that such person is registereds
licensedy or qualified under Seetien—47+5+—t—et—seg—eof
this ##&d+e act; represents qualifications or ability
to perform; or who does practice +amd surveying;

9 8. "Board" means the State Board of Licensure for
Professional Engineers and Eand Surveyors;

+6+ 9. "Responsible charge" means direct control and personal
supervision of engineering or +amd surveying work;

1= 10. "Rules of professional conduct for professional
engineers and professional +amd surveyors" means those rules
promulgated by the Board;

2= 11. "Firm" means any form of business or entity, other than
an individual operating as a sole proprietorship under his or her
name;

+3= 12. "Direct control" and "personal supervision", whether
used separately or together, mean active and personal management of
the firm's personnel and practice to maintain charge of, and
concurrent direction over, engineering or +amd surveying decisions
and the instruments of professional services to which the licensee
affixes the seal, signature, and date;

+4~ 13. "Core curriculum" means the Board-approved tand
surveying courses adopted by Board policy, developed to ensure that
professional d+and surveyor applicants meet the minimum educational
requirements for dieenmsure licensing;

15— "Related seience—degree™ 14. "Engineering-related science
degree" means a bachelor's degree from an ErgineceringTeehnolegy
Accoreditation Commplssion/accreditation Soard for noineering ano
Technology—+(ETAC/ABET) accredited engineering technology program of

four (4) years or more. A degree of four (4) years or more in
arehiteeturer mathematical, physical or engineering sciences may be
considered as a—related an engineering-related science degree if it
was obtained from a Board-approved program, and shall include a
minimum of eight (8) hours of mathematics beyond trigonometry,
iraetwding such as calculus and differential equations, and twenty
(20) hours of engineering sciences or related sciences, including
physics, such as mechanics, fluid mechanics, statics, dynamics,
thermodynamics, electrical and electronic circuits, materials
science, transport phenomena, computer engineering, etc. Non-

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 31



accredited engineering degree programs shall meet the above
requirements to be considered a—¥etated an engineering-related
science degree;

+6~ 15. "Authoritative" means being presented as trustworthy
ana, competent, and in accordance with the rules and statutes
governing the practice of engineering and surveying, codes,
ordinances, and other recognized standards when used to describe
products, processes, applications or data ¥esuwtting derived from the
practice of engineering or tawmd surveying; and

+#+- 16. "Disciplinary action" means any final written decision
or settlement taken against an individual or firm by a licensing
board based upon a violation of the Board's laws and rules unless
otherwise stated in the decision or settlement. Disciplinary
actions may include reprimands; sanctions; administrative fines; the
Board's refusal to issue, restore, or renew a license; settlement
agreements or consent orders; probation; suspension; revocation;
practice restriction, surrendering, relinquishing, or agreeing not
to renew a license as part of an agreement or board order; or any
combination thereof;

17. "Building" means any structure used, or intended to be
used, to support, shelter, or enclose any use oOr occupancy;

18. "Plans" means technical documents issued by the licensed
professionals intended to meet all current and applicable codes as
adopted by the Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, other
statutory codes and applicable federal codes and which shall be
submitted to all required building code and/or permit offices
required by the State of Oklahoma, county, municipal, and/or federal
government;

19. a. "Significant structure" means buildings and other
structures that represent a substantial hazard to
human life in the event of failure or are designated
as essential facilities, including but not limited to:

(1) buildings and other structures whose primary
occupancy is public assembly with an occupant
load greater than three hundred (300),

(2) elementary schools, secondary schools, or day
care facilities with an occupant load greater
than fifty (50),

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 32



ENR. H. B. NO.

adult education facilities, such as colleges and

universities, with an occupant load greater than
five hundred (500),

hospitals, nursing homes, mental hospitals, and

detoxification facilities with an occupant load
of fifty (50) or more resident care recipients
and/or surgery or emergency treatment facilities,

prisons, jails, reformatories, detention centers,

and correctional centers,

any building or other structure with an occupant

load greater than five thousand (5,000),

primary power-generating structures above fifty

(50) kilowatts,

structures at water treatment facilities for

potable water and wastewater treatment facilities
serving more than five thousand (5,000) people,

structures for public utility facilities

containing quantities of toxic or explosive
materials that are sufficient to pose a threat to
the public if released,

fire, rescue, ambulance, and police stations and

emergency vehicle garages,

designated tornado, earthquake, or other

nonresidential emergency shelters,

designated emergency preparedness,

communications, and operations centers and other
facilities required for emergency response,

aviation control towers, air traffic control

(14)

centers, and emergency aircraft hangars,

buildings and other structures having critical

(15)

national defense functions,

elevated water storage structures, and

3253

Page 33



(16) buildings and other structures with high lateral
loadings including:

(a) those subjected to ultimate design three-
second wind gust speeds equaling or
exceeding wind speeds corresponding to
approximately a three percent (3%)
probability of exceedance in fifty (50)
years, Or

(b) those that are in Seismic Design Category D
and above.

b. Significant structures shall exclude bridges and geo-
structures. As defined in this act, "bridges" shall
not include elevated structures linking buildings.
"Geo-structures" shall mean engineered structures that
are loaded by the earth or whose resistance is derived
from the earth.

C. A project defined as a significant structure shall be
required to have an Engineer of Record who is a
licensed Professional Structural Engineer;

20. "Engineer of Record" means the responsible professional

engineer for design and construction phases of a project who signs
and seals drawings, reports, or documents for the project or a
portion of the project;

21. "Technical submissions" means the documents necessary to
demonstrate compliance with applicable regulatory requirements
and/or to fabricate or construct a project including, but not
limited to, drawings, surveys, plats, digital models,
specifications, performance criteria, and installation requirements;
and

22. "Person" means an individual or firm.

SECTION 11. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.3, as
amended by Section 1, Chapter 63, 0.S.L. 2023 (59 0.S. Supp. 2023,
Section 475.3), is amended to read as follows:

Section 475.3 A. The State Board of Licensure for Professional
Engineers and Farnd Surveyors is hereby re-created, to continue until

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 34



July 1, 2026, in accordance with the provisions of the Oklahoma
Sunset Law, whose duty it shall be to administer the provisions of
Seection—4+5++—et——seg+—of this #i+tde act. The Board shall consist of
four professional engineers and two professional 4and surveyors, at
least one of whom is not a professional engineer, all of whom shall
be appointed by the Governor, with the advice and consent of the
Oklahoma State Senate. The Governor shall also appoint one lay
member. The professional engineers and professional +amed surveyors
shall be—appeointed by —theGovermor—and—shaltlt have the qualifications
required by Seetien—47+5-4—-of this &3tde act.

B. Each member of the Board shall file with the Secretary of
State a written ocath or affirmation for the faithful discharge of
official duties.

C. Appointments to the Board shall be in such manner and for
such period of time so that no two terms, with the exception of the
lay member, shall expire in the same year. On the expiration of the
term of any member, except the lay member, the Governor shall in the
manner herein provided appoint for a term of six (6) years a
professional engineer or professional 4amd surveyor having the
qualifications required in Seetieon—4+5+4—of this &3td+e act. The lay
member of the Board shall be appointed by the Governor to a term
coterminous with that of the Governor. The lay member shall serve
at the pleasure of the Governor. Provided, the lay member may
continue to serve after the expiration of the member's term until
such time as a successor is appointed. Members may be reappointed

to succeed themselves. Each member may hold office until the
expiration of the term for which appointed or until a successor has
been duly appointed and has qualified. 1In the event of a vacancy on

the Board due to resignation, death or for any cause resulting in an
unexpired term, if not filled within three (3) months, the Board may
appoint a provisional member to serve in the interim until the
Governor acts.

SECTION 12. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.4, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.4 Each professional engineer member of the Board
shall be a citizen of the United States and resident of this state.
The member shall have been engaged in the lawful practice of
engineering as a professional engineer for at least ten (10) years.
The member shall have been in responsible charge of engineering
projects for at least five (5) years and shall be a licensed
professional engineer in this state. Not more than two professional

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 35



engineer board members shall have the same primary area of
competence designated in the Board records. A minimum of one
professional engineer board member shall be a Professional
Structural Engineer. FEach professional +ard surveyor member of the
Board shall be a citizen of the United States and a resident of this
state. The member shall have been engaged in the lawful practice of
+and surveying as a professional +and surveyor for at least ten (10)
years. The member shall have been in responsible charge of tarnd
surveying projects for at least five (5) years and shall be a
licensed professional d+amd surveyor in this state.

SECTION 13. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.6, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.6 The Governor may remove any member of the Board
for misconduct, incompetence, neglect of duty or any sufficient
cause, in the manner prescribed by law for removal of state
officials. Vacancies in the membership of the Board shall be filled
for the unexpired term by appointment by the Governor as provided in

(-

Seectieon—4+5-3—of this £itlte act.

SECTION 14. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.7, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.7 The Board shall hold at least four regular

meetings each year. Special meetings may be held as the bylaws of
the Board provide. The Board shall elect or appoint annually the
following officers: Chair, Vice Chair, and Secretary. A quorum of

the Board shall consist of a majority of the full Board that
includes at least one professional +a@md surveyor member.

SECTION 15. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.8, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.8 A. The State Board of Licensure for Professional
Engineers and Earmd Surveyors shall have the power to adopt and amend
all bylaws and rules of procedure, not inconsistent with the
Constitution and laws of this state and Seetien 475t et —seg—eof
this #3&de act, including the adoption and promulgation of Rules of
Professional Conduct for Professional Engineers and +ard Surveyors,
which may be reasonably necessary for the proper performance of its
duties and the regulation of its proceedings, meetings, records,
examinations and the conduct thereof. These actions by the Board
shall be binding upon persons licensed or recognized under Seetion
475+—1—et—seeg—oFf this £i+&de act and shall be applicable to firms

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 36



hetding—a which hold or should hold a certificate of auvtherizatien
authority, and non-licensees found by the Board to be in violation
of the provisions of this act. The Board shall adopt and have an
official seal, which shall be affixed to each certificate issued.
The Board shall have the further power and authority to:

1. Establish and amend minimum standards for the practice of
engineering and d+=md surveying;

2. Establish continuing education requirements for renewal of
professional engineering and professional temd surveying licenses;

3. Promulgate rules concerning the ethical marketing of
professional engineering and professional taemd surveying services;
and

4. Upon good cause shown, as hereinafter provided, deny the
issuance, restoration or renewal of, or place on probation for a
period of time and subject to such conditions as the Board may
specify, a eertifiecate of Jiecensure license or certificate of
agtherizatieon authority. In addition, the Board may suspend,
revoke, place practice restrictions, or refuse to renew eertifieates
of—tieensure licenses or certificates of awtherizatien authority
previously issued, and upon proper showing to review, affirm,
reverse, vacate or modify its orders with respect to such denial,
suspension, revocation or refusal to renew.

B. The Board is hereby authorized to levy administrative
penalties against any person or entity who or which violates any of
the provisions of Seetien 475+t —et—seg—of this &3&d+e act or any
rule or regulation promulgated pursuant thereto. The Board is
hereby authorized to initiate disciplinary, prosecutorial and
injunctive proceedings against any person or entity who or which has
violated any of the provisions of Seetieon 4753+ et seqg—of this
£3+tdte act or any rule or regulation of the Board promulgated
pursuant thereto. The Board shall investigate alleged violations of
the provisions of Seetien4+5+t—et—seg—of this £3tde act or of the
rules or regulations, orders or final decisions of the Board.

C. The Board is hereby authorized to acquire by purchase,
lease, gift, solicitation of gift or by any other lawful means, and
maintain, use and operate real property and improvements; contract
for the maintenance, use, and operation of or lease of any and all
real property and improvements; lease or sublease any part of real
property and improvements acquired pursuant to this section to

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 37



public entities, private entities, or private persons, on any terms
and for any consideration deemed appropriate by the Board, subject
to restrictions in purchase or lease documents relating to property
acquired; provided, all contracts for real property and improvements
shall be subject to the provisions of Section 63 of Title 74 of the
Oklahoma Statutes.

D. 1In carrying into effect the provisions of Seetien475+1t—<t
seg+—of this £3+%tde act, the Board, under the hand of its Chair, Vice
Chair, or Executive Director and the seal of the Board, may subpoena
witnesses and compel their attendance, and may also require the
submission of books, papers, documents or other pertinent data, in
any disciplinary matters, or in any case wherever a violation of
Seection—4+5+1+—et—seg—of this &itde act is alleged. Upon failure or
refusal to comply with any such order of the Board, or upon failure
to honor its subpoena, as herein provided, the Board may apply to a
court of proper jurisdiction for an order to enforce compliance with
same.

E. The Board is hereby authorized in the name of the state to
apply for relief by injunction in the established manner provided in
cases of civil procedure, without bond, to enforce the provisions of
Seetion—4+5+—1+—et——seg—of this £itde act, or to restrain any
violation thereof. In such proceedings, it shall not be necessary
to allege or prove either that an adequate remedy at law does not
exist or that substantial or irreparable damage would result from
the continued violation thereof. The members of the Board shall not
be personally liable under this proceeding.

F. The Board may subject an applicant for ltieemsure a license
or a licensee to such examinations as it deems necessary to
determine the applicant's or licensee's qualifications. The Board
may dispose of a formal complaint against a licensee for a violation
of Seetien 475+t —et—seg—of this £3+tde act by an order that a
licensee shall complete the examinations as the Board deems
necessary to determine the qualifications of the licensee, and upon
the initial failure or refusal to successfully complete the
examination, within the time ordered, place conditions on the
license of the licensee to practice and order other remedies until
competence is demonstrated.

G. No action or other legal proceedings for damages shall be
instituted against the Board or against any Board member or employee
of the Board for any act done in good faith and in the intended
performance of any power granted under Seetieon 4753+ et seqg—of this

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 38



£itde act or for any neglect or default in the performance or
exercise in good faith of any such duty or power.

H. The Board may give scholarships, as determined by the Board,
to an individual or individuals advancing toward obtaining an
Ergineering Aeereditation Commission+(FEACY, Technology Aeereditation

+TAC/ABET}, or Board-approved aeeredited degree in engineering or
+anrd surveying at an Oklahoma higher education institution, and take
such other action as may be reasonably necessary or appropriate to
effectuate the rules of the State Board of Licensure for
Professional Engineers and Fand Surveyors. The Board may, at its
discretion, contract with other state agencies and nonprofit
corporations for the endowment, management and administration of
scholarships. The requirements of such scholarships shall be
determined by the Board. However, nothing contained herein shall be
construed as requiring the Board to endow or award any scholarship.

I. The Board may use its funds to establish and conduct
instructional programs for persons who are currently licensed to
practice engineering or +amd surveying, as well as refresher courses
for persons interested in obtaining adequate instruction or programs
of study to qualify them for licensure to practice engineering or
+and surveying. The Board may expend its funds for these purposes
and may conduct, sponsor and arrange for instructional programs and
also may carry out instructional workforce development programs
through extension courses or other media. The Board may enter into
plans or agreements with community colleges, public or private
institutions of higher learning, the State Board of Education,
nonprofit organizations, or with #£ke Oklahoma DBepartment—of Career
and—FechnotlogyEdueatieon CareerTech for the purpose of planning,
scheduling or arranging courses, instruction, extension courses or
in assisting in obtaining courses of study or programs in the fields
of engineering and +amd surveying. The Board shall encourage the
educational institutions in Oklahoma to offer courses necessary to
complete the educational requirements of Seetieon 4453+t —ect——seg—of
this #3tde act. For—thepurpose—of—ecarrying To carry out these
objectives, the Board may adopt rules as may be necessary for the
educational programs, instruction, extension services or for
entering into plans or contracts with persons or educational

institutions and £he Oklahoma PBPepartment—of Carecer—andFechnology
Edweatiern CareerTech.

SECTION 16. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.9, is
amended to read as follows:

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 39



Section 475.9 A. The Executive Director of the State Board of
Licensure for Professional Engineers and Eame Surveyors shall be
responsible for accounting for all monies derived under the
provisions of Seetion4+o+—+t—et—seg—of this &3t+e act. This fund
shall be known as the "Professional Engineers and Eamd Surveyors
Fund", and shall be deposited with the State Treasurer, and shall be
paid out only upon requisitions submitted by the Secretary or
Executive Director. All monies in this fund are hereby specifically
appropriated for the use of the Board, and at the end of each fiscal
year the Board shall pay into the General Revenue Fund of the state
an amount equal to ten percent (10%) of all licensure and
certification fees in compliance with Section 211 of Title 62 of the
Oklahoma Statutes.

B. The Board shall obtain an office, secure such facilities,
and employ, direct, discharge and define the duties and salaries of

an Executive Director—Prineipalt—Assistant;—birector—of FEnforecement;
PoaaraA Trxzanata o~y A 717 +har a1~ o~ rao r +h Ay Seoad ot o
ToOT T J_J.lV\_,g_)L_,_L\jL/LL.,UJ_ (@R uaw €% g L U i i we o OO T |\ E PR S S WPy @ R A\ |\ U B i wea oo LT o CTOlITC O
R NE Nnoa~sA~aanwrsy £ rameas o £ e o £ T+t el Tt 27
TS (@ g s llc\.zCQQu.L_y i S T t/-L\Jt/C-L t/C_LJ_\J_LllI.QLLLbC = [ S ) \A A= =) L SN N NN NP N S S VA
November—3+—20+7—at+ as necessary for the proper performance of its

work. The Executive Director shall be responsible for the
administration of the policies of the Board and for the processing
of its routine operations. The Executive Director may also employ
those persons required and qualified, including full or part-time,
to perform the administration of the laws in Oklahoma and those
rules regulating the practice of engineering and surveying. This
includes the use of consultants when deemed necessary. All
employees of the Board, current or future, shall be considered in
the unclassified service and shall not be placed under the
classified service. The Board shall make expenditures from the fund
created in subsection A of this section for any purpose which, in
the opinion of the Board, is reasonably necessary for the proper
performance of its duties under Seetion4+5-t—-et——seg—eof this itite
act, including examination administration fees, the expenses of the
Board's delegates to meetings of and membership fees to the National
Council of Examiners for Engineering and Surveying, meaning the
national nonprofit organization composed of engineering and darnd
surveying licensing boards commonly called NCEES, and any of its
subdivisions, as provided in the State Travel Reimbursement Act,
Section 500.1 et seqg. of Title 74 of the Oklahoma Statutes. Under
no circumstances shall the total amount of warrants issued in
payment of the expenses and compensation provided for in Seetion
475—+t—et—seg—of this £3+t3Fe act exceed the amount of monies in the
fund.

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 40



SECTION 17. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.10, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.10 A. The State Board of Licensure for
Professional Engineers and Eand Surveyors shall keep a record of its
proceedings and of all applications for +ieemsuwre licensing, which
record shall show:

1. The name, date of birth and last-known mailing and email
address of each applicant;

2. The date of application;

3. The place of business of the applicant;

4. The education, experience and other qualifications of the
applicant;
5. The type of examination required;

6. Whether or not the applicant was rejected;

7. Whether or not a eertificateof Jiecensure license was
granted;

8. The date of the action of the Board; and

9. The board-approved area(s) of competence in a specific
discipline(s) or branch(es) of engineering;

10. A declaration under penalty of perjury from each applicant
that he or she will abide by the statutes and rules prescribed by
the Board, with the declaration becoming a part of his or her
application for licensing; and

11. Such other information as may be deemed necessary by the
Board.
B. The Board shall keep a record of all applications for a

certificate of authority, which shall show all of the following:

1. The name, date of formation, and business address of each
applicant;

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 41



2. The date of application;

3. The name, physical address, and license number of the
managing agent;

4. Whether or not the application was rejected;

5. Whether or not a certificate of authority was granted;

6. The date of the action by the Board;

7. Services offered from each location;

8. A declaration under penalty of perjury from an officer and
managing agent, if the officer is not the managing agent, that the
applicant will abide by the statutes and rules prescribed by the
Board, with the oath becoming a part of its application for a
certificate of authority; and

9. Any other information deemed necessary by the Board.

C. The record of the Board shall be prima facie evidence of the
proceedings of the Board and a transcript thereof, duly certified by
the Secretary or Executive Director of the Board under seal, shall
be admissible as evidence with the same force and effect as if the
original were produced.

€~ D. The Board shall submit, upon request from the Governor, a
report of its transactions of the preceding year, including a
complete statement of the receipts and expenditures of the Board,
attested by affidavits of its Chair and its Secretary.

B+~ E. Board records and papers of the following class may be
kept confidential by the Board: examination materials, file records
of examination problem solutions, exam scores or results, letters of
inquiry and reference concerning applicants, transcripts of college
courses and grades, email addresses, ongoing investigation files,
closed complaints, information otherwise protected by law and all
other matters of like confidential nature.

SECTION 18. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.11, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.11 Complete rosters showing the names and last-
known mailing addresses of all professional engineers and,

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 42



professional structural engineers, professional +an€ surveyors,
certified interns, and firms holding a certificate of authority
shall be maintained—and made available to the licensees and the
public.

SECTION 19. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.12a, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.12a A. Certification or Enrollment as an Engineer
Intern. The following shall be considered as minimum evidence that
the applicant is qualified for certification as an engineer intern:

2. Passing the National Council of Examiners for Engineering
and Surveying (NCEES) Fundamentals of Engineering (FE) examinations

B. Licensure as a Professional Engineer. To be eligible for
licensure as a professional engineer, an individual shall meet all
of the following requirements:

1. Satisfy the education and experience criteria set forth in
this section;

2. Pass the applicable examinations set forth in this section;

and

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 43



Neor
co— CTIigagtT

ek ki

o

N

T CtTCIiroorT

S N
(&Y |\ WP S U S S S Y @ RGP Wy A

o

-

13 nex
OGS

an etz A1 W

J B 5 A W i B v B 3 Y & e

by
IXIT

e NP

(S %I F 3 ) i == = ey

ST

T aaiinA g PENE LT
o PTOPCE

EVSE RN
ity

nera

N~ g
LJJ_LA.\./L.,_L\./

n +h
TIr—Ctt

oIy

oo uco Oy

I TIT

A

oo £ 2~
|\ N A NN E i W Wy

n

PRI HE AN AT SIPIE — SNENE SR |
CITTO T

EEA AT [ = S 2y o2 1 1 Ay 3 R ey )

—
475

.

haaand

n

A PP I

~
T

ot o

A\ AW o
£ s o

A\

Ot
£ QA+ o

A\

TTOO

BT E AT 1Y

A\

o CCc T

S A

447

ox

o

1

.

n o

Xz oo

wath o e

CITLT O crrcITC—airx

[SASAS 0
212 A A

T
+ 1
CTIT

e S A

o T T OIT

CIITC POV oI UITS

WL CIT

S A

+ 1

i

n

N

o

ot

Nt 1

anaarrme~y A A
SO TG

o

n

A CITC DO LUy

BRZAAC I I

ITC LT O [SF I & i Sy & i 1T

A

TT

PSS

ek ik

o

N

T CtTCiroorT

1

ST 2 ST

P = I L Y
u_)t/C\_zJ.J_J.CLA [ S Y

e Fhioae Hh o o
S+

1

nat
TOT

ISE A TV
o CTaolttaa O

CIITC ap M T CTioTT

CIITo T

CcIiaolt

T OWTT

PEWANEVE S B i W a1 oo
cerctrtEtFrCattec—wWaS

ISEEWN 2
outCTt

e

Okl shm

.

n affant o

3

By
(& R

I

|y

LTIt

T T

LTIt

Toouatct™

KTToiroma o ©

wrladar £ ooy

n

BN B IS S P

+h

Sm o
cO— 22X 1<

P NI LI B2V .
ESAAS Av = mp A 1

el

oot
TR TTPT

o CTOO T U TT Oy

O SNITOUW T CTUg T O

[ i dppPr L LT TITT

[Sxe
o A

T +1

AT ramant o a0 g e o + +hha o ot o+
TEToUTTTCmCTS T

+hewy

o

EE |

I

Ry CIT 1O O CT T T

oITrrqaucT

AT AL i 5w

LTI TO

e
J_\_,\iu_LJ_\./J.I.l\./J.J. )

ot

+h o

©

AL

atan Ao A ]

=
T

- £
LA S ) e

AL

mat
T

=

T

PO N T P

m

=

Tl C

+h o

CIICTit

o Ccoalrrao o TOWTT

wTTCT

cIict T
+h

—

ot o+

n

£t
PR S N W W why
+ 1

n

N1y SNt o
T CCrourc—attT

12 o

S 2~

[ i dppp L LT LT

n

3

A
(S ASA= m S A e mp 3 ¥

IS B o

CIT 1O O CTaATTT a T

LTIt

1T

3 o cvag

£~

rt+ o
c o T C T 1T TTTT

i +h

BT PP
CITC JoOugtTIinTIT o

n

3

a i+

T

o

ISEE N2
[CAZ T ¥y

| =¥ ¥ e

-

ToouctT oucy 1T

WTro

C I

I

N I P oy

n

11
Ul

m sz

T e za A
T OV I Goa T

a +

LNk ]

LR el

n o

o

3

LTI T TITTIOS T

1

L It IR N |
oG Trita=T

Iy 7y

LT oo UaT Uy I

WO

(3 = S = S= = e R e )

+h

ra m
_"CcCoTTt

14+

Raoo

pamet ]
AN U i R L N S
£ 4o

o

i daoanaa~nA ey 140 Al
[CTSIEEASE A= nS ASF SASASAS S 5

el

el

a1 4 £ Aot

WITOOT Jud L L LT T L UITS

o

wh

I

e T T

I

13N AN

m sz

of

o

~n 47975 1

PR
[\ 1\ W2 U S W i

o117 AT A o £ <

oY T TInTIT e S O

r

CrrCcTT T iy y I SAE "

CTIT LT O

= C O e

T 7 I e L

el

ot
TP T

n

3 P R PO IS
[N SN U R S WS R B R A € 5 N 1) A E N Y @ R WS S N R

w1+

o

n
TITotTtT

3

=N
pm e

n

N I ISR

WL CIroocC A= OO

0T

=3 S = = e e vy ¥

S A
oI

o S S rirlaa

£

wrl ader

n

ST 2 s Vo ]

+h

S
cO— 22Xttt 1<

P BN B
ESAAS A = mp e

r

[ SN O i Ny}

o CTOO T U TT Oy

ether—reguirements—unigue—teo—Okltahoma as described in Board rules.

=} RKITOUW LI TUYT o

I [ Sl s I A S e

An

Initial Licensure as a Professional Engineer.
applicant who presents evidence of meeting the applicable education,

examination and experience requirements pursuant to this subsection

shall be eligible for licensure as a professional engineer.

C.

b+

An individual seeking licensure as

Education Requirements.
a professional engineer shall possess one or more of the following

education qualifications

1.

a baeheler's degree in engineering from an EAC/ABET-

accredited bachelor's program,

a.

or the equivalent,

a baehetor's degree in a Board-approved related
science degree bachelor's program,

b.

a master's degree in engineering from an institutien

C.

master's program from an institution that offers an

EAC/ABET- or ETAC/ABET-accredited bachelor's program

EAC/ABET- or ETAC/ABET-accredited preograms
in the same or similar discipline of engineering,

o

££
A\ N N PR S )

o NP
CIITTCT

Page 44

H. B. NO. 3253

ENR.



d. a degree in engineering from a non-EAC/ABET- or
ETAC/ABET-accredited bachelor's, master's, or
doctorate program. This individual's education shall
be evaluated by the NCEES Credentials Evaluation
service or other Board-approved evaluation service
based upon the criteria set forth in the NCEES
Engineering Education Standard,

=

e. a master's degree in engineering from an EAC/M-ABET-
accredited program, or

e

f. an earned doctoral degree in engineering acceptable to

the Board.

3= Examination Requirements. An individual seeking licensure
as a professional engineer shall take and pass the NCEES
Fundamentals of Engineering (FE) examination and the NCEES
Principles and Practice of Engineering (PE) examination as follows:

a. the FE examination may be taken at any time according
to NCEES examination pediey policies and procedures,
but is recommended to be taken during the student's
senior year of college,

b. the PE examination may be taken by a graduate of an
approved degree program pursuant to this section, or

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 45



C. the Board may waive the FE examination requirement for
the issuance of a license if the applicant possesses,
at a minimum, fifteen (15) years of progressive
experience on engineering projects which indicate to
the Board the applicant may be competent to practice
engineering. The Board shall evaluate all elements of
the application, according to Board rules, to assess
waiver requests.

4— 3. Experience Requirements. An individual seeking licensure
as a professional engineer shall present evidence of a specific
record of pregressiwe engineering experience satisfying—oene—of—the
following the conferment of the qualifying degree as described in
paragraph 1 of this subsection. This experience should be
progressive and of a grade and character that indicate to the Board
that the applicant may be competent to practice engineering. The
following educational criteria may apply as a substitute to the
length of experience set forth in this section:

a. an individual with—a bachelor'ls degree—inenginecering
who qualifies pursuant to subparagraph a of paragraph
1 of this subsection: four (4) years of experience
after the bachelor's degree is conferred,

b. an individual with—abacheler's degree—in—a Board-—
approved—related—seiencedegree—program who qualifies
pursuant to subparagraph b of paragraph 1 of this
subsection: six (6) years of experience after the
bachelor's degree is conferred,

c. an individual witha master'ls degree—inengincering
who qualifies pursuant to subparagraph c or & e of
paragraph 1 of this subsection: three (3) years of
experience after the master's degree is conferred, or

d. an individual with—ean—-earnred—dectoral—degree
aeceptabte—to—the Boeard who qualifies pursuant to

subparagraph f of paragraph 1 of this subsection: two
(2) years of experience after the doctoral degree is
conferred.

A graduate degree that is used to satisfy education requirements
cannot be applied for experience credit toward licensure. To be
eligible for experience credit, graduate degrees shall be relevant
to the applicant's area of professional practice. Experience credit

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 46



for a graduate degree cannot be earned concurrently with work
experience credit.

5+ 4. Partial experience credit may be awarded for experience
earned prior to conferment of the qualifying degree, at the
discretion of the Board, as described in Board rules. In no case
shall the experience credit exceed one-half (1/2) of that required
for approved qualifying experience. The experience credit shall not
be claimed if the applicant is also claiming the experience time as
experience credit for a cooperative education program.

6= 5. EAC/ABET-accredited engineering cooperative education
programs may be considered as experience credit earned prior to the
qualifying degree if the program meets the experience requirement
pursuant to this subsection. Otherwise, a maximum of six (6) months
experience may be claimed. Experience credit for a cooperative
education program shall not be claimed if the applicant also claims
the experience time as experience credit earned prior to the degree.

D. Comity Licensure for a Professional Engineer. The following
shall be considered as minimum evidence satisfactory to the Board
that the applicant is qualified for licensure by comity as a
professional engineer:

1. An individual holding a license to engage in the practice of
engineering issued by a proper authority of any state, jurisdiction,
or foreign country, based on requirements that do not conflict with
the provisions of this act, and possessing credentials that are, in
the judgment of the Board, of a standard not lower than that
specified in the applicable licensure act in effect in Oklahoma at
the time such license was issued may, upon application, be licensed
without further examination except as required to examine the
applicant's knowledge of statutes, rules, and other requirements
unigque to this state. If the requirements that were met were of a
standard lower than that specified in the applicable licensure act
in effect in this state at the time such license was issued but, in
the judgment of the Board, the standard was a reasonable standard at
the time the original license was issued, the individual may, upon
application, be considered by the Board according to the provisions
in the Board rules; or

2. An individual holding an active NCEES Record whose
qualifications, as evidenced by the NCEES Record, meet the
requirements of this act may, upon application, be licensed without
further examination except as required to examine the applicant's

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 47



knowledge of statutes, rules, and other requirements unique to
Oklahoma.

SECTION 20. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.12b, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.12b A. Certification er—FEnarellment as a Larnd
Surveyor Intern. Passing of the NCEES Fundamentals of Surveying
(FS) examination and completion of one of the following shall be
considered as minimum evidence that the applicant is qualified for
certification er—enrellment as a +amd surveyor intern:

1. Graduating from a surveying program of four (4) years or
more approved by the Boards and providing proof of graduation and
a1l g 4 o Aer +h P SN NE S N r foaaoaq nal foaran~
[ N § § i Sy Gry Gsp mp iy § \j CITTI T CITITO T OCTCCTT T O t/LULCOO.LUllu_L J_CJ_CJ_CLJ.L/CQ]

2. Graduating from a surveying program of two (2) years or more
approved by the Board, prov1dlng proof of graduation and—submitting
L N NP B 1 £ ~ ] £ =
CTIT 1T \_/ LN €7 R Sy @5 B W7 U Wpe A t/J—UJ—\./A)A)—LUJ-lu—L J_\_IJ_\_IJ_\_/J.J.\./\_/U,

3. Graduating from a program of two (2) years or more approved

by the Board which shall include the Board-approved core curriculum,
completed with a minimum grade of C, and providing proof of

graduation and—submittingthreecharacter or professionat

£
J—\_/J—\_/J—\_/J-J-\_/\_/u, 'ef

4. Graduating from a program of four (4) years or more approved
by the Board which shall include the Board-approved core curriculum,
completed with a minimum grade of C, and providing proof of
graduation; or

5. Completing sixty (60) college credit hours approved by the
Board which shall include the Board-approved core curriculum,
completed with a minimum grade of C, and providing proof of

successful completion of the regquired college credit hours and

e N~ alh v~ A r e~ aag nol roafaran~~ao NO
QuMlll.LL_L_.Lll\j chHrrCC—CaTraoC Tttt OTr—pPpTrorCooTrOar Tt intes.

application will be accepted after January 1, 2026, for an applicant
qualifying under this paragraph.

B. Licensure as a Professional Eamd Surveyor. To be eligible
for licensure as a professional 4amd surveyor, an individual shall
meet all of the following regquirements:

1. Satisfy the education and experience criteria set forth in
this seetiern act;

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 48



2. Pass the applicable examinations set forth in this seetien
act; and

ef—%he—app%feaﬂ%—s—safveyfﬁq—expef%eﬁee as descrlbed in Board rules

C. 1Initial Licensure as a Professional Surveyor. An individual
meeting the education requirements pursuant to subsection A of this
section for a surveyor intern shall meet the following surveying
experience requirements as described in Board rules, which shall
include combined office and field experience satisfactory to the
Board on projects of a grade and character which indicate to the
Board the applicant may be competent to practice surveying:

1. An individual meeting the experience requirements in
paragraph 1 of subsection A of this section: four (4) years of
total experience including two (2) years which shall follow the date
of the conferment of the degree; or

2. An individual meeting the experience requirements in
paragraph 2 or 3 of subsection A of this section: five (5) years of
total experience including two (2) years which shall follow the date
of the conferment of the degree; or

3. An individual meeting the experience requirements in
paragraph 4 of subsection A of this section: five (5) years of
total experience.

Upon completion of the education and experience requirements,
passing the NCEES Fundamentals of Surveying (FS) examination, the
NCEES Principles and Practice of Surveying (PS) examination, and the
Oklahoma Law and Surveying (OLS) examination, the applicant shall be
licensed as a professional surveyor, if otherwise qualified.

€~ D. Comity Licensure for a Professional Eand Surveyor. The
following shall be considered as minimum evidence satisfactory to
the Board that the applicant is qualified for licensure by comity as
a professional damd surveyor:

An individual holding a eertifiecate—eof licensure license to
engage in the practice of +anmd surveying issued by a proper
authority of any state or jurisdiction, based on requirements that
do not conflict with the provisions of Seetien4+5-+—-et——seg—eof this

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 49



in the judgment of

and possessing credentials that are,

+i++le act,

of a standard not lower than that specified in the

applicable licensure act in effect in this state at the time such

certificate was issued may,

the Board,

which may include a

be licensed upon passing an

upon application,

examination or examinations of such duration as established by the

Couwneid NCEES Record with NCEES,

procedures and

which shall include questions on laws,
practices pertaining to d+amd surveying in Oklahoma.

Board,

+~

Iz

T amd Qoo

nal

N

[ SN S U S NSNS WD J S W 5 @ s T UL VT YUl

lalal

n oy el

3~

T

Tt o1

IXIT

(=9

TrIrrcrat DTroCTlroalro oo

RS PN S NP =N I = +h
[SF % ¥ & g npe

~

X

faREEEZL &3

1 and

ot a2 A
o CCTITOTT

o

£ orha o

A

e T T

[ S

Py

I

TIrc o IL

TOITO S L veyor

(=9

CIT LT O

A

N N £ o o3
CTITT LSS AW L@ g pw § 1T t/J_\J_JCbl«O . - L \_jJ_uuC AT

7

+r

PN S R NS

n o

3

1
A=A S S S m ) i i e

L

Ay

st il oLrdacoctUly

n

mant o 3

ne roeria
T o CmCITsS

N

Zr Ao

+ 2y
et S

m

T A= 1

R I

i

|3 3 R ANy i e e 2 S 3 5 ) o

£ orpd o
I O
(D0
Q

TIroO v TOuao T
o

IXIT

(A4 N £ + A+
Tr—yCearts—OT
il +h

-
R SR W .

alh 11

17

At g A
o CTIT O
ah 1~

£ b~ a A
OTr—0o oSt CTTOTT

1

Baracgrauh

C OO TTT

CTIT LT O

-

IS ST Eaey =r s

Aot

TaL

1

£

VeATrS

z

IR IEEDA IS R e

n o

3

1
LA S e e = ) i e

)

T A\ 4@ 5 o wy o

ol L T T UL TOW

WIT LT COTT

7

W

EEE S A mapv s ap S AT

+ 1

nFarman
crriC— COoOTr - CTImCitT

o

O

|2 FASIER T AT = = e

A\

n

mant o 3

ne oy g
oo CmCITsS

N

ZrAa

+ 2y
et S

EIEAWS T I EE T I

n
IXIT

CIICT— O P T T TITCT TIT

TIroO v TOuao T

2

vesTs

3z

JAVARY

VT

ot 2 Y o g
o tCTTOT——o=T

o

£ b an~no~t+ o n £ +1h2a
T—CT

A A
oo — T OT

2

Pparacgranha
PoTragTapPTS

CTIT Lo

CTOTT

[CAT Y waeaw

n o

3

1
C O TTIT CANMNT L LITITCOT .

L

£ o+

O

mant o

P R
J_\_,\iu._LJ_\./J.lI.\./J.J. TO I

r

o

N

r
|S 3 3 1T S PAY T A S a2 Sy 3 3 w2 o

210

Ay

n

Ayt o
T \Awaw . AT CITCUTT

+ 1

n

n o~ + 2
CoOmMpPpTrCTTOTT

INESN

A\

OOt

(AT T\ EN N HE e i AP +h ENE N I VNSNS P ~ NN B B =N
CxXamtr o c Oty chre—appPrTrCaitt

73 My
ST

A Qaaoncs
oo oL v

T Sty

Ol S e o

[ Y & g g = T

oo/
1A

KTTorrorrar oo w

A

R I

Yool oo
OTCITT T W IO T U LT LT T T

s

N

~

Sz

Q137

n

N

o
(=8 P UYL oo LU

o

N N 72

el

n o

o

N

[ S H W) Wy Y W ) WS W (@ ¥

T

L TTTCE oULVC Yy ULy

is

Section 475.12c,

2021,

59 0.s.

AMENDATORY

SECTION 21.
amended to read as follows

A "Professional Structural Engineer",

A.

Section 475.12c

or "S.E." Prefessienal professional engineer licensed

in Oklahoma whe—were—approved—bvy—the Board—to—elaim structuralt

S.E.",

"P.E.,

o

oomy

A2

£
-

=

o

o

el

N | R o 1|
aIT

114

172+

173+
W LT CTIT

3 o

Ty

nera

o T TTITCT

shall submit the following by application

TLIT

TLO

O e LT e

WL CIIroocC

O

T It

20179
Z o T 17

1
7

and prescribed fees,

1 Naosz
CO— IO vTIiotTT

N

PO

nr

for Board consideration as

minimum evidence that the applicant is qualified to use the title

"Professional Structural Engineer",

if applicable,
similar variation using the

"S.E.", or any

S.E.",

"P.E.,

"S.E." designation and perform

Page 50

H. B. NO. 3253

ENR.



structural engineering analysis and design services for significant
structures, as defined:

l Coarta £~ ~~ano o £ 11 fFformo r N A3 a3 oy
. o T C LTI 1T \_/\JtJJ.C»._) A [ R S [ SN W § Y & R A S S N A N N S ) @ e iy LAJ.QM/J.LJJ.J.ll(_/LJ__Y
T S N~ PN N IR NP SR Sl SNNE B SN CNECDNE P~ Wit I NN | nera r 1 1~nAra 1 s
o T I UTTO T T u\ju_LlluL., CTIT J S - LJJ_UJ_ oo T OUTITN T \./J-J-\j—LJ-J.\_/\_/J_ [ S i N N R WD ) Ny [ S (_,Lll_Y
ot ot EESE R T B A i n 2 F ST 2 AT . A

o C OO CT A\ JLAJ.J.;_)MJ.&/L_J.\JLL, P S (_/Lt/tJJ.J.\_/(_/LLJJ.C, (@ W uaw

2= Proof of acceptable structural engineering experience by way
of a +ist description of representative projects completed, or

courses taught, as—deseribed—on BRoard—approved—application—formsy

and—three—referenees verified by licensed professional engineers
khaving who claim competence in structural engineering, and have
personal knowledge of amd—rerifying the applicant's structural
engineering experience. This requirement may be satisfied by the
licensee's original application if sufficient structural
engineering-specific experience is included and verified by a
qualified reference(s); and

2. Proof of structural engineering education evidenced by

original transcripts submitted directly to the Board office from the
university or college showing coursework or degrees obtained. This

requirement may be satisfied by the licensee's original application

if all relevant transcripts are included; and

4— 3. Proof of successful completion of one of the following
structural engineering examination paths below:

a. the NCEES Structural I and Structural II exams taken
prior to January 1, 2011,

b. an equivalent sixteen-hour state-written examination
prior to January 1, 2004,

c. the NCEES Structural ITI exam plus an equivalent eight-

hour state-written structural examination prior to
January 1, 2011, or

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 51



taken after

tion

eXamlina

S.E.

+ N~
cCCTI—oo =™
2011.

3

o
[

the NCEES

d.

January 1,

£ oroia o 4

BRI IR NP I CNE
ULALJJ.I.I._LL,L,_I_J.J.\j LJJ_UUJ_
£ o+t o

P p U e

) "o Nera rao ol
o

o

D

ISA%ESESAT e T T

alh~11

OO LOTITr L Ty 1T

i E g

NraAarmar] (g
o PTOoOpPpCT Ty

-

ol o 4

ot a1 A
SCCTtIOoTT

o

£ cuibhhan~t A
OTr—oSuo ottt Ot

V|
“T

Baracranh
PotfagTapPtT

[T ¥ w3 g uy oy

[ 3 ) & g uy

=]
|\ WP Sy U S S S WL W \_/ULJJ.CL_)

CITIT O

Foyprm o]

11

-
[ g mpm

d oo e £
Ao =

o

IR T I I
R HCThS

n

N I PSR

CUoOmMpTrTc T oo app LT rtocao c Ut

comnl A+ A A

S W s 3 @ e

Oty

no

4

.
i S S W e o my

.

+ +had e N~
| N B NP

YT IO T

. W R I W]

T i NPT~
AT T I UITOo

EEE AL X ]

(3 SRl e =y = mpm mp i e w4

3o~

a

S o]
i S A A N N S ) ) Y @ A

+
O

i Yo g my

IsE=

COISCTTT

AT 2 A
PP T ooty

3£
P S

o Saaeed o dd a2 e

ot o+

Stz
Iy

n

N

n o

o

3

1
LTI O TITTIOS T

B B W

nera
g T T Ty

[ S -

[SRL L@ W ) j g - JulL L oL Tt LUy

LTIt

o

N

ST 4 N
chC—appPrTrCaitt

ot +1
CTIITTO T

n o

71 A
VT GCce

ma o g o

TIT T I T CItL Ot

coanalrAarat g Ay oo
DAL i B S W) O 5 S W 3 s & i g s

BNV

B

]

&y

17

I

Qi pgd i ] T

PP IS NN |
T T OoOTrC oot oo

£

"D

o
o

’

oCcrroCc Tcorar ooy TT

T C 1T 1
ne @

O

Huo T
"p

"

no

EE WISV = 2

n

ro et o o

Y Aanmsz oayna ] oo
O ity

"

(@I

I e LI e

vaLr raCc Ul oIty

[SJ8= =5 1 gu mpn ny & i my

’

e LT e

’

e LT e

T e Liey

O S R

IS

£
O LYl T T OoTITC

L T B o |

£

o

Lt & W]
o T Vv CTOo

oCcLLoCc TuOorcTio.

e

.

TaL

I

WL

1 b oo

fay

I EI A T A I A AL EEST: Koot W T

[ S I 7 S W W W J S 7 @ e

A

2017

1

mhbhar
OV CITioT =T

Iz

N

EENENE IUZNES
UM T TTIITT ML UL

n o

= £ oomeadt
oo —OT

o

oY

el

IO T

L7

Ry

&y

WITO IO

\>A= "

LT

1

Trera

o CcLoCc Tcuoulraoar Oy TrIiTT T

[ E TPy AN |

n

oo g
T T OoOTrT oo Ltolirar

A+ 11 + 1 44 WDy~ F

eranld £

’

CITT C I

Ry o

UL L LT

n

T

PP
\AbQ_LgJ.LL/L e -

A

"

"o o

11~y 1

n

xro et 42

" v Atz
Ottty

nwg o

(@

"p

I O e LT e

A A

O e LT e 7 g TraocIT U ao ity

[y =y
£

T elTey

£

o

riza o~
o TV IICTS

Qa9 oy o

aTr AT o L YlT

ra3mex ol o0 o

nera
oSCclLroCc Tculraor Ty riIiTc T TOIrYy allaryo Lo

ISR VS R R T |

rm

RNV EEEYN

[ S

(S % A= Sy T e S mp g

n

4

£ 4

P
ITTOC T 1T 1T T i S

n

bz O+l 21 202N akh 11

o
SCcLoCcTcoarTos oY

o N P SN

P B L |

ol L L OoT

’

A

A

oL

TTOoOoTT

O LYl T T OoTITC

P S O |

Samearn A~ A+ ot o

12N

w11

£

N

POC T I S [NV S PN S B N

oCcoacc ocrLuCtTtcuoraor

O

|/)\ [ Epn B R WANC I & ¥ 1 1A WY ¥ AW AL W §

crriC T T
Wit h

CIITo C

AETE T IS]

o

mraot
CUNMMPTTTITTT .

o

-

o

+heas
S 3 5 e e

o
=]

=
(=9

N | e N 1]

=

13k

L B W

Nnera
ST T Ty

aLrmTT™ o

LT O e LT e

W I CTTIoOTCT

Comity applicants for a professional engineer license who

wish to also apply for authorization to use the title "Professional

B.
Structural Engineer

B+

or any variation using

"
. ’

E

"S

"
° ’

E

E., S

"P

’

"

1S

lys

ineering ana

the "S.E." designation and perform structural eng

=

ENEEN N Y

WITO ooy T CCTLT

wh

t structures

ican

for signif
shall submit the following by application and

ign services

and des

mhayr 1 2017
oVttt =7 T 7y

Iz

N

idence that the

10n as minimum ev

bed fees for Board considerat

prescri

ied

1if

is qua

applicant

T o] 2oy

=

a1

£
i S R R N N S ) ) § @ g \J._I_O‘\/_I_tJ_L_Lll(/l_L_Y

1

~

a1
i S NI S ) ) @ A A

g,

[ g g my

[ =

[ S U S e A\ 8 UM~

A\

Stz
=223

n

oann o 3

N

r
T - CTTTroT

nera o
CHgTccT

n

N

o
ProTrT o oo T

v N~

N

PNDEVINE PP S SN

n

PP S NP S
(&

It

| WP i i e e

COISCIT ago LitoC

cC OIS

ST 2~
app ooy

s £
[ S -

n

R [ JPSE

r

P

JoLrr oo T Uty

o Ccacc O

Proof of acceptable structural engineering experience by way

2=

of a +ist description of representative projects completed,

courses taught,

or

verified by licensed professional engineers

o

no

r
S Wi i W B WY I B WA W W

r

T
S N R S W Wy

and

and have

tructural engineering,

in s

khaving who claim competence

Page 52

H. B. NO. 3253

ENR.



personal knowledge of amd—erifying the applicant's structural
engineering experience;

3+ 2. Proof of structural engineering education, dnmeluding—ten

a
1 -nn--| r 2y + 1 + 1 (D)
T T l\jJ..llCCJ_J.ll\j HR—ERAe—EWwWo Z/

yeafs—pfeeedfﬂq—%he—da%e—eé—app%&ea%&eﬁ— and original transcripts
submitted directly to the Board office from the university or
college showing coursework or degrees obtained since the
individual's original professional engineer application to the
Board, if applicable; and

tHh
+

O

T o vy

4~ 3. Proof of successful completion of one of the following
structural engineering examination paths below:

a. the NCEES Structural I and Structural II exams taken
prior to January 1, 2011,

b. an equivalent sixteen-hour state-written examination
prior to 2004,

C. the NCEES Structural ITI exam plus an equivalent eight-
hour state-written structural examination prior to
January 1, 2011, or

d. the NCEES sixteen-houvr S.E. Examination examination
taken after January 1, 2011.

E~ C. Initial applicants for a professional engineer license
who wish to also apply for authorization to use the title
"Professional Structural Engineer", "P.E., S.E.", "S.E.", or any
variation using the "S.E." designation and to perform structural
engineering analysis and design services for significant structures
who—appty after Nevember 120+ F—andbeforeOetober 312026+ shall
submit the following by application and prescribed fees for Board
consideration as minimum evidence that the applicant is qualified,
in addition to all requirements in Seetieon 475+ et seg—eof Fitte 59

OCki- T T C 1 R
f +he Okiahoma—Statutes this act:

A\ CIT

1. Proof of acceptable structural engineering experience by way
of a +ist description of representative projects completed, or
courses taught, as—<deseribedon Roard—approvedapplication formss
and +hr referenees verified by licensed professional engineers
having personal knowledge of amd—verifying the applicant's
structural engineering experience; and

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 53



Proof of structural engineering education and evidenced by

2.
original transcripts submitted directly to the Board office from the

university or college showing coursework or degrees obtained.

alh 17 W

IR IR LW

TOTTOWIITY

Rocginrnarne~ N
SCOTT R ThSg

|y i

’

A

A

’

T

T

[ 1} & i mps Sa A

OV CInoTT

N I

o

3

PR N
CTIT (.A.LJLJ_I__I_\_/(_A.J.J.L_,

DAanwrA £ b ~nng gt Ay o
[ECA L@ g Epw § aaUaCIT O T T C 1T UIT CITTO T

+ 1

T

oo TS

e
"p =

O

CIT

O

o T on
e LT e

N
(ST F3v

1

Trera

[ SE S A SL S i Ry & R tp i AT [ R w2 e

(QESREVEEPE |

nl

o oa
rrtorcooToaT

£

+ 1 44 "D

o
o

17

e =

’

C LTI

[ i wy

1o~
oo TS

ro et o o

e

L

PSIE IV i BN
oo T Ot

A

"

ne @

n

7

oY

1
A=

"o =

(SR i

Ty

’

e LT e

Ry P LU

e L e

VoL TaCc T UTTL

o

ot g s

O C LT TUOUITO «

n

n— ey A a0~ o
1T \juuu QL.,(./LJ.J.\A._LJ.J.\.j

nco

o

N

Nyt N
T CCIESe

A= 220 == T3 a

no

3

o P OoTrCT oot oo

£ Okl ahomo .

oo

N N 2

aa
TTOTCho

i

Q4+

+h

TTarroritc y

[ i T CTCTT oL

IR IR aW-

+ 1
TOTTOWI g

n
A\ ¥ 3 W W

el

aafa11 1 7 ~Aran ] o S+
ooCtoooTroroT—y COompTrctctCt——att—TTCa st

(QEEWW

I

PN BN I SN SN SN T NP

L B W

nera o
CATE A=A YA AT @ = Cll\jlllcc_}_Lll\j T2l Iita © T OUTT

ISE VS Rk R |

MU CIho.

T T e+ ] Lo
TR TTES

T

S Al Q4 e g ]

T
T

NOTTQ Q4 g a0 a1

Fay

+h

COISCTT

oG ottt tcuourax
2071

Lup [l N U U W i Sy @ g =

I

1

Tarniia sz
cCOoO - oalraary

nri
PTETOoT

|\ mpm

+7

n

n P
= [ 15 ) 1) A S R iy @ R WP S N R

PO I
WL T CCTCTTIT

v o ot
f i A o COCTT

2004

13

n
CCTTTT

1

N

xr1rasral AndE o
rop=m

LA AT S A = o ¥ g

oY
LT

b+

Tamrma1 g
ooliTao Ly

Bt A
t/J_ [ L N

\SAYAr 37

L7

cO

At 1T h

or33 szl

CHO TV IrTITC o TTYITC

Y
TLIT

e N I T =]
PTrosS

T2yTaTtt

T T
T

NOTTCQ Q4 qra a0 n ]
INC oo o cituCctuourar

+h
cIIc

€

n o

NSO IESAPSI.
A [ 1 ) 1) R E N Y @ ) WS E N A

ot g ]

n

a1+ 4+

r of o+

13

ToTOLr

OO

IS

[ SR 8 U Sy g iy & g

WL T CCCTTT

o CcoCT

2011

1

Toarniiarsz

v e O

’

T

ooliTao Ly

£+
LT T

o lean
CTOINCTTIT

n

Tt it Cc T OTT

Tszamd o~ o

(@
e LT .

v

N Q o sz n 13
B A s N U N W Y S B B
2077

N

+1h
cIIc

=

o

1

Tarnii sy

arra

U Ty

’

-

valiudLy

£
L\ 7 S S S S SR W §

Iz

= A

= A

+1h

PR RN

neo

N

r
N4 S S B e 3 A e e

21

racna A
T COTTC—0O=T

O [SF 3 S e v A A @ i SAW S & ¥ S AW 5

[ = = == ey e w 2

T

N N
cCaCITS

4

ot o

R B W R N N

nerT
[N SR U Uy U i Sy @ g Cll\jlllcc_l__l_ll\j P YU JTE T To A

PR S SN |

ER

n o

1

1

bz

T

[ S N S g

MY

LTTTO T T T TO

S~~~ A N~
o CCOoTToT9g

NP
U.M/L,,

£ o+1d o
1

n

Ry
[P\ SV N WS S W i

£ oo bhhan~n~t o n £
ol oC C TCTTOT—Do—OT

4

Baracranh
t/(./LJ_ (./LvJ_(_/LtJLL

O

CIT LT O

>

Professional engineers who have indicated in their

official board records that they have competence in structural

engineering may offer and perform structural engineering services

and use the term structural engineer or structural engineering to

describe their qualifications or services.

only licensed

However,

professional engineers who have been authorized by this Board to do

SO may use £he—+title "Professional Structural Engineer",

"P.E.,

Page 54

H. B. NO. 3253

ENR.



S.E.", "S.E.", or any titte—wusing—+the "S.E." designation and to
perform structural engineering analysis and design services for
significant structures.

H+ E. The Board may adept—rutes—defining define significant

structures and establish standards of competence in structural
engineering analysis and design relating to seismic or other
influences which have a direct impact on the life, health, safety,
property and welfare of the public.

SECTION 22. AMENDATORY 59 0.S5. 2021, Section 475.13, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.13 A. 1. Application for tieensure—as a
professional engineer, professional structural engineer, or
professional }ard surveyor license, or certification as an engineer
intern or dand surveyor intern, shall be on a form prescribed and
furnished by the Board. It shall contain statements made under
oath, showing the applicant's education and a detailed summary of
technical and engineering or +amd surveying experience and shall
include the names and complete mailing addresses of the references,
none of whom may be members of the Board or immediate family members
of the applicant.

2. The Board may accept the certified information contained in
a valid eeuwrneil—reecord NCEES Record issued by the National Council
of Examiners for Engineering and Surveying for professional engineer
or professional +ame surveyor applicants in lieu of the same
information that is required on the form prescribed and furnished by
the Board. All initial applicants for a license must submit an
NCEES Record along with any additional required forms to be
considered for licensure.

B. 1. The application fees shall be established by Board
rules.

2. The certification fee for a firm shall be established by
Board rules.

3. Should the Board deny the issuance of a eertifiecateof
+ieensure license to any applicant, including the application of a
firm for a certificate of awvtherizatien authority, the fee shall be
retained as an application fee.

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 55



SECTION 23. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.14, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.14 A. Examinations shall be held at such times and
places as the Board directs and/or in accordance with NCEES
examination policy.

B. Examinations may be taken only after the applicant has met
other minimum requirements as set forth in Sections 9+—36—and—3+3
475.12a, 475.12b and 475.12c of this aet title, and has been
authorized to seek admission through NCEES or approved by the Board
for admission to one or more of the following examinations:

1. NCEES Fundamentals of Engineering (FE) examination;

2. NCEES Principles and Practice of Engineering (PE)
examination;

3. NCEES Structural Engineering (SE) examination;

4. NCEES Fundamentals of Surveying (FS) examination;

5. NCEES Principles and Practice of Surveying (PS) examination;

6. Oklahoma Law and Surveying (OLS) examination; and

7. Oklahoma Law and Engineering (OLE) examination.

C. A candidate failing an NCEES examination may apply for £he
113 . on rescribod EEC 1icd i

03
B
qar
[OF
B
3
B
I
i
)]
D
)]
qr
B

with NCEES policy. A candidate failing a Board examination may
apply for re-examination as directed by the Board and Board policy.

D. The applicant shall pay all NCEES examination fees
atr -l 1o~ sy +1h RanrA £~ EN N BN i N At o A A~ A0 Th

C o COr0 I oSITCTC J\J_Y CTITCT [ECAWL® g Epw § i S = I TITOoO T ITOUTT A\ AWAUL S ¥ § AUy i i Sy} [E¥uaw 8 \jJ_(,l\J._L.ll\j . [ N i By
P E I EE 2N B = a ah 11 =N nat1 A Iy 1 PN B NN 1 Atz £ + 1
J_\_/\iu_LJ_\_/kA. [ Sy =) [SSJ5 W Ny & Ry S y T LJL/L_LM )\J_Y T L/LLJLJ_L_L\_/L/LJ.J.L_ LI AV OTIT T T |\ T
examination per published NCEES policies and procedures.

E. The Board may prepare and adopt specifications for the
examinations in engineering and +anmd surveying. They shall be made

available to the—publie—and+te any person interested in being
licensed as a professional engineer or as a professional +anéd
surveyor.

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 56



F. For any examination that is administered by NCEES using
computer-based testing, a candidate shall only be admitted pursuant
to Board policy and administered the examination during a specified
time peried as frequently as prescribed by NCEES policies and
procedures.

SECTION 24. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.15, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.15 A. The Board shall issue to any applicant who,
in the opinion of the Board, has met the requirements of Seetion
475+—1—et—seg—oFf this £itde act, a ecertifiecate—ofIicensure license
giving the licensee proper authority to practice in this state. The
certificate—of J1iecensure license for a professional engineer shall
carry the designation "Professional Engineer", for a professional
structural engineer shall carry the designation "Professional
Structural Engineer", and for a professional +and surveyor,
"Professional Eame Surveyor". It shall give the full name of the
licensee with the lieenswre license number of the licensee and shall
be signed by the Chair and the Secretary under the seal of the
Board.

B. This eertifieate license shall be prima facie evidence that
the person named thereon is entitled to all rights, privileges and
responsibilities of a professional engineer, professional structural
engineer, or professional +amd surveyor, while the eertifieate

license remains unrevoked—and—unrexpired active and in good standing.

C. Each licensee hereunder may;—uwpen—tieensgres obtain a seal,
the design and use of which are described in Board rules. It shall
be unlawful for a licensee to affix, or permit his or her seal or
signature to be affixed, to any document after the expiration or
revocation of a license, or for the purpose of aiding or abetting
any other person to evade or attempt to evade any provision of
Seetion—4+o—+—et—seg—of this £it+e act. Whenever the seal is
applied, the document must be signed by the licensee thereby
certifying that he or she is competent in the subject matter and was
in responsible charge of the work product. Documents must be sealed
and signed in accordance with the Board rules whenever presented to
a client, a user or any public or governmental agency. Whenever the
seal is applied, the signature of the licensee and date of signature
shall be placed adjacent to or across the seal. Drawings, reports
or documents that are signed using a digital or electronic signature
must be done in a manner that is in direct control and personal

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 57



1 anA
T

n

1 EENER oo g
O prorTc oo oo

Nnera
SIS TIITTT

supervision of the professional

surveyeor and must conform to the specifications in the Board rules

regarding digital or electronic signatures.

or firm

A professional
shall retain a hard copy or electronic copy of all technical

D.

years following the

(10)

submissions produced for a minimum of ten

date of preparation.

in the opinion

The Board shall issue to any applicant who,

E.
of the Board,

ooy
=AY

-
=
a certificate as an engineer intern or damd surveyor

~ A78 1
T 7o T

ot 2
A e my

has met the requirements of Se

this +it+e act,

intern which indicates that his or her name has been recorded as

such in the Board office.

The engineer intern or Ztand surveyor

intern certificate does not authorize the holder to practice as a

professional engineer or professional Jarnd surveyor.

2021, Section 475.16, is

59 0.sS.

AMENDATORY

SECTION 25.
amended to read as follows

S R, £
C o T CITI T T TTCT o =

o

The Board shall issue

A.

Section 475.16
Iieensure licenses and certificates of autherizatien authority for

months.

(24)

firms for a term of twenty-four

£z

P
J.lUL_,_LJ__Y

-
14+

ot A

~

N

TR ST
CIIC— O XCTC T o CcTov e oDt T T TOoOT

z

ah 11 W + 1 ISEEE T £ + 1 i
OT

T+

\awy
£ oo

o

cIrc— JoCy

oLt L OT

C

S A
o

of

ral
A K

QA+~ 478 1
o CT IOt

EEESA DENE

el

o

3

LTI O TITTOoO T |\ i W ) weg -

o
183 e~

L

z

CVCI_Y ML o Ull

Iz

S o o Sy

CTIT LT O

=T

T I e L

r QA 2 A~
o tCTTOTT

n 12 A

s
O CITO T T2 TOCITTUIT

SN

£

£4 ot

P
(& | WP Eiy U S S S VY @ RGP w e

£ o+

A\

o

=

riz F£1 e b
T

Iz

oV eTyY

@ ¥ ¥ AW s ww

ooty

+

PNV S RN

CIITC O X P T o CrUlT

+ 1
BTN

4+

or

o

4785 1
b S A =

I

.
RSN I 2
(ST Fav s

cIIrCc— o ctT—OT

AT I CIT LT O | = mp e ny oy A\

TT

n

S,
O CITO1LT 14T l__L\_/ll.,

£

S R R,
CcC o T C I T 1T TTCT =

r

n oy

o
T TC TTrooarc OL

3

£ oy

g,
CcC o 1T C I T 1T TTOCT A\ -

o

(S i ey

raoanarra ]
TCIICwa -

it read £
J_\_,\iu_LJ_\_/\.A.

1+

11+ £ + 1
A =

S
TItoO oI T

T O

O

T

I

Aizra e~ 1

P T R —~
(s A\ =

7

o

atread -+

££
- T T T CTTr (& e

+1h

]l moasz W
oy O

WTr T

n

cIIc
+h

(v Eapuap 5T

atr-ahl 2 ah A ey
ot oty

| = 43 -y = e g

Iy

T Tt

o

=
T T T o

=
T

n

aszm

n I~y

et et
Ay LJ_LJ_L/LL__L\JJ.J.

n

mroTTrcIT

m

I

MY

A\

A\

CITC POy cITo

£

Nt o

o111 A
EEASAS fv = e ap e AT ¥ g Sy

RDeanrd woeraandd o o
[ECAW L@  upw § J_C\ju_l_u_l_ll\j

+h
TIt

remirl ~co+ A A] Iheg

o

O

[ S

[ S g Sy ey ) Pty Ay

o

PR I n anA ATy £

I WA e L & 1 1 I B i Y @ R W

r

T o

oo polia oy

nao masz
ey
£ h-aa

o

4

+h
Tt T otT

O PN

EIEANEWAE i T3

gLralrcco oo Tt ve

bz

orant A
STacaos Oy

o

N

n oo
T T CTTIrotT

I

CAZISAZAZ TN

O

T

S Az~

n

N

= A

fFz2~ne~ 1 B

+ s
T L,_I_J__Y _I_J.J.g

P P S -

PR
(a—y L& S w

+

rotiire
[ S NP W U R S i

O

T 1O

| P 6 B R Ev A\ @ R S W S 3

A=

oo vaorrctT— O

days prior

(60)

certificate of authority may be renewed up to sixty

Renewal and reinstatement fees and

conditions shall be established by Board rules.

to the expiration date.

Page 58

H. B. NO. 3253

ENR.



B~ C. Every licensee 1is required to comply with the Board's
rules regarding continuing education or meet the Model NCEES
Continuing Professional Competency standard requirement, which is
equivalent to fifteen (15) professional development hours per
calendar year with no allowable carryover, as a condition of license
renewal.

SECTION 26. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.17, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.17 A new eertifieate—ofJlieensure license or
certificate of auwtherizatien authority, to replace any certificate
losty or destroyed er—mutitated, may be issued, subject to the rules
of the Board.

SECTION 27. AMENDATORY 59 0.S5. 2021, Section 475.18, 1is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.18 A. As provided in subsections A and B of
Section 475.8 of this title, the Board shall have the power to deny,
place on probation, suspend, revoke, place practice restrictions on,
or refuse to issue a certificate or license, or fine, reprimand,
issue orders, levy administrative fines or seek other penalties, if
a person or entity is found guilty of:

1. Any fraud or deceit in obtaining or attempting to obtain or
renew a eertificateof liecenswre license, or a certificate of
awtheorizatieon authority, or in taking the examinations administered
by the Board or its authorized representatives;

2. Any fraud, misrepresentation, gross negligence, gross
incompetence, misconduct or dishonest practice, in the practice of
engineering or dand surveying;

3. Conviction of or entry of a plea of guilty or nolo
contendere to a felony crime that substantially relates to the
practice of engineering or dawd surveying and poses a reasonable
threat to public safety; or conviction of or entry of a plea of
guilty or nolo contendere to & any crime, whether a felony,
misdemeanor, or otherwise, an essential element of which is
dishonesty or is a violation of the practice of engineering or tarnd
surveying;

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 59



4. Failure to comply with any of the provisions of Seetion
475+ et—seg—of this £itte act or any of the rules or regulations
pertaining thereto;

5. Disciplinary action, including voluntary surrender of a
professional engineer's or professional +amd surveyor's license in
order to avoid disciplinary action by another state, territory, the
District of Columbia, a foreign country, the United States
government, or any other governmental agency, if at least one of the
grounds for discipline is the same or substantially equivalent to
those contained in this section;

6. Failure, within thirty (30) days, to provide information
requested by the Board or its designated staff as a result of a
formal or informal investigation or complaint to the Board which
would indicate a violation of Seetien 475+ etseg—of this +itde
act;

7. Knowingly making false statements or signing false
statements, certificates or affidavits;

8. Aiding or assisting another person or entity in violating
any provision of Seetien475-+—-et—seg—oef this £itde act or the
rules or regulations pertaining thereto;

9. Violation of any terms imposed by the Board, or using a seal
or practicing professional engineering or professional 1=nd
surveying while the professional engineer's license or professional
+anrd surveyor's license is restricted, suspended, revoked,
nonrenewed, retired or inactive;

10. Signing, affixing the professional engineer's or
professional darmd surveyor's seal, or permitting the professional
engineer's or professional +amd surveyor's seal or signature to be
affixed to any specifications, reports, drawings, plans, design
information, construction documents, calculations, other documents,
or revisions thereof, which have not been prepared by, or under the
direct control and personal supervision of the professional engineer
or professional +ame surveyor in responsible charge;

11. Engaging in dishonorable, unethical or unprofessional
conduct of a character likely to deceive, defraud, harm or endanger

the public;

12. Providing false testimony or information to the BRoard;

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 60



13. Habitual intoxication or addiction to the use of alcohol or
to the illegal use of a controlled dangerous substance;

14. Performing engineering or surveying services outside any of
the licensee's areas of competence or an engineer's areas of
competence designated in the official Board records;

15. Violating the Oklahoma Minimum Standards for the Practice
of +and Surveying; and

16. Failing to obtain the required professional development
hours, as approved by the Board, Board staff or Continuing Education
Committee as required by an audit.

B. The Board shall prepare and adopt Rules of Professional
Conduct for Professional Engineers and Prefessienal—tand Surveyors
as provided for in Section 475.8 of this title;—whieh shall be made

~xz 21 S EIESNEEE LN B I IR~ Toarsz 19N~ A A ST a N N ] S N A e
&7 SV €V Ry S iy & I N S ) 1T VVJ__I_L_,_I_J.J.& (awy Ay \_,J__Y T T O T TIO T T (@R uLw (_/Lt/t/_L_LL/L/LJ.lLI i S N T T O CTTIOoUIT T
gapder—Seetion—475-1—-et——seg—of+this—+title. The Board may revise and
amend these Rules of Professional Conduct for Professional Engineers

and Prefessienal—Ttand Surveyors and shall notify each licensee, in
writing, of such revisions or amendments.

C. Principals of a firm who do not obtain a certificate or
authorization for the firm as required by Seetien475-t—et—seg—of
this £3+t+e act may be subject to disciplinary action.

D. As used in this section:

1. "Substantially relates" means the nature of criminal conduct
for which the person was convicted has a direct bearing on the
fitness or ability to perform one or more of the duties or
responsibilities necessarily related to the occupation; and

2. "Poses a reasonable threat" means the nature of criminal
conduct for which the person was convicted involved an act or threat
of harm against another or has a bearing on the fitness or ability
to serve the public or work with others in the occupation.

SECTION 28. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.19, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.19 A. Investigations and inquiries concerning the
professional licensed activities of licensees, or any person oOr

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 61



entity who may be in violation of the Board's statutes and rules,
may be initiated pursuant to the request of the Investigative
Committee or the public. In the event of such an investigation, all
licensees and subjects of complaints have a duty to provide all
information requested by the Board within thirty (30) days or a
later time if agreed to by the licensee and the Beard Investigative
Committee. All allegations shall be timely investigated by the
Investigative Committee of the Board and, unless determined
unfounded or trivial by—theBeard, or unless settled by mutual
accord, shall be filed as a formal notice of charges by the Board.

B. The time and place for the hearing shall be fixed by the
Board, and a copy of the charges, together with a notice of the time
and place of hearing, shall be personally served on or mailed to the
last-known address of such person, licensee, or entity at least
thirty (30) days before the date fixed for the hearing. At any
hearing, the accused shall have the right to appear in person or by
counsel, or both, to cross—-examine witnesses in their defense, and
to produce evidence and witnesses in their own defense. If the
accused fails or refuses to appear, the Board may proceed to hear
and determine the validity of the charges.

C. 1If, after such hearing, a majority of the quorum of the
empaneled Board vote in favor of sustaining any one or more of the
charges, the Board shall reprimand, fine for each count or separate
offense, levy administrative penalties pursuant to Section 475.20 of
this title, place on probation for a period of time and subject to
such conditions as the Board may specify, refuse to issue, restore,
renew, place practice restrictions on, suspend or revoke the

+fieate—of Jieensure license, or the firm's
horizatien authority.

D. Any named respondent aggrieved by any action of the Board in
levying a fine, denying, suspending, refusing to issue, restore or
renew, placing practice restrictions on, or revoking the eertifiecate
i g¥re license of the person, or its certificate of
£+en authority, may appeal therefrom to the proper court
under normal civil procedures.

T

13

O C<T
-~
T

E. The Board may, upon petition of an individual licensee or
firm holding a certificate of awtherizatien authority, reissue a
certifiecate—of ticensure license or authorization, provided that a
majority of the members of the Board vote in favor of such issuance.

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 62



SECTION 29. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.20, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.20 A. Criminal penalties:

Any person or entity who practices, or offers to practice,
engineering or +amd surveying in this state without being licensed
by the State Board of Licensure for Professional Engineers and tarnd
Surveyors in accordance with the provisions of Seetieon 4751t seq-
of this #3#%3Fe act, or any person or entity using or employing the
words "engineer" or "engineering" or "iamd surveyor" or "ilard
surveying" or any modification or derivative thereof in its name or
form of business or activity except as authorized in Seetien 4751+
et—seg—of this #i+tde act, or any person presenting or attempting to
use the eertificate of licensure license or the seal of another, or
any person who gives false or forged evidence of any kind to the
Board or to any member thereof in obtaining or attempting to obtain
a eertifieateof Jicensure license, or any person who falsely
impersonates any other licensee of like or different name, or any
person who attempts to use an expired, suspended, revoked, or
nonexistent eertifiecateof tiecensure license, or who practices or
offers to practice when not qualified, or their practice is
restricted, or any person who falsely claims to be registered or
licensed under Seetion—47+5+—+—-et—seg—of this £i+t+e act, or any
person who violates any of the provisions of Seetien 4751 ——et—see-
of this £3#%t3Fe act, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a
fine of not less than Two Hundred Fifty Dollars ($250.00), nor more
than Two Thousand Dollars ($2,000.00).

B. Administrative penalties:

1. Any person or entity who has been determined by the Board to
have violated any provision of Seetien 4751 —+et—seg—of this £itle
act, or any rule, regulation or order issued pursuant to such
provisions, may be liable for an administrative penalty of not less
than Pwe—Hundred Fifty Poltars 525006 Five Hundred Dollars
($500.00) nor more than FenrFheousandbolttars—{516+-60660-606)> Twenty
Thousand Dollars ($20,000.00) for each separate violation.

2. The amount of the penalty shall be assessed by the Board
pursuant to the provisions of paragraph 1 of this subsection, after
notice and hearing. In determining the amount of the penalty, the
Board shall include, but not be limited to, consideration of the
nature, circumstances and gravity of the violation, and with respect
to the person or entity found to have committed the violation, the

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 63



degree of culpability, the effect on ability of the person or entity
to continue to do business, and any show of good faith in attempting
to achieve compliance with the provisions of Seetien4+5-+ et —seg-
of this #3#t3Fe act. All monies collected from administrative
penalties shall be deposited with the State Treasurer and placed in
the "Professional Engineers and Eamd Surveyors Fund".

3. Any eertificateof licensure license or certificate of
awtheorization authority holder may request to surrender the
certifiecateof Jlicensure license or certificate of awvtherizatien

authority in lieu of an administrative action, but shall be
permanently barred from obtaining a reissuance of the eertifieate
Iieensure license or certificate of awtherizatiern authority. All
such requests shall be presented to the Board for approval.

£
-

A

C. Legal Counsel:

The Attorney General of this state or an assistant shall act as
legal advisor to the Board and render such legal assistance as may
be necessary in carrying out the provisions of Seetieon4F5-t—-et—seg-
of this £3#%3Fe act. The Board may employ counsel whose compensation
and expenses shall be paid from Board funds for necessary legal
assistance to aid in the enforcement of and carrying out the
provisions of Seetien—4/o+—+—et——seg—of this &itde act.

SECTION 30. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.21, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.21 A. The practice of or offer to practice
engineering or damd surveying by firms authorized under Seetien
475+t —-et—seg—of this £3+tde act, or by more than one person acting
individually through a firm, is permitted provided:

1. The persen{s) managing agent(s) in responsible charge of
such practice and all personnel who act in behalf of the firm in
professional engineering and +amd surveying matters in this state
are licensed under Seetieon—475+1—et——seg—of this £itde act; and

2. The firm has been issued a certificate of auvtherization
authority by the Board.

B. An engineering or damd surveying firm requiring a
certificate of awtherizatien authority shall file with the Board an
application, using a form provided by the Board, and provide all the
information required by the Board. The Board shall prescribe a form

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 64



to be filed with the renewal fee and which shall be updated within
thirty (30) days of the time any information contained on the form
is changed or differs for any reason. If, in the Board's judgment,
the information contained on the form warrants such action, the
Board shall issue a certificate of auwtherizatiern authority for the
firm to practice engineering and/or +ard surveying.

No such firm shall be relieved of responsibility for the conduct
or acts of its agents, employees, officers or partners by reason of
its compliance with the provisions of this section. ©No individual
practicing engineering or I=md surveying, pursuant to the provisions
of Seetion4+5-—t-et—seg—of this &it+e act, shall be relieved of
responsibility for engineering or damd surveying services performed
by reason of employment or other relationship with a firm holding a
certificate of awtherizatien authority.

C. The Secretary of State shall not issue a certificate of
incorporation to an applicant, approve for filing articles of
organization for a limited liability company, approve for filing a
certificate of limited partnership or accept a registration as a
foreign firm to a firm which includes in the firm's name or among
the objectives for which it is established any of the words
"Engineer", "Engineering", "Surveyor", "Ekamd Surveying" or any
modification or derivation thereof unless the Beardis)—efTicensure
Board for these professions has issued for the applicant a
certificate of awtherizatien authority or a letter indicating the
eligibility of such applicant to receive such a certificate. The
firm applying shall supply such certificate or letter from the Board
with its application for incorporation or registration.

D. The Secretary of State shall decline to register any trade
name or service mark which includes such words, as set forth in
subsection C of this section, or modifications or derivatives
thereof in its firm name or logotype except those firms holding
certificates of awtherizatiern authority issued under the provisions
of this section.

E. The certificate of autherizatien authority shall be renewed
as hereinbefore provided in Section 475.16 of this title.

F. Effeetive Nevember 1+—203+7—att—Ffirms Firms applying for a
certificate of awtherizatien authority shall designate a managing

agent.

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 65



Managing agent. A firm offering either engineering or surveying
services shall designate an engineer or surveyor, respectively, to
be the managing agent for the firm. A firm offering both
engineering and +awmd surveying services must have a licensed
professional engineer and licensed professional tawd surveyor listed
as managing agent. A licensee may not be designated as a managing
agent for more than one firm without prior Board approval. The
managing agent must hold a position of recognized authority within
the firm to be designated as the managing agent. In the case of a
corporation, a licensee must be an officer, principal, director or
shareholder of the firm to be designated as the managing agent. In
the case of a limited liability company or limited liability
partnership, the licensee must be a member of the firm to be
designated as the managing agent. In the case of a limited
partnership, the licensee must be a general partner of the firm to
be designated as the managing agent. In the case of a partnership,
the licensee must be an owner of the firm to be designated as the
managing agent. If the ownership is less than fifty percent (50%)
ownership, an explanation must be included as to the extent of
authority this partner holds regarding engineering or surveying
decisions, respectively, as it pertains to paragraphs 1 through 3 of
this subsection. A licensee who is a full-time employee of a firm
and holds a position of recognized authority within the firm but
does not hold one of the above-stated titles may request Board
approval to be named the managing agent by submitting a letter to
the Board on firm letterhead signed by a person within the firm
holding one of the above-stated titles, describing the special
circumstances surrounding the requested exception and the extent of
authority this employee holds regarding engineering or surveying
decisions, respectively, as it pertains to paragraphs 1 through 3 of
this subsection. A licensee who is self-employed, an independent
contractor or who renders consulting engineering or surveying

services to, or for, a firm shall not be designated as a managing
agent Firms—holcding—= ccrtlflcatc of—authorizationwith—this Board
Bxra v 1+ Nosrzembaoar 1 2017 mitat manT 3~ EICE I ) SN ) AN BT ST SN L P I B 2
tJ_L_LU_L Ay TN OV T - L7 A S T O T LA _Lll \,Ulllt/_l__Lull\,C W LT CTTT CIT 1O _tJJ_UV_LO_LV.ll
of—daw—byv November—+—26495 The managing agent's responsibilities
include:

1. Renewal of the firm's certificate of auvtherizatiern authority
and notification to the Board of any change in managing agent or
firm's contact information;

2. Overall administrative supervision of the firm's licensed

and subordinate personnel performing engineering or surveying work
in Oklahoma; and

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 66



3. Institution and adherence of policies of the firm that are
in accordance with Seetten475-1—et—seg—of this £3+&de act, Section
3-116 et seg. of Title 65 of the Oklahoma Statutes and the rules of
the Board.

G. Out-of-state firms authorized to offer or perform
professional engineering or professional damd surveying services in
Oklahoma may have one or more branch offices located in Oklahoma
only if the firm has a professional engineer or professional larnd
surveyor, respectively, designated as the managing agent in
Oklahoma. The professional engineer or professional damd surveyor
designated for this purpose shall be required to spend a majority of
normal business hours at one or more branch offices located in
Oklahoma and be duly licensed as a professional engineer or
professional damd surveyor, respectively, in this state. The
professional engineer or professional damd surveyor designated
managing agent shall be responsible for:

1. Maintaining and renewal of the firm's certificate of
agtherizatieon authority and notification to the Board of any change
in managing agent or firm's contact information;

2. Overall administrative supervision of the firm's licensed
and subordinate personnel who provide the engineering work in this
state; and

3. The institution of and adherence to policies of the firm
that shall be in accordance with Seetien4+5-+—-et—seg—of this £itde
act, Section 3-116 et seq. of Title 65 of the Oklahoma Statutes and
the rules promulgated by the Board.

SECTION 31. AMENDATORY 59 0.5. 2021, Section 475.22, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.22 Seetion 4751+ —-et—seg—ofEthis—+titte This act
shall not be construed to prevent:

1. Other professions. The practice of any other legally
recognized profession;

2. Temporary license:

a. Professional engineer. The practice or offer to
practice engineering by a person not a resident of or

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 67



having no established place of business in this state
is allowed; provided, such person is legally qualified
by licensure to practice engineering, as defined in
Section 475.2 of this title, in the applicant's
resident state or jurisdiction and who has made
application for licensure to #his the Board. Such
person shall make application for temporary dieense
licensure to the Board, in a manner prescribed by the
Board. After payment of a temporary license fee, a
written temporary license may be granted to perform a
particular job for a definite period of time, to
expire at the earliest issuance of a professional
engineering license by #his the Board. Further;——such

holl : ; S nciolimed

Sa1ra oA A A Ty o DA A £ 1 -1canarre ESWANEVS nerln Y3
Jorr SO C ooy o oo O T CChisurC— o g CTr 1197
3:&1}5{ STEV 33 ﬂ:iig SE=mNS == S}iﬂ: ceetur S5 EH}E{ S}iaii ot }iac S

b PN T T N B ada ~+ o Y £ o 1 -~r<z
oeeh—CoRvVIetea—= T T 0

3 ull_Y JUJ__I_Q\_A._I_\_/L_,_I_U 4 | S = a4

Further, such person shall submit a complete permanent
professional engineer application to the Board within
thirty (30) days of the date of issuance of the
temporary license, with all required properly
completed forms and fees. Failure to submit a
permanent professional engineer application for Board
consideration within the designated thirty-day time
period may be considered a violation of Seetien—4+5-%
et—seg+—of this #3tde act and Board rules. No right
to practice engineering shall accrue to such applicant
by reason of a temporary license for any works not set
forth in the license, and

b. Professional +amd surveyor. The practice of tand
surveying under a temporary permit by a person
licensed as a professional dame surveyor in another
state is not considered to be in the best interest of
the public and therefore shall not be granted unless
the person is applying pursuant to the Military
Service Occupation, Education and Credentialing Act;

3. Employees and subordinates. The work of an employee or a
subordinate of a person holding a eertifiecate of Jicensure license
under Seetieon47/5+t—et——seg—of this &3&d+e act, or an employee of a
person practicing lawfully under paragraph 2 of this section is
allowed; provided, such work does not include final engineering or
+and surveying designs or decisions and is done under the direct
supervision of and verified by a person holding a eertifiecate—-of

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 68



tieensure license under Seetion 4453+ et——seg—of this £itde act or a
person practicing lawfully under paragraph 2 of this section;

4. Material takeoff. Providing a list of material derived from
measuring and interpreting a set of blueprints or plans, otherwise
known as a "material takeoff" or advising a person on such a
"material takeoff" shall not constitute the practice of engineering;
and

5. A person shall not be construed to practice or offer to
practice Z+emd surveying, within the meaning and intent of Seetien
475+t —-et—seg—of this £3+t3+e act, who merely acts as an agent of a
purchaser of }arnd surveying services. Agents of a purchaser of tand
surveying services include, but are not limited to, real estate
agents and brokers, title companies, attorneys providing title
examination services, and persons who or firms that coordinate the
acquisition and use of +amd surveying services. The coordination of
+ard surveying services includes, but is not limited to, sales and
marketing of services, discussion of requirements of lamd surveys,
contracting to furnish dand surveys, review of }amd surveys, the
requesting of revisions of ‘amd surveys, and making any and all
modifications to surveys with the written consent of the
professional dand surveyor, and furnishing final revised copies to
the professional damd surveyor showing all revisions, the
distribution of d+@md surveys and receiving payment for such
services. These actions do not constitute the practice of tand

surveying, and do not violate any part of Seetieons4+5-1—through
475-22a—ef this £+t+e act or the bylaws and rules of the Board.

SECTION 32. AMENDATORY 59 0.S. 2021, Section 475.22a, is
amended to read as follows:

Section 475.22a It shall be unlawful for the registrar of deeds
or the county clerk of any county or proper public authority to file
any map, plat, survey or other documents within the definition of
+and surveying which do not have impressed thereon and affixed
thereto the personal signature and seal of a professional dand
surveyor by whom or under whose direct supervision the map, plat,
survey or other documents were prepared.

SECTION 33. REPEALER 59 0.S. 2021, Section 46.11, is
hereby repealed.

SECTION 34. This act shall become effective November 1, 2024.

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 69



Passed the House of Representatives the 6th day of March, 2024.

Presiding Officer of the House
of Representatives

Passed the Senate the 23rd day of April, 2024.

Presiding Officer of the Senate

OFFICE OF THE GOVERNOR

Received by the Office of the Governor this

day of , 20 , at o'clock M.

By:

Approved by the Governor of the State of Oklahoma this

day of , 20 , at o'clock M.

Governor of the State of Oklahoma

OFFICE OF THE SECRETARY OF STATE

Received by the Office of the Secretary of State this

day of , 20 , at o'clock M.

By:

ENR. H. B. NO. 3253 Page 70



